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From: Donna Phillips  
Sent: Friday, January 7, 2022 11:21 AM 
To: Greg Oropeza <greg@oropezastonescardenas.com> 
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] RE: [EXTERNAL] BPAS 
 
The contribution would need to be made if approved for allocation in order to receive the award letter.    
 
From: Greg Oropeza <greg@oropezastonescardenas.com>  
Sent: Friday, January 7, 2022 11:16 AM 
To: Donna Phillips <donna.phillips@cityofkeywest-fl.gov> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: [EXTERNAL] BPAS 
 

Do we need to do that now or is that done after the award? 

 

 

 

Gregory S. Oropeza, Esq. 
 

 
 

221 Simonton Street 

Key West, Florida 33040 

Tel: 305.294.0252 

Fax: 305.402.2802 

Oropezastonescardenas.com 

 
Tax Advice Disclosure: To ensure compliance with requirements imposed by the IRS under Circular 230, we inform you that any U.S. 

federal tax advice contained in this communication (including any attachments), unless otherwise specifically stated, was not intended 

or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purpose of (1) avoiding penalties under the Internal Revenue Code or (2) promoting, 

marketing or recommending to another party any matters addressed herein. 

  

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information.  It is intended only for the use 

of the person(s) named above. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, dissemination, 

distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender 

by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message.  

  

Please note: This law firm may be deemed a "debt collector" under the Fair Debt Collection Practices Act. Any and all information 

obtained during and from communications may be used for the purpose of collecting debt. 

 
From: Donna Phillips <donna.phillips@cityofkeywest-fl.gov>  
Sent: Friday, January 7, 2022 11:06 AM 
To: Greg Oropeza <greg@oropezastonescardenas.com> 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open 
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  

mailto:greg@oropezastonescardenas.com
mailto:donna.phillips@cityofkeywest-fl.gov
https://linkprotect.cudasvc.com/url?a=https%3a%2f%2fOropezastonescardenas.com&c=E,1,n41UpRTbQhx0GyweHZyg5HHDmWfLp0ZOoX7YomQnV7etfxiXGmVrFAQJEbFsNn7WFFVeu8xyul_MmQp3xpprx6AdebTVChJ4ogAzJy4tr-_gx80SNWG6NTSh&typo=1&ancr_add=1
mailto:donna.phillips@cityofkeywest-fl.gov
mailto:greg@oropezastonescardenas.com


Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] BPAS 
Importance: High 
 
Hi Greg –  
 
We do not have an authorization form.  This information is simply taken over the phone.  Note that 
there is a 2.25% administrative fee for credit card usage. 
 
All the best, 
 
 

Donna Phillips 
Planning Project Coordinator 
City of Key West 
Josephine Parker City Hall 
1300 White Street 

(305) 809-3724 I donna.phillips@cityofkeywest-fl.gov 

Please consider the environment before printing this email. 

 
 
 
 
 
From: Greg Oropeza <greg@oropezastonescardenas.com>  
Sent: Friday, January 7, 2022 10:06 AM 
To: Donna Phillips <donna.phillips@cityofkeywest-fl.gov> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] BPAS 
 

Hi Donna, 

 

Do you have a form for the credit card authorization for the $2,500 contribution. This would be 

for 1307 Whitehead. 

 

Thanks, Greg 

 

 

 

Gregory S. Oropeza, Esq. 
 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open 
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  

mailto:donna.phillips@cityofkeywest-fl.gov
mailto:greg@oropezastonescardenas.com
mailto:donna.phillips@cityofkeywest-fl.gov


 
 

221 Simonton Street 

Key West, Florida 33040 

Tel: 305.294.0252 

Fax: 305.402.2802 

Oropezastonescardenas.com 

 
Tax Advice Disclosure: To ensure compliance with requirements imposed by the IRS under Circular 230, we inform you that any U.S. 

federal tax advice contained in this communication (including any attachments), unless otherwise specifically stated, was not intended 

or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purpose of (1) avoiding penalties under the Internal Revenue Code or (2) promoting, 

marketing or recommending to another party any matters addressed herein. 

  

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information.  It is intended only for the use 

of the person(s) named above. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, dissemination, 

distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender 

by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message.  

  

Please note: This law firm may be deemed a "debt collector" under the Fair Debt Collection Practices Act. Any and all information 

obtained during and from communications may be used for the purpose of collecting debt. 

 
 

https://linkprotect.cudasvc.com/url?a=https%3a%2f%2fOropezastonescardenas.com&c=E,1,AJSecU5bfeg0RWesTEP0gv0Zu8aE5_BQCGyH2olznUFccORBficrysauV3rMb00v6dWa3BflE5Vr96_Ml8xtR3Kt2z4WBjihbR8q-nNwikkiJSLzfv4,&typo=1&ancr_add=1
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