
STAFF REPORT 
 
DATE:  June 30, 2015       
 
RE: 1016 Duval Street/Julia St ROW 
        (permit application # T15-7483) 
 
FROM:   Karen DeMaria, City of Key West Urban Forestry Manager  
 
 
An application was received for the removal of (1) Mahogany tree.  
 
Several site inspections have been done in 2014 and 2015. 
 
The tree is a City tree whose root system is impacting private property.  
The property owner would like the tree removed in order to prevent 
additional damage to the foundation of the house. 
 
The house was originally built in 1928.  I photo dated 1965 shows a young 
tree in the area.  
 
In August 2014, a permit was issued to root prune the tree (see attached 
copy of application with associated background information, T14-6858). 
 
In November 2014, the property owner requested the tree be removed.  
The City requested additional information from the property owner including 
possibly raising the foundation of the house and additional root pruning of 
the tree.  In June 2014, additional information was received and the City 
Manager signed the application for removal of the tree to be submitted to 
the Tree Commission.   
 
A detailed arborist report of the tree with photos from Cynthia Domenech-
Coogle (Cynthia’s Blue Palms) has been submitted and is attached to the 
file. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 Tree Species: Mahogany (Swietenia mahagoni)    
 

 
 
Photo taken April 2014 



 
 
Photo taken prior to root prune. 

 
 
          

Diameter: 35”  
Location: 40% (large visible tree, roots are impacting foundation of house)   
Species:  100% (on protected tree list)  
Condition: 60% (fair)  
Total Average Value = 66%   
Value x Diameter = 23 replacement caliper inches 
 







 

 

Application 
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Karen DeMaria

From: Cara A. Higgins <cara@hwhkeywest.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 09, 2015 5:02 PM
To: Karen DeMaria
Cc: Jo Bennett; Ronald Ramsingh
Subject: FW: Williams-1016 Duval-Mahogany
Attachments: Attachment-1.jpeg; ATT00001.txt

Hi‐ 
 
Please include this invoice from Ken King for $750 paid by Lori Williams.   
 
Thanks! 
Cara 
 
 
608 Whitehead Street 
Key West, Florida 33040 
(305) 294‐4585 (Telephone) 
(305) 294‐7822 (Facsimile) 
www.hwhkeywest.com 
 
‐‐‐‐‐Original Message‐‐‐‐‐ 
From: Lori Williams [mailto:tawlaw@optonline.net]  
Sent: Thursday, July 09, 2015 9:47 AM 
To: Cara A. Higgins 
Subject: Williams‐1016 Duval‐Mahogany 
 
 
Invoice paid . 
 
 
This e‐mail, as well as any attachments to same, is covered by the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 USC 
Section 2510‐2521 and is legally privileged under federal and state law, including but not limited to laws applicable to 
the attorney/client‐privilege and other private matters.  The information contained in this e‐mail message is attorney 
privileged and confidential information intended only for use of the individual or entity named above.  If the reader of 
this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copy of this 
communication is strictly prohibited.  If you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
telephone.  The receipt by anyone other than the designated recipient does not waive the attorney/client privilege, nor 
will it constitute a waiver of the work‐product doctrine.  THANK YOU. 
 
CIRCULAR 230 DISCLAIMER: The IRS requires that written advice (including emails) regarding one or more Federal 
(United States) tax issues to meet certain standards. Those standards include a detailed and careful analysis of the facts 
and applicable law which may be time consuming and costly. We have not made and have not been asked to make that 
type of analysis in connection with any advice given in this email. As a result, we are required to advise you that any 
Federal tax advice rendered in this email is not intended or written to be used and cannot be used for the purpose of 
avoiding penalties that may be imposed by the IRS. 






