Attachment D.1: Price Sheet - Police Vehicles
Bt Identified Aft Options'*
el |l Atternate Basevehicle | (CEM | Aftermackel | oy s
1 ‘ Fust o Price Options | Oolien: S08¢Iall | yoq.yma in | Adustabis | Yeot!Rain | YentiRein |PushBumosc| Sttamatiog. cxsmsory Outeta
. Brand® | Mumber R g o b 7 | Discount | Palpl-EMP. 10 stiskdn, Taos-| Stisan inchea Lemp  (Adlien Done "o g i)
Capable (SHARI00) " | yyy® | Price (BB | Doy (79 | absocbers, [Mounted.Pricel Om.Prce | Hioh.Price |, SASTUS lpienars prig| MEDLPRS | oy price
b Price (Sews | (Msw | (Stesm | (e T [ [F7)
1 2016 Chevrolet Impala Limited Polics 4dr Sdn Police (1WS18, 9C1) s Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck | $  18,896.00 10% ($1,500.00) 90120 No Bid NoBid |§ 12600 | §  526.00 | § 2600 % 10600 5  106.00| § 56.00
Chavrolet
z 2016 Chevrolet Caprice Police Patrol Vehicle 4dr Sdn Police (1EW18, 9C1) ] Garber Chevrolst Pontiac GMC Truck |$  24748.00 20% 1$500.00) 180270 No Bid MoBid|$ 12600 | § 52600 (S 21600 | $ 10600 5 10600 § 56.00
3 2016 Dodge Charger ddr Sdn Police RWD (LDDE48) o El L3 s 20,587.00 0% $145.00 80120 NoBid | § 11800 | § 109.00 | § 49600 | § 15800 | $ 8500 § 89.00| § 85.00
MARKED Dotios
4 2018 Dodge Charger ddr Sdn Police AWD (LDEE48) s 22,475.00 0% $145.00 80-120 MNoBid | § 11900 | § 109.00 | § 496.00 | § 159.00 | § 8500 § 89.00 | § 65.00
5 2016 Ford Sedan Police Interceplor ddr Sdn FWD (P2L, 5004) 8 s 22,442.00 0% {51,700.00) 80-120 No Bid No Bid | § 12600 | $ 58600 | § 21800 | § 10600 | § 10600 | § 56.00
Ford
* 6 2016 Fard Sedan Police Interceplor 4dr Sdn AWD (P2M, 500A) 5 s 23,500.00 5% (5300.00) 120 NoBid | $ 22500 | § 22500 | § 43500 | § 19500 | § 895,00 MNoBid | § 125.00
Chavrolet 2016 Chewvrolet Impala Limited Police 4dr Sdn Police (1WS19, 9C3) s $ 18,896.00 10% NA 80120 No Bid NoBid | $ 12600 | § 52600 | § 21600 | $ 10600 | $ 10600 § 56.00
UNMARKED L] 2016 Dodge Charger ddr Sdn Police RWD (LDDE48, AEB) ] Garbar Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc. s 21,696.00 % WA 80-120 No Bid MoBid | § 12600 | $ 506,00 | § 216.00 No Bid NoBid| § 56.00
Dodge
9 2016 Dodge Charger 4dr Sdn Police AWD (LDEE48, AEB) $ 24,276.00 % NA 90120 No Bid NoBid | § 12600 | § 536.00 | § 216.00 No Bid NoBid | § 56.00
Chevrolet 10 2046 Chevrolet Tahos Police ZWD 4dr (CCA5706, PPV, 9C1) s Garber Chavrolot Pontiac GMC Truck |$ 3342600 0% $600.00 90-120 MoBid|$ 12600 |S 526005 21600 | $ 10500 8 106.00| § 56.00
Dodge 1" 2016 Dodge Durango 2WD 4dr Spacial Service [WDDE?5) C 1 C. s 24,656.00 60% ($500.00) 90120 NoBid|$ 126.00 | $ 59600 | § 216,00 No Bid NoBid | § 58.00
\TILITY Vs, £ 28D Lo
12 |2016 Ford Expedition 2WD ddr XL SSV (U1F, 1024) Don Rejd Ford $ 2838300 15% ($400.00) 120 $ 22500|8 22500|% 58500(% 19500 | § 18500 $ @500 S 125.00
Ford
13 |2018 Ford Expedition EL 2ZWD 4dr XL SSV (K1F, 102A) Don Reid Ford $ 31,669.00 14% ($400.00) 120 $ 22500|% 22500|% 595008 19500 | § 19500 $  9500| § 125.00
Chavrolet 14 (2016 Chevrolet Tahos Special Service Veh 4WD (CK15706, 5W4) s Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck |$  35567.00 70% ($500.00) 80-120 NoBid [$ 12600 (8§ 52500(% 21600 [ § 10600 3 106.00| § 56.00
Dodge 15 2016 Dodge Durango AWD 4dr Special Service (WDEETS) Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc, s 25,976.00 60% ($500,00) 80-120 NoBid {$ 12600($ 59600 |$ 216.00 No Bid NoBld | § 56.00
16 2018 Ford Expedition 4WD 4dr XL 88V (U1G, 1024) Don Reid Ford $ 30,992.00 15% ($400.00} 120 $ 22500 | $ 22500 | § 59500 | § 19500 | § 19500 | $ 9500 | § 125.00
Sub-Group D: POLICE/SPECIAL SERVICE SPORT |
MTILITY VEHICLE, SWD INCLUDING ALL WHEEL | NA
DRIVE ("AWD™)]
17 |2016 Ford Expedition EL 4WD 4dr XL {K1G, 102A) Don Reld Ford $ 399700 15% ($400.00) 120 $ 22500 |$ 22500|% 58500 (% 19500 | §  19500| S 9500 § 125.00
Ford
Garber Ford Inc, § 2559600 5% $400.00 90120 NoBid |$ 12600 §  596.00 | $ 21600 | § 10600 | 5 10600 | § 56.00
18 2016 Ford Utility Police Interceptor AWD 4dr (KBA, 5004) 5
Deon Reld Ford s 25,984.00 % {$300.00) 120 § 22500 % 225005 68500 § 19500 | 5 19500 No Bid | § 1,259.00

Page tof 1



