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Description

o L RRT SN PHRRFC Pracmge gm0 | feaneA—ad 4800, a0

2 ‘CM |MITIGATION FEE COMMERCIAL | 100.00 100.00

Z | cé | ZPPLICATION FEE BLDG NEW 59.00 BEI
2 DAL |DCA SURCHARGE: FS553.721 1384.50 1386.30

" A | EF |EDUCATION FEE SR S TR e S e
a FM |FIRE MARSHALL REVIEW FEE : 2450.00 2450.00
B PF |PERMIT FEES N 82150.00 ~ BBI50.00

n PR |PLAN REVIEW FEE 4800.00 T 4600.00

I RA |DBPR SURCHARGE: F3546B8.631 1385.50 13%86.50
a2 SF |SEWER FLOW CHARGE : 12455.00 12458.00

%z | 50 |S0LID WASTE IMEACT 10713.85 10713.88

2 S |SEWER IMPACT FEE 4823.20 4683.20

Z TR |TRAFFIC IMPACT FEES ~ 22200.16 22200.16

: " |Totals ; 212800.2 212750.24
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From: Ron Wampler
Sent: Wednesday, September 07, 2016 10:31 AM
To: Carolyn Walker <cwalker@cityofkeywest-fl.gov>; Greg Veliz <gveliz@cityofkeywest-fl.gov>

148,800



Cc: Mark Finigan <mfinigan@cityofkeywest-fl.gov>
Subject: FW: FKSPCA breakdown of contract costs

Upon more thought the $4.9M is accurate for the building permit price and the AIPP would be $64K based upon the
total construction contract price of $6.4M...The impact fees are unchanged.

Ron

From: Ron Wampler

Sent: Wednesday, September 07, 2016 10:25 AM

To: Carolyn Walker (cwalker@cityofkeywest-fl.gov) <cwalker @cityofkeywest-fl.gov>
Cc: Greg Veliz (gveliz@cityofkeywest-fl.gov) <gveliz@cityofkeywest-fl.gov>

Subject: FW: FKSPCA breakdown of contract costs

From the spreadsheet it appears that the initial application contract price of $4.9M was correct. Please revise the permit
price and AIPP to reflect this number.

From: Sue Turner [mailto:sue turner@bellsouth.net]

Sent: Wednesday, September 07, 2016 8:32 AM

To: Ron Wampler <rwampler@cityofkeywest-fl.gov>; Greg Veliz <gveliz@cityofkeywest-fl.gov>
Subject: RE: FKSPCA breakdown of contract costs

My apologies. Here itis.
Sue Turner
FKSPCA

From: Ron Wampler [mailto:rwampler@cityofkeywest-fl.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, September 07, 2016 8:29 AM

To: Sue Turner; Greg Veliz

Subject: RE: FKSPCA breakdown of contract costs

Not attached?

From: Sue Turner [mailto:sue turner@bellsouth.net]

Sent: Tuesday, September 06, 2016 11:35 PM

To: Greg Veliz <gveliz@cityofkeywest-fl.gov>; Ron Wampler <rwampler@cityofkeywest-fl.gov>
Subject: FKSPCA breakdown of contract costs

Greg & Ron,
Attached is the estimated contract cost breakdown as they were sent to us by our construction project manager.

Let me know if you need more information.
Sue



