
Posted 8/7/15 at 12:15 pm

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

BID ON  PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

CONTRACT PERIOD: SEPTEMBER 9, 2015 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 8, 2018

BOARD APPROVED ON SEPTEMBER 8, 2015
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: FL. ITEM 1: INSTALLATION Sub

PREF. Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications

R# Recreation 3% Yes 35% Playspace Services, Inc Yes

FL Brevard Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC * Playcraft Systems 3%

BCI Burke 3%

Ultra Play Early Childhood 3%

FL Sarasota Apollo Sunguard Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

Play and Park Structures 39 10% Yes
39% Bliss Products and Services

GA Bliss Products and Services Inc Ultra Play 8% 39% Interstate Inc No

Sports Play 10%

Elephant Play 5%

Dynamo 5%

Child Works 5%

Cemrock 5%

Snug Play 5%

Store.blissproducts.com 5%

Pieceton Rubber/Dynacushion 5%

Big Toys 5%

Everlast Climbing 5%

Action Play Systems 5%

Playmore Designs 5%

Playland Vol 32 5% Yes 35%

FL Hillsborough Florida Playstructures and Water Features Inc * Kidstate Vol 21 5%

Playmart Playgrounds 5%

Playmart Nature of Play 5%

FL Citrus Gulf Coast Sports LLC * No Bid No Bid

30% Presision Playground Holding Yes

WA Kompan Inc Kompan USD 2015 9% The Playground Guys

BCI Burke Current 7% Yes 33%

FL Miami-Dade Leadex Corperation * GreenField current 0% Yes 60% (11)

Miracle 2015 8% (14) Yes 27%

FL Manatee Miller Recreation Equipment & Design * 12% (14)

15% (14)

18% (14)

20% (14)

10% (15)

UPC Parks 2013 5% (16)

Action Playstystems online 5% (16)

Elephan & Play 5% (16)

ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: FL. ITEM 1: INSTALLATION Sub

PREF. Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications

Miracle/Miracle Recreation 

Equipment Co
2015

8% (14)
Yes

27%

MO Miracle Recreation Equipment Company 12% (14)

15% (14)

18% (14)

20% (14)

10% (15)

25% JohnFitzgerald Inc Yes

TN Playcore Wisconsin DBA GameTime Inc Gametime 2015 12%

Playworld 2015 5% Yes 30%

FL Lee Playmore West Inc * Action Play Systems 2015 5%

Child Forms 2015 5%

Sports Play 2015.00 5%

GA PPLPT Farmington Inc/ Playworx Playsets LLC Little Tikes Commercial 37 15% Yes 27%

Jambette 2014/15 5% Yes 30% Perks Property Services Yes

FL Pinellas Project Innovations LLC * Playtopia Playground Design Guide 5%

Henderson
Providing Playground 

Fun
5%

FL Martin RCP Shelters Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

FL Sarasota Recycled Plastic Factory LLC * No Bid No Bid No Bid

Landscape Structures 3% 40% Al Bosgraaf & Sons Yes

FL
Seminole 

Rep Services Inc * Landscape Structures Playsense 2%

FL Saint Johns Shade America Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

FL Marion Shade Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ultra Play UPO313 5% (23) (25) No

FL Brevard Southern Park and Play Systems * Sports Play 2014 5%

Child Works Volume 2 5%

Kidstuff Playsystems 1005 5

Childforms Volume 12 5%

Henderson Recreation & 

Components
2015 7% (31) Yes 28% (30)

Kennico Inc
Yes (32)

FL Collier Swartz Associates Inc * Eco Play Safeplay Systems 2015 7% (31)

Ultra Play 2015 6% (31)

Childforms 2015 6% (31)

Sports Play 2015 6% (31)

Action Play Systems 2015.00 10% (31)

ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 2: INSTALLATION

Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications

Bison Sports Equipment 10% Yes 35% Playspace Services, Inc Yes

FL Brevard Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC * The Park Catlaog by Highlands 3%

Kay Park 3%

Free Notes Harmony Park 3%

Webcoat 3%

Ultra Site/Fitness 3%

FL Sarasota Apollo Sunguard Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ultra Site 2015 5% No (7) 39% Interstate Inc No (7)

GA Bliss Products and Services Inc BRP 5%
Bliss Products and Services

Kings River Castings 5% Fun Builders

Leisure Craft 5% Sandee Sod

Webcoat 5% Main Gates Construction

Jay Hawk 2015 8% Tropical Recreation

Athletic Connection 5%
Choppers Construction Corp

Jay Pro 5%

Store.blissproducts.com 5%

Coloado Time Systems 5%

Spectrum Aquatics 5%

Waterworks International 5%

Murdock/ Super Secur 

Fountains
5%

Promats 5%

Action Fit 5%

GT Grandstands 5%

NRS Bleachers 5%

Dero Bike Racks 5%

Superior  Recreational Products 26th Edition 5% Yes
40%

FL Hillsborough Florida Playstructures and Water Features Inc *
Florida Playstructures Quick 

Ship
5%

Yes 10%

FL Citrus Gulf Coast Sports LLC * Southeastern GCS 2015 15%

60% Presision Playground Holding Yes

WA Kompan Inc Kompan USD 2015 5% The Playground Guys

FL Miami-Dade Leadex Corperation * No Bid No Bid No Bid

ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 2: INSTALLATION

Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications

Douglas 5% (16) Yes 27%

Bison 2014-15 5% (16)

FL Manatee Miller Recreation Equipment & Design * Kay park 5% (16)

Recycled Design 10.1 5% (16)

WebCoat (SII) 25th 5% (16)

Foresite Designs 5% (16)

Ultra Site 5% (16)

Murdock 5% (16)

Sportable Scoreboards 5% (16)

Miracle Recreation Equipment 

Co
2015

8% (14)
Yes

27%

MO Miracle Recreation Equipment Company 12% (14)

15% (14)

18% (14)

20% (14)

10% (15)

25% JohnFitzgerald Inc Yes

TN Playcore Wisconsin DBA GameTime Inc Ultra Site 2015 10%

Gared 2015 5% Yes 30%

FL Lee Playmore West Inc * WebCoat /Superior 2015 5%

Kay Park 2015 5%

Thomas Steele 2015 5%

Mad Rax 2015 5%

Paris 2015 5%

Frog Furnishings/Jayhawk 2015 5%

GA PPLPT Farmington Inc/ Playworx Playsets LLC Little Tikes Commercial 37 8% Yes 28%

FL Pinellas Project Innovations LLC * Frog Furnishings 2015 3% Yes 30% Perks Property Services Yes

FL Martin RCP Shelters Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

FL Sarasota Recycled Plastic Factory LLC * Recycledd Plastic Factory LLC 07/01/14 32% No (21)

FL Seminole Rep Services Inc * Dumor Site Furnishings 3% 35% Al Bosgraaf & Sons No

Johnny Pitts Construction

FL Saint Johns Shade America Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

FL Marion Shade Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 2: INSTALLATION

Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications

Pilot Rock Catalog #240 5% No (25) (26)

FL Brevard Southern Park and Play Systems * Ultra Site
2012 Park Furnishings & 

Site Amenities
5%

Sports Play 2014 5%

Webcoat
25th Edition Site 

Amenties
5%

Patterson-Williams 0 5%

Kirby Built 7/2015 5%

Polly p Products 2014.00 5%

Blue Valley Industries 2015 6% (31) No (33) 35% (30) Kennico No (33) (34)

FL Collier Swartz Associates Inc * Kay Park Recreation 2015 6% (31)

Site Scapes Inc 2015 5% (31)

Superior Site Amenties 26/2015 8% (31)

Ultra Site 28/2015 6% (31)

Vista Furnishings 2015 5% (31)

Jaypro Sports 2015 7% (31)

National Recreation Systems 2015 6% (31)

ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 3: INSTALLATION

Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications

Rubber Designs by Rainbow 

Turf Products
5% Yes (2)

Playspace Services, Inc
Yes

FL Brevard Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC * Bolling Forest Wood Mulch (1)

FL Sarasota Apollo Sunguard Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

Safety 1st 5% No (8) 50% Interstate Inc No (8)

GA Bliss Products and Services Inc Wood Mulch Product 5% 65% (3) Fun Builders-International Mulch

Forestry Resources 5% (4) Express Mulch Blowing

Rubber Recycled 5%

X-Grass 5%

International Mulch Co. 5%

Fibar 5%

Play and Park Structure 5%

Fun Builders 5%

Chopper Construction Corp 5%

Dura-Play 5%

Go Mulch Forestry Resources 5% Yes
80%

FL Hillsborough Florida Playstructures and Water Features Inc * Rubber Mulch Products USA 5%

FL Citrus Gulf Coast Sports LLC * No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kompam 2015 Mats 5% (10) Yes

Kompam
2015 Pour in Place 

Rubber
5%

Kompam 2015 Boarders & Assoc. 5%

Kompam 2015 Rubber Mulch 5%

WA Kompan Inc Kompam 2015 Rubber Tile 5%

Kompam
2015 Engineered Wood 

Fiber & Assoc.
5%

Pour in Place Rubber 0% (12) Yes 33%

FL Miami-Dade Leadex Corporation * Zeager Mulch 0%

X-Grass (13)

Fibar Systems 5% No Bid

FL Manatee Miller Recreation Equipment & Design * Forever lawn 5%

No Fault 5%

Southwest Greens 5%

MO Miracle Recreation Equipment Company No Fault Rubber 5% (17)

ITEM 3: SURFACING MATERIALS
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 3: INSTALLATION

Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications

25%

TN Playcore Wisconsin DBA GameTime Inc GT Impax by Gametime 2015 5%

X Grass 2015 5% Yes (19)

FL Lee Playmore West Inc * Forever Lawn 2015 5%

Safety 1st 2015 5%

Robertson/Tot Turf 2015 5%

Irvine 2015 5%

Sof Surfaces 2015 5%

Zaeger 2015 5%

Forestry Resources 2015 5%

Surface America 2015 5%

GA PPLPT Farmington Inc/ Playworx Playsets LLC Little Tikes Commercial 37 8% Yes 27%

FL Pinellas Project Innovations LLC * Project Innovations Inc PII 5% Yes 5% Thunder Bay Coating

FL Martin RCP Shelters Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

FL Sarasota Recycled Plastic Factory LLC * No Bid No Bid

Forever Lawn Playground Turf 3%
Al Bosgraaf & Sons

No

FL
Seminole 

Rep Services Inc * Vitriturf Poured in Place Rubber 3% No Bid
Johnny Pitts Construction

Irvine Engineered Wood Fiber 5%

FL Saint Johns Shade America Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

FL Marion Shade Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid No Bid

Garick Kids Karpet Flyer 5%  (32) No (27) (28) PIP Provided by Manufacture No (27)

FL Brevard Southern Park and Play Systems * Zeager
2014 recreation Surface 

Catalog
5%

Kempfer Sawmill 5%

International Mulch Company Nuplay Flyer 5%

Kidstuff Playsystems 1005 5%

Ultra Play UPO313 5%

Child Works Volume 2 5%

Forestry Resources 2015 10% No (33) 50% (30) Kennico No (33) (34)

FL Collier Swartz Associates Inc * Zeaser 2015 5% 50% (30)

International Mulch Co. 2015 6% 35% (30)

Rubber Recycled/Playsafer 2015 6% 35% (30)

Pierceton Rubber Products 2015 5% 35% (30)

TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

ITEM 3: SURFACING MATERIALS
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Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 4: INSTALLATION

Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications

RCP Shelters 5% Yes 35% Playspace Services, Inc Yes

FL Brevard Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC * Superior Shade 5%

Superior Shelter 5%

Ultra Shade/ Shelter 5%

FL Sarasota Apollo Sunguard Systems Inc * Apollo Sunguard Effective 06/01/15 8% No (6) 65% Cocozza Construction Yes

Ultra Shade 5% No 40% (5) Interstate Inc No

GA Bliss Products and Services Inc Shelter Scapes 5% Funbuilders

Shade Systems 5%
Choppers Construction Corp

Play and Park Structures 5% Main Gates Construction

Shade America 5%

Sports Play 5%

5% Yes 45% (9)

FL Hillsborough Florida Playstructures and Water Features Inc * Superior Shade

FL Citrus Gulf Coast Sports LLC * No Bid No Bid No Bid

100% Precision Playground Holding Yes

WA Kompan Inc Kompan 2015 4% The Playground Guys

FL Miami-Dade Leadex Corporation * No Bid No Bid No Bid

Shade Systems 5% No Bid

FL Manatee Miller Recreation Equipment & Design * USA Shade 5%

RCP Shelters (Shelter 

Structure)
5%

CoverWork (Shelters Structure) 5%

No Bid

MO Miracle Recreation Equipment Company USA Shade 2015 5%

45% John Fitzgerald Yes

TN Playcore Wisconsin DBA GameTime Inc GT Impax by Gametime 2015 5%

Apollo Sunguard 2015 5% Yes 75%

FL Lee Playmore West Inc * Shade Systems 2015 5%

Classic 2015 5%

GA PPLPT Farmington Inc/ Playworx Playsets LLC Little Tikes Commercial 37 8% Yes 27%

FL Pinellas Project Innovations LLC * No Bid No Bid No Bid

ITEM 4: SHADE STRUCTURE
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS: ITEM 4: INSTALLATION

Catalog Name Number Discount Certifications Mark Up % Subcontractor Certifications

FL Martin RCP Shelters Inc * RCP Shelters RCP422055321S 10% No (20) 175% The Watauga Company Yes

FL Sarasota Recycled Plastic Factory LLC * No Bid No Bid No Bid

USA Shade 3% 45% Al Bosgraaf & Sons No (22)

FL Seminole Rep Services Inc * Poligon 3% Johnny Pitts Construction Yes

Landscape Structures 3%

FL Saint Johns Shade America Inc * No Bid No Bid Yes 40%

FL Marion Shade Systems Inc * Shade Systems 0% Yes 120%

Americana Volume 13 5% (29) (21) No (21)

FL Brevard Southern Park and Play Systems * Ultra Shade 2015

Lirchfield 7th Edition

Superior Shade Volume 9

Ultra Shade 2015 4% Yes (32) 90% Kenneco Inc Yes

FL Collier Swartz Associates Inc * Ultra Shelter 2015 4%

American Building Products 2015 4%

ITEM 4: SHADE STRUCTURE
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS:

FL Brevard Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC * $167.50 30.00%

FL Sarasota Apollo Sunguard Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid

GA Bliss Products and Services Inc $150.00 30.00%

FL Hillsborough Florida Playstructures and Water Features Inc * $100.00 25.00%

FL Citrus Gulf Coast Sports LLC * $26.50 10.00%

WA Kompan Inc $200.00 (a)

FL Miami-Dade Leadex Corporation * $65.00 20.00%

FL Manatee Miller Recreation Equipment & Design * $50.00 No Bid

MO Miracle Recreation Equipment Company $50.00 0% (18)

TN Playcore Wisconsin DBA GameTime Inc $100.00 10.00%

FL Lee Playmore West Inc * $100.00 25.00%

 

GA PPLPT Farmington Inc/ Playworx Playsets LLC $400.00 25.00%

 

FL Martin RCP Shelters Inc * $500.00 35.00%

 

FL Sarasota Recycled Plastic Factory LLC * $45.00 15.00%

 

FL Seminole Rep Services Inc * No Bid No Bid

 

ITEM 6: 

PERCENTAGE 

MARK UP FOR 

REPAIR MATERIAL

ITEM 5: REPAIRS 

HOURLY RATE
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

State County BIDDERS:

FL Saint Johns Shade America Inc * $250.00 No Bid

FL Marion Shade Systems Inc * No Bid No Bid

FL Brevard Southern Park and Play Systems * $75.00 30.00%

FL Collier Swartz Associates Inc * $200.00 No Bid

NOTES:

* Identified Florida as the principal place of business.

1) $55.0 per CF blown in.

2) As per attached contract pricing catalog.

3) Fixed percentage will be 65% of installed with Blower Truck

4) Poured in place rubber surfacing and artificial turf are quoted as " delivered and Installed"

5) Installation percentage covers erection of structure only. It does not include site work or any concrete foundations. That is priced per job.

6) Apollo Sunguard  Systems is the manufacturer.

7) There is no install certification for site furnishing.

8) Certification for installation not available.

9) 45% erection only. Footers quoted per job. Engineering not included.

10) Kompan has not submitted a percentage on this request. Our subcontractors do not calculate their cost to install surfacing based upon the price of the materials. Each type of surfacing is calculated in a different manner.

We are willing to extend a fixed 4% discount to the retail price of these installation services.

      12% $5000-$9999

     15% $10000-$14999

     18% $15000-$24999

    20% $25000-Above. Discount does not include freight, specials, parts

15) Bleachers. Discount does not include freight, specials, parts

16) Discount not on freight

17) Installation by No Fault included

18) No discount for parts

ITEM 5: REPAIRS 

HOURLY RATE

ITEM 6: 

PERCENTAGE 

MARK UP FOR 

REPAIR MATERIAL

Mat installation is based upon each unit-$35.00 per unit

Border installation is based upon each unit -$15.00 per unit

Pour in Place Rubber pricing includes installation of the surfacing- there is not a separate line item charge for installation

Engineered Wood Fiber installation is based upon cubic yard- $16.00 per cubic yard

Rubber Tile installation is based upon square footage- $3.00 per square foot

Rubber Mulch installation is based upon square footage-$10.00 per square foot

11) for Greenfield 

12) List includes materials and Installation. Based on Thickness, Fall Height and quantity

13) Pricing listed in bid. Installed by Leadex.

14) 8% $0-$4999
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 16-0025-MR

Bids Due:  3:00 p.m., July 22, 2015

NOTES:

20) We are the Manufacturer

21) Installation by manufacture

22) USA Shade & Porter/Parasol don not require certified installers

23) Installation 30 % on full playground units. All other items would be priced per item and varies in costs.

24) Provided by manufacture

25) No manufacture certifications are required for site equipment installation

26) Installation costs would be priced per items needing installation and varies in price depending what is required

27) Certification not required for wood fiber and rubber mulch

28) Installation cost would vary based on type of materials being installed and what is required for installation

29) Installation costs vary by items ordered and what is required by installation

30) $800.00 minimum charge for  installation

32) Any permitting requirements and costs (if applicable) will incur an additional fee. All jobsite insurance requirements supplied by Kennico Inc

33) Does not exist for these products

34) All jobsite insurance requirements supplied by Kennico Inc

NON-RESPONSIVE

a) Vendor did not submit requested markup.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 

120, Florida Statutes.

19) Caries-Install prices noted on price sheet/catalog where applicable

31) Prepay and add freight for all manufacturers
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