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Effective Period 11/17/2015 through 11/16/2017
Contract Type State Term Contract

s Pricing
 Contractors
Contraqt How to Use this Contract
Information Freguently Asked Questions - Users
Freguently Asked Questions - Vendors

Forms and Other Information

Contract Microsoft Word (® 261.51 KB)
Documents pDF (M 1.83 MB)

¢ Jennifer Hyatt
ContraCt e (850) 414-6741

Administration . Jennifer.hyatt@dms.myflorida.com

" UNSPSC-25101500, UNSPSC-25101503, UNSPSC-25101505, UNSPSC-
Commodity Codes 25101507, UNSPSC-25101600, UNSPSC-25101702

Description

This is a statewide contract for Motor Vehicles. This contract provides State Agencies and eligible users
with the ability to purchase new 2016 models at a discount off of MSRP on: automobiles, passenger vans,
cargo vans, sport utility vehicles, light pickup trucks, chassis-cab trucks, low-speed vehicles, truck bodies,
and installed options. Styles Include: Law Enforcement Automobiles, Law Enforcement SUVs, Law
Enforcement Motorcycles, Automobiles, Low-Speed Vehicles, Passenger Vans, Cargo Vans, SUVs, and
Pickup and Chassis-Cab Trucks (Class 1 through Class 5).

The Department strongly encourages ALL potential users of this contract to plan ahead to prevent any
potential delays. Please review the Contract Documents, "How to Use this Contract" Instructions, and
"Frequently Asked Questions" for this State Term Contract.

Benefits

State of Florida Base Vehicle Prices and Options Discounts equate to average approximate discount 70%
percent off of list price (MSRP).

« Additional discounts possible for large quantity, identical motor vehicle, orders.

Brands Include: Chevrolet, Club Car, Cruise Car, Dodge, Ford, Freightliner, GEM, GMC, Jeep, Motor
Electric, Nissan, Toyota, Harley Davidson, International and RAM.
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Attachment D.1: Price Sheet - Police Vehicles
Commodity Code No. 25101702; POLICE VEHICLES
Updated 1/6/2016
— Plassa see the Info Sheet for Insiruction, General nformation
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1 [2016 Chevrolet Impala Limited Pollce 4dr Sdn Police (1WS19, 9C1) s Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck | 18,895.00|  10% ($1.600.00) 12018 50-120 No Bid NoBid |$ 1426005 52600(|8  z600(5 106005 10800 § 56,00
Chevrolet
2 |2016 Chevrolet Caprics Police Patrol Vehicls 4dr Sdn Palics (1EW1D, 9C1) s GMC Truck |$ 2474600 20% (8500,00) 80-270 No Bid MoBid (5 12600(% 52600(3  216.00|5 106005 10800 § 56,00
. 3 |2016 Dodge Charger ddr Sdn Police RWD (LDDE48) o s 205700 0% $145.00 80-120 NoBid|[$ 119005 10s.00(S 496003 15000 S 8500| 3  mavo|§ 66,00
| Sub-Group A; POLICE PURSUIT AUTOMORILE, | Dod:
e
MARKED 4 2016 Dodgs Charger ddr 8dn Police AWD (LOEE48) s 22475.00 "% $145.00 $0-120 NoBid[§ 11900 |§ 10500 | § 49600 |$ 15900 §  8500|5 8900 § 85.00
§  [2016 Ford Ssdan Pollcs Intarceptor 4dr Sdn FWD (P2L, S00A) s $  22s200( 0% {51,700.00) 90-120 No Bid NoBid|$ 126003 596.00(35 216005 10600|5 10600( S 56.00
Ford
& {2016 Ford Sedan Police Interceptor 4dr Sdn AWD (P2M, 5004) s $ 2350000 6% ($300.00) 120 NoBid |5 22600|$ 22500 |3 485008 19500 | $ 89500 NoBid | § 125.00
Chavrolat 7 |2016 Chevrolat Impala Limited Police 4dr Sdn Palica (1WS18, 8C3) s S 1889600 10% NA 12102015 90120 No Bid NoBid | $ 12600 3 526003 21600 |5 10600(5 10600 3 56.00
e i SHMM_MMMMM?E?;__“ 8 |20 Dodge Charger 4dr Sdn Police RWD (LDDE48, AEB) o s neseo0| 0% NA 30120 Mo Bid MoBid|$ 126003 6e600|s 21600 Ne Bid NoBid | § 56.00
Dodgs
& |2016 Dodge Charger 4dr Sdn Police AWD [LDEE4S, AEB) Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc $ 242800 0% NA 20120 No Bid NoBid|$ 126005 596005 216,00 No Bid NoBid | § 56.00
Chevrolet 10 |2018 Chevrolet Tahoe Polica 2WD 4dr (CC15706, PPV, 8C1) s Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck |$ 3342600 70% $600.00 90-120 MNoBid |3 12600 3 62600 21600 |$ 10600 |$  106.00 | 56.00
Dodge 11 |2016 Dodge Durango 2WD 4dr Spacial Service (WDDE?5) S 2488600 | e0% 1$500.00) 90-120 NoBid|$ 12600( 5 5900(5 21600 No Bid NoBid | 8 5800
AEORT UTA T VERCLE. 70D e
12 |2016 Ford Expedition 2WD 4dr XL 88V (U1F, 102A) Don Reid Fo S 283300 15% (3400.00) 120 $  22500|% 22500(5 59500|S  195.00|3 19500 § 9500 % 126.00
Fard
13 2016 Ford Expedition EL 2WD ddr XL S8V (K1F, 1024) D id Ford s 31,669.00 14% ($400.00) 120 $ 2200|S 22500( 85 59500($ 19500 |$ 19500 | $ 9500 | $ 125.00
Chevralet 14 |2016 Chavrolst Tahos Special Sarvice Vah 4WD (CK15706, 5Wd) 8 Garber Chevrolet Poptiac GMC Truck | §  36567.00 |  70% 8500.00) 90-120 MNoBid |$ 126.00|$ 526008 21800 |8 10600 |3 10600 | § 56.00
Daodge 15 |2018 Dodge Durange AWD 4dr Special Servies (WDEETE) Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc, §  25976.00 60% (5500.00) 90-120 NoBid [§ 12600 § 59600 |% 216,00 No Bid NoBid | § 56.00
16 | 2016 Ford Expedition 4WD 4dr XL SSV (U1G, 102A) Don Reid Ford 5 3089200 18% (5400.00} 120 $ 225005 22500(% 50500|% 19500{8 19500 | $  s5p0| S 125.00
Sub-Oroup D: POLICE/SPECIAL SERVICE
SPORT UTILITY YEHICLE, 4WD [INCLUDING. NA
ALL WHEEL DRIVE CAWD™)
17 |2016 Ford Expedition EL 4WD 4dr XL (K1G, 1024) Don Reid Ford s A89T00| 5% (8400.00) 120 $ 22500(S 22500| % 596500/% 19500 (S 19500 § 9500 | S 126.00
Ford
Garber Ford Inc, $  25596.00 % $400.00 90-120 MNoBid | § 12600 | § 59600 |% 21600 |$ 10600|S 10600 S 56.00
18 (2016 Ford Utility Police intsrceptor AWD ddr (KA, 500} s
Dan Reid Ford $ 2698400 3% 15300.00) 120 $ 22500(% 225003 69500(%  19500(5  135.00 NoBid| §  1,269.00
Modsl. Validate Current Re ® Model
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