
STAFF REPORT 
 
DATE:  May 31, 2017      
 
RE: 607 Amelia Street (permit application # T17-8464) 
 
FROM:   Karen DeMaria, City of Key West Urban Forestry Manager  
 
An application was received requesting the removal of (1) Yellow 
Tabebuia tree.  A site inspection was done on May 3, 2017 and 
documented the following: 

           Tree Species: Yellow Tabebuia (Tabebuia aurea)                             
                  

 



 



 



 



 



 
 

 



 
 

 



 
Diameter: 19”  
Location: 50% (close to property line, in direct line with sewer line to 
house)    
Species:  50% (not on protected or not protected tree list)  
Condition: 60% (fair)  
Total Average Value = 53%  
Value x Diameter =  10 replacement caliper inches 
 
Recommendation:  Due to conflicts with main sewer line, 
recommend approval of the removal of (1) Yellow Tabebuia tree at 
607 Amelia Street to be replaced with 10 caliper inches of dicot or 
fruit trees from approved list, Fl#1, to be planted on site. 



 
 
Additional 

Information 
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Karen DeMaria

From: RADIM HAVLICEK <radimewa@comcast.net>
Sent: Thursday, June 01, 2017 6:22 PM
To: Karen DeMaria
Cc: EWA; Avwinc@aol.com
Subject: Fwd: 607 Amelia Street Tree removal permit
Attachments: 20170601090903.pdf

 
 
Hi Karen , 
 
There are some pictures from the plumbing. Also there is damage to sidewalk and driveway. I will send you 
more pictures over the weekend. 
 
Thank you, Radim 
 
 
 
 
 
Begin forwarded message: 
 
 

From: Alan Vanwieren <avwinc@aol.com> 
Subject: Fwd: 607 Amelia Street Tree removal permit 
Date: June 1, 2017 at 10:30:21 AM EDT 
To: Radim Havlicek <radimewa@comcast.net> 
 
 
 
Sent from my iPhone 
 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Gale Killion" <res4@athomekeywest.com> 
Date: June 1, 2017 at 10:24:43 AM EDT 
To: "'Alan VanWieren'" <Avwinc@aol.com> 
Subject: RE: 607 Amelia Street Tree removal permit 

Alan, 
  
Here’s the invoice from Haskins and some photos Art took.  The plumber is no longer 
with Haskins but Art said if the tree is not removed, there’s always the chance the roots 
will grow into the pipe again. 
  
Hope that helps. 
  

From: Alan VanWieren [mailto:Avwinc@aol.com]  
Sent: Thursday, June 01, 2017 8:42 AM 



2

To: Gale Killion 
Subject: Fwd: 607 Amelia Street Tree removal permit 
  
Gale, 
  
Could you email me copies of any plumber bills we have had that were caused by 
the tree?  Also it would be great if you could pass on to me any information from 
the plumber regarding future problems if the tree is not removed? 
  
Thanks,, Alan 
 

Begin forwarded message: 
  
From: Karen DeMaria <kdemaria@cityofkeywest-fl.gov> 
Subject: 607 Amelia Street Tree removal permit 
Date: May 31, 2017 at 4:44:41 PM EDT 
To: "avwinc@aol.com" <avwinc@aol.com>, "radimewa@comcast.net" 
<radimewa@comcast.net> 
  
Alan and Radim: 
  
I am putting together the staff report for the June 13 Tree Commission meeting that will 
include your request to remove the yellow tabebuia tree.  The application states that 
there is damage to the driveway and utilities, can you please submit additional 
information for the file that shows or documents the damage (photos, receipts of 
repairs).  I did notice what appears to be the sewer connection close to the tree, have 
you had issues?  This information is helpful for the commissioners to make a proper, 
informed decision.  It is asked that any additional information be submitted by Friday, 
June 9 so it can be uploaded into the file for the meeting. 
  
Sincerely, 
  
Karen 
      
Karen DeMaria 
Urban Forestry Manager/Tree Commission 
Certified Arborist 
305‐809‐3768 
  



3

 

 



4

 

 



5

 

 
 





1

Karen DeMaria

From: Karen DeMaria
Sent: Friday, June 09, 2017 11:10 AM
To: Karen DeMaria
Subject: FW: 607 Amelia Street Tree removal permit

From: Alan VanWieren [mailto:Avwinc@aol.com]  
Sent: Monday, June 05, 2017 5:07 PM 
To: Karen DeMaria <kdemaria@cityofkeywest‐fl.gov> 
Subject: Re: 607 Amelia Street Tree removal permit 

 
Karen, 
 
Please let me know if there is anything else I could do to plead our case.  I just know we will have another big 
plumbing bill soon and driveways/sidewalks will continue to crack and deteriorate. 
 
Thanks, Alan 
 
 

On Jun 2, 2017, at 9:17 AM, Karen DeMaria <kdemaria@cityofkeywest-fl.gov> wrote: 
 
That would be great.  Thank you and I have received the plumbing receipt. 
  
Sincerely, 
  
Karen 
  

From: RADIM HAVLICEK [mailto:radimewa@comcast.net]  
Sent: Thursday, June 01, 2017 6:22 PM 
To: Karen DeMaria <kdemaria@cityofkeywest‐fl.gov> 
Cc: EWA <RADIMEWA@COMCAST.NET>; Avwinc@aol.com 
Subject: Fwd: 607 Amelia Street Tree removal permit 
  
  
  
Hi Karen , 
  
There are some pictures from the plumbing. Also there is damage to sidewalk and driveway. I 
will send you more pictures over the weekend. 
  
Thank you, Radim 
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