NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

BID ON BLEACHER, PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 11-0014-MR

CONTRACT PERIOD: AUGUST 24, 2010 THROUGH AUGUST 23, 2013

BOARD APPROVED ON AUGUST 24, 2010

CONTRACT PERIOD: AUGUST 24, 2013 THROUGH AUGUST 23, 2014

BOARD APPROVED ON AUGUST 12, 2013

CONTRACT PERIOD: AUGUST 24, 2014 THROUGH AUGUST 23, 2015

BOARD APPROVED ON AUGUST 12, 2014

Posted August 9, 2010 12:35 pm



TABULATION OF BIDS ON BLEACHER, PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 11-0014-MR Page 1

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS: ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT ITEM 1: INSTALLATION

Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor

Advanced Recreational Concepts

Apollo Sunguard Systems

Bliss Products & Services

Shade Contractors

Christensen-Systems
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010
BIDDERS: ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT ITEM 1: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
Kidstaff Play Systems 1003 8/24/2010 10% (6) 35% Kidstuff Playsystems
5% (7)
0% (8)
10% (9)
(10)
10% (11)
0% (12)
5% (13)
5% (14)
(15)
Contrax Furnishings 10% (16)
Creative Shade Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engineering, Design, Fabrication No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wow Playgrounds 2010 5% 20% Presision Playgrounds
Childforms 2010 5% 34%
Playland Volume 31 12% 36%
Playmart 10%
Playmart Nature of Early Play 10%
Qitele Volume 20 10%
Florida Playstructures & Water . .
Features Progressive Design Playgrounds 2010 5%
Streetworks
Hunter Knepshield (b) Wow Playground 8% 35% Rooty Creek Iron Works
Childforms 2013 6% {23} 25% Interstate Installers
Miller Recreation Equipment &
Design Xeeent-Play 2010 0%(24) 27% Interstatetnstallers
Interstate
Miracle Recreation Equipment Miracle Recreation Equipment 2013 8% (30) 25% 3
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

Page 3

BIDDERS: ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT ITEM 1: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
PW Athletic Manufacturing PW Athletic Manufacturing 2010 5% 25% Johnny Pitts Construction
Big Toys 28 2010 3% 25% Interstate
Henderson Recreation Play Steel 2010 3%
Piazza (a) Henderson Recreation Play Wood 2010 3%
Utltra Play 2013 41275.00 10% 24% John Fitzgerald
Playcore Wisconsin Game Time 2013 1/1/2013 16% 24% John Fitzgerald
Playmore West Playworld Systems 2013 10% 28%
Play Power Little Tikes Farmington i i i
y g Little Tikes Commercial Play 35rd Edition Catalog 2013 10% 28% Johnny Pitts Construction
(b.2) Power
Recycled Plastic Factory No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Johnny Pitts Construction
Al Bosgraaf & Sons
Rep Services Landscape Structures 2013 6.5% (42) 31% Presision Playgrounds
Little Tikes 2014 10% 45% Ermax Enterprise
Play More LLC 2014 15% Dardin Installions
Seating Constructors USA NeBid NeBid Ne-Bid Ne-Bid No Bid DX$ Inc
BXCT-Burke 6/18/2014 10% 25%
Site Horizons Neo-Bid Neo-Bid Ne-Bid Ne-Bid Ne-Bid
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Page 4
Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010
BIDDERS: ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT ITEM 1: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
Outdoor Bleachers Net 17%
Southeastern Seating NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid
Recreation creations V13 2013 6% (50) 27% (51) Kennico (52)
RCI Early Childhood 201%;““ 6% (50)
Sportsplay 2013 8% (50)
Childform 2013 6% (50)
2013 Price
Swartz Associates Safeplay Systems Ecoplay list 7% (50)
Childforms 2010 2010 | 10% (55) (56) 40% (55) Southeast Surfacing and
Recreation
Blue Valley 2010 2010
Taylor Supply (c) Fitness Equipment 2010 2010 10% (55) (56)
Victor Stanley No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS: ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT ITEM 2: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor

Advanced Recreational Concepts

Apollo Sunguard Systems

Bliss Products & Services

Shade Contractors

Christensen Systems No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25%(4) Polis Henderson Recreation
Contrax Furnishings No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Creative Shade Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engineering, Design, Fabrication No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Florida Playstructures & Water
Features




Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

TABULATION OF BIDS ON BLEACHER, PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 11-0014-MR

Page 6

BIDDERS:

ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT

ITEM 2: INSTALLATION

Miller Recreation Equipment &
Design

Miracle Recreation Equipment

PW Athletic Manufacturing

Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
Kay Park 10% 35% (32) Streetworks
American Pro 5% Rooty Creek Iron Works
LaGranger Foundry & Design Leasure Craft 5%
Webcoat 5%
Qualite Sports Lighting 5%
Solar Outdoor Lighting 5%
_ Hunter Kne[_)sh.ield Modular 5%
Hunter Knepshield (b) Buildings
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT ITEM 2: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
Madrax 2009 3% 25% Interstate
Piazza (a) Thomas Steele 2010 3%

Playcore Wisconsin

Playmore West

Play Power Little Tikes Farmington
(b2)

Little Tikes Commercial 35rd Edition Catalog Johnny Pitts Construction

Recycled Plastic Factory

Rep Services

Seating Constructors USA

Site Horizons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010
BIDDERS: ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT ITEM 2: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
Southeastern Seating No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Swartz Associates

Taylor Supply

Victor Stanley

No Bid
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS: ITEM 3: SURFING MATERIALS ITEM 3: INSTALLATION

Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor

Advanced Recreational Concepts

Apollo Sunguard Systems

Bliss Products & Services

Shade Contractors

Christensen-Systems

Contrax Furnishings No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Creative Shade Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Engineering, Design, Fabrication No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010
BIDDERS: ITEM 3: SURFING MATERIALS ITEM 3: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
Playsafe-Surfing 2010 5%-19)-20) No-Bid
Zeager-Surfing 2009 21%
Rubber Mulch Products 4/19/2014 0% 30%
Zegger 2014 0%
Florida Playstructures & Water
Features s S
Streetworks
Hunter Knepshield (b) Zeager Wood Carpet 5% (33) Rooty Creek Iron Works
Duraplay 2013 5% (1) Ne-Bid Buraplay
Fibar Systems 2013 20% 28) Interstatetnstallers
Miller Recreation Equipment & .
Design X Grass 2013 10% {23} Ne-Bid X-Grass
Miracle Recreation Equipment Miraele-ReereationEq 2010 8%(30) No Bid
PW Athletic Manufacturing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Duraplay 3% 25% Duraplay
Childforms 3% 66% Zeager
Piazza (a) Zeager Recreational Surfacing 3% 25% Interstate
Playcore Wisconsin Game Time/ GT Impax 2013 1/1/2013 12% (37) John Fitzgerald
Childsafe 2013 6% (19)
Forever Lawn 2013 6% (19)
Sof Surfaces 2013 6% 38%
Zeager 2013 6% 75%
Irvine 2013 6% 75%
Playmore West X Grass 2013 6% (19)




Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

TABULATION OF BIDS ON BLEACHER, PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 11-0014-MR

Page 11

BIDDERS: ITEM 3: SURFING MATERIALS ITEM 3: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
No Faut Safety Surfacing (62) (62)
Play Power Little Tikes Farmington . o
(b.2) MitatarfRIR Attached-price-ist 2010 5%(41) 46y
Recycled Plastic Factory No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Forever Lawn 2014 3.5% (21)
Irvine Wood Recovery o
Playground Turf 2014 5%
Vitriturf Pourgd in Place 2014 35%
Surfacing
Pebble Flex 2014 3.5%
Rep Services SefFile-Krostock 2010 3:0%
Seating Constructors USA Seating Constructors USA SCUSAO0613 6/10/2013 5% 55%
Forestry Resources 6/18/2014 5%
Rainbow Turf products 6/18/2014 5% 35%
Site Horizons No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid
Southeastern Seating No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zeager Woodcarpet 2013 15% (50) No bid (51) Kennico (52)
Rubbercycle 201?i;r|ce 6% (50)
Child Safe Products 201?ispt”°e 5% (50)
2013 Price
Swartz Associates Foresty Resources list 10% (50)
Taylor Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Victor Stanley No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




TABULATION OF BIDS ON BLEACHER, PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 11-0014-MR Page 12

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS: ITEM 4: SHADE STRUCTURE ITEM 4: INSTALLATION

Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor

Advanced Recreational Concepts

Apollo Sunguard Systems

Bliss Products & Services

Shade Contractors

Christensen Systems

Contrax Furnishings

Creative Shade Solutions

Engineering, Design, Fabrication




Florida Playstructures & Water
Features
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010
BIDDERS: ITEM 4: SHADE STRUCTURE ITEM 4: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
Streetworks
Hunter Knepshield (b) Sl Structures 5.00% 35% (34) Rooty Creek Iron Works
Ball Fabrics 5% No Bid Interstate Installers
Coverworx 2013 5% (29) No Bid B& H Builders
RCP Shelters 2013 10% {26) No Bid
Shade Systems 2013 10% {26) No Bid Interstate Installers
Miller Recreation Equipment & ) . .
Desi Site & Park Amentias 2013 10% (26} No Bid
esign
Miracle Recreation Equipment Miracle Recreation Eq 2013 5%-(26) No Bid
PW Athletic Manufacturing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piazza (a) Appollo Sunguard 2008 2% 40% Christensen Systems
UltraShade 41275.00 10%
Playcore Wisconsin Gametime/ GT Shade 1/1/2013 10% 48% (38) John Fitzgerald
Classic Recreation 2013 6% 60%
Shade Systems 2013 10% 60%
YUSA-Shade Sun-Perts 2010 5% 160%
Playmore West Arericana 2010 5% 60%
Play Power Little Tikes Farmington . . . . .
(b.2) LTCPS Little Tikes 35 Edition 2013 5% 28% Johnny Pitts Construction
Recycled Plastic Factory No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

Page 14

BIDDERS: ITEM 4: SHADE STRUCTURE ITEM 4: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
Al Bosgraaf & Sons
Shade-Systems 2010 3% 40%(46) Presision Playgrounds
USA Shade 2014 2.5%
Pologon Steel-Fabric-Wood Park]

Rep Services Aschitecture 965 2014 2.5% (45) 39% (59)

IDC Group LLC
Sungaurd Shade Structures 2014 10% 60% Ermax Enterprizes

Darin Installation

Seating Constructors USA Seating Constructors USA SCUSA0613 6/10/2013 5% 65% DX$ Inc

Icon Shelters 6/18/2014 5% 30%
Site Horizons Superior Shade Price List 1/1/2010 5% (47) 25%
Southeastern Seating No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Site & Park Amenities 2013.00 6%
American 2013 PICE | 896 (50) (53) 75% (51) Kennico (52)

Swartz Associates Webcoat (pages 101-103) 2013 6% (50) (53)

Southeast Surfacing and
0, 0,
Taylor Supply (¢ ) Shade Systems 2010 2010 10% (58) 80% (55) Recreation
Victor Stanley No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS: ITEM 5: STADIUM BLEACHER ITEM 5: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
Ultra Play 2013 3.5%
Highlands 2013 3.5%
GT Grandstand/Ultra Play We're in the Game 2014 3.0% 40.0% Playspace Services
Advanced Recreational Concepts Kay Park 2010 M<aster Catalogue 2014 5.0%
Apollo Sunguard Systems No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ultra Grandstands 2013 12% Fun Builders
NRS 2013 12% Interstate
Athletic Connection 2013 5% GT Grandstands
Jay Pro 2013 5%
store.blissproducts.com Website 9% 38% Sandee Sod
Bliss Products & Services GT Grandstands 2013 12% 22%
Shade Contractors
Christensen-Systems No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Contrax Furnishings No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Creative Shade Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engineering, Design, Fabrication No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Florida Playstructures & Water
Features Gared-Sperts 2010 8% 24
Streetworks

Hunter Knepshield (b) Kay Park 10% 35% (35) Rooty Creek Iron Works
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

Page 16

BIDDERS: ITEM 5: STADIUM BLEACHER ITEM 5: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor

Miller Recreation Equipment & .
Design Kay Park 2013 6% No Bid Interstate Installers
Miracle Recreation Equipment No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PW Athletic Manufacturing PW Athletic Manufacturing 2010 5% 25% Johnny Pitts Construction
Piazza (a) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Playcore Wisconsin GT Grandstands 2013 1/1/2013 12% 34%
Playmore West All Star 2013 6% 30%
Play Power Little Tikes Farmington . . . . .
(b.2) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Recycled Plastic Factory No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rep Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010
BIDDERS: ITEM 5: STADIUM BLEACHER ITEM 5: INSTALLATION
Catalog Name Number Date Discount Discount Subcontractor
Sporting Contractores USA 2013-2014 10% 50% Ermax Enterprizes
Outdoor Aluminum 2014 10% Darin Installation
Enternational Design Construction 2014 20% DX4 Inc
The IDC Group

Seating Constructors USA Seating Constructors USA SCUSA061013 6/1/2013 10% 35%
Site Horizons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2014 0% 0%

Net 7%

Southeastern Seating Southeastern Seating 1142010 48) 0%
Swartz Associates No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Taylor Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Victor Stanley No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




TABULATION OF BIDS ON BLEACHER, PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 11-0014-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS: ITEM 6: REPAIRS
Hourly Rate
Advanced Recreational Concepts $125.00
Apollo Sunguard Systems $125.00
Bliss Products & Services $40.00

Shade Contractors

Chistensen-Systems $125.00
Contrax Furnishings No Bid
Creative Shade Solutions No Bid
Engineering, Design, Fabrication No Bid

Florida Playstructures & Water
Features $80.00

Hunter Knepshield (b) $60.00 (36)

Page 18
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS: ITEM 6: REPAIRS
Hourly Rate
Miller Recreation Equipment &
Design $50.00
Miracle Recreation Equipment No Bid
PW Athletic Manufacturing No Bid
Piazza (a) $18.00
Playcore Wisconsin $75.00 (39)
Playmore West $100.00
Play Power Little Tikes Farmington .
No Bid
(b.2)
Recycled Plastic Factory $30.00
Rep Services (21)
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TABULATION OF BIDS ON BLEACHER, PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 11-0014-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS: ITEM 6: REPAIRS
Hourly Rate
Seating Constructors USA $45.00
Site Horizons No Bid
Southeastern Seating $45.00 (49)
Swartz Associates $150.00 (54)
Taylor Supply (¢) $40.00 (57)
Victor Stanley No Bid

Page 20
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

NOTES:

(4)-Already Deducted
(2) See attachment A

(3) Sol Surface and Zearer only

(4) Installation does not include land development, or construction site prep work. We will quote additional charges for permitting, rental equipment, sod & sod repair, site repair, irrigation repair and
concrete as required.

(5) Childsafe products pricing includes installation. SouthFlorida Putting Greens pricing includes installation. Discount is for the products installed. There is no further discount for installation
(6) Steel & Plastic Playsystems (catalog pages 4-39) consisting of 3-1/2" OD Post Playsystems with plastic decks

(7) Steel & Plastic Playsystems (catalog pages 4-39) consisting of 5" & 3-1/2" OD Post Playsystems with plastic decks

(8) Wood Healthtrek & Cottage Climbers (catalog pages 9-10 & NS)

(9) Steel Health trek (catalog pages 9-10 & NS)

(10) Sky Climbers (catalog page 40). Not included in bid price call for current pricing.

(11) Freestanding Play Events (catalog pages 41-43)

(12) Park Site Furnishings (catalog pages 44-45)

(13) Free Standing Play Events (catalog pages 48-56)

(14) Classic Wood Playsystems (catalog pages 57-59)

(15) Steel & Plastic Playsystems (catalog page 60) same as pages 4-39 with engineered Wood Fiber and Lose Rubber. Not included in bid pricing call for current pricing

(16) Replacement parts (catalog page 61)

(17) Pricing per Manatee County price list Rectangles 4/6 post shade structure, Square 4 post shade structure or Oasis All Weather Umbrella. All structures are custom build as per cleint needs.
(18) Pricing per Engineering, Design. Additional Services price list is also attached (for installation services) 0%

(19) Includes Installation

(20) Site prep, subbase install, fencing & security by others

(21) By quote

(22) Erection Only Footers quoted per order.

066 6-18.600 6—25.000-and-abeve
(24) $0 t04999 0% 5,000 to 9,999-0%, 10,000 to 14,999-5%, 15,000 to 17,999-5%, 18,000 to 24,999-5%, 25,000 and above 10%

(30) $0 to 4 ,999- 8% 5 000 to 9 999- 13% 10 000 to 14 ,999- 16% 15 000 to 17 ,999- 19% 18,000 to 24,999- 18% 25,000 and above 21%, Does not include specials
(31) The following are certified/ authorized to install playground equipment as required by Miracle Recreation Equipment Company.
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

NOTES: Continued
(32) Qualite, SOL & Modular call for install- price varies
(33) Firm fixed percentage varies
(34) Plus add $550.00 per footer on shelters
(35) Plus price for concrete footers if required
(36) plus $25.00 per hour travel time
(37) see installation price sheet
(38) Installation for shade varies. Quote percentage is worst case scenario. Gametime to quote best price available on each
(39) Repair cost includes basic parts/hardware that is carried on truck
(40) Installation is included in the attached price list pricing. We do not offer this product without install. Vitnturf installs their product.
(41) Discount already included in pricing on attached price list.
(42) 6% up to $20,000 and 8% over $20,001. Renewal 6.5% up to $20,000 and 8.5% over $20,001.
(43) DuMor prices are in the catalog
(44) $5,000 equipment order minimum for installation
(45) Poligon price list not available, pricing is job/ location specific
(46) Does not include price of engineered foundation or land development
(47) Additional services price list is also attached for installation type service with 0% discount
coti
(49) Bleachers only
(50) Prepay and add freight for all manufactures
(51) $800 minimum charge for installation
(52) All jobsite insurance requirements supplied by Kennico
(53) Prices do not include any permits or associated fees, if applicable
(54) $300 minimum charge

(55) We will require a $3500.00 minimum equipment cost for us to provide installation services. There is no minimum required for supply of equipment only to be installed by others or district personnel.
(56) Freight will be prepaid and added to each invoice. We will quote freight at the time of ordering so it can be added to any purchase order

(57) Per man hour

(58) Pricing is for the shade structure and fabric and includes drawing but these will not be certified as all jurisdictions don't necessarily require certifications or calculations. If calculations are required:
ADD $350.00 per structure. Per certified drawing by a registered PE ADD $650.00 per structure.

(59) Does not include price of engineered foundations or site work, avialble by quote.

(60) Some Surfaces are manuafacturer installed.

(61) Installtion does not include any site work ot engineering. Slabs under shades are not included.
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Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

(62) Quated Net. Installation included in quote.

(63) 2014 list pricing less 5% already applied.

(64) Installtion priced per job to include plumbing, electrical and concrete in addition to setting features and equipment.
(65) Blower companies and the discount is from installed/ delivered price.

(66) Safety 1st does their own installation, 5% discount is from installed price.

(67) Installation priced per job to include site work, electric, concrete, plumbing, permits and fees

(68) Instalaltion percentage does not include sitework, permuts or slabs. It is th eerection at shelters only

(a) Company out of business.

(b) (b.2)Vendor did not respond to renewal request.

(c) Vendor chose not to renew.

Iltems in red are additions, catalog changes and/or price reductions

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall
constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.




