

**NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD**

**BID ON BLEACHER, PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 11-0014-MR**

**CONTRACT PERIOD: AUGUST 24, 2010 THROUGH AUGUST 23, 2013**

**BOARD APPROVED ON AUGUST 24, 2010**

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT				ITEM 1: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Advanced Recreational Concepts	BCI Burke, LLC	Playground Parks & Rec. Equip.	2010	10%	28%	Playspace Services
	BCI Burke LB & Basics	Early Childhood	2010	5%		
	Earthscapes Structures	Playground Parks & Rec. Equip.	2010	5%		
	Urban Designs	Contemporary Playpoints	2010	3%		
	Berliner-Rope Units	Play Equipment for Life	2010	3%		
	Games & Sports	Timer for a Workout	2010	3%		
	Feenotes Harmony Park	Musical Playground	2010	2%		
Apollo Sunguard Systems	Apollo Perfect Playground		7/1/2010	5%	35% (4)	Christensen Systems
	Henderson Recreation	Steel	2009	5%		
	Henderson Recreation	Playwood	2009	5%		
	Childforms		2010	5%		
Bliss Products & Services	Play & Park Structures		2010	13%	35%	Interstate & Funbuilders
	Kompan Early Childhood	V 2.0	2010	5%		
	Kompan School Age	V 2.0	2010	5%		
	Kompan Fit Active		2010	5%		
	Kompan Corocord		2010	5%		
	Playmore Design Corp		2009	10%		
	Elephant Play		2009	10%		
	Sports Play		2010	12%		
	Childforms		2010	10%		
	Big Toys			5%		
U Play Today		2010	10%			
Christensen Systems	Childforms		2010	5%	25% (4)	Henderson Recreation Prod. Apollo Perfect Playground

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT				ITEM 1: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Contrax Furnishings	<b>Kidstaff Play Systems</b>	<b>1003</b>	<b>8/24/2010</b>	<b>10% (6)</b> <b>5% (7)</b> <b>0% (8)</b> <b>10% (9)</b> <b>(10)</b> <b>10% (11)</b> <b>0% (12)</b> <b>5% (13)</b> <b>5% (14)</b> <b>(15)</b> <b>10% (16)</b>	<b>35%</b>	<b>Kidstuff Playsystems</b>
Creative Shade Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Engineering, Design, Fabrication	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Florida Playstructures & Water Features	<b>Wow Playgrounds</b> <b>Childforms</b> <b>Progressive Design Playgrounds</b>		<b>2010</b> <b>2010</b> <b>2010</b>	<b>5%</b> <b>5%</b> <b>5%</b>	<b>34%</b>	<b>Presision Playgrounds</b>
Hunter Knepshield	<b>Wow Playground</b>			<b>8%</b>	<b>35%</b>	<b>Streetworks</b> <b>Rooty Creek Iron Works</b>
Miller Recreation Equipment & Design	<b>Childforms</b> <b>Xccent Play</b>		<b>2010</b>	<b>5% (23)</b> <b>0% (24)</b>	<b>27%</b> <b>27%</b>	<b>Interstate Installers</b>
Miracle Recreation Equipment	<b>Miracle Recreation Equipment</b>		<b>2010</b>	<b>8% (30)</b>	<b>27%</b>	<b>(31)</b>

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT				ITEM 1: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
PW Athletic Manufacturing	<del>PW Athletic Manufacturing</del>		2010	5%	25%	Johnny Pitts Construction
(a) Piazza	<del>Big Toys Henderson Recreation Henderson Recreation</del>	<del>28 Play Steel Play Wood</del>	<del>2010 2010 2010</del>	<del>3% 3% 3%</del>	<del>25%</del>	<del>Interstate</del>
Playcore Wisconsin	Game Time	2010	1/1/2010	15%	25%	
Playmore West	Playworld Systems		2010	5%	32%	
Play Power Little Tikes Farmington	Little Tikes Commercial Play Power	33rd Edition Catalog		10%	28%	Johnny Pitts Construction
Recycled Plastic Factory	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Rep Services	Landscape Structures <del>Landscape Structures Play Sense</del>		2010 2010	6% (42) 6% (42)	32%	Johnny Pitts Construction Al Bosgraaf & Sons Presision Playgroumds
Seating Constructors USA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Site Horizons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT				ITEM 1: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Southeastern Seating	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Swartz Associates	Recreation creations	Early Childhood	2010	5% (50)	27% (51)	Kenmico (52)
	RCI		2010 Price list	5% (50)		
	Sportsplay		2010	7% (50)		
	Childform		2010	5% (50)		
	Safeplay Systems	Ecoplay	2010 Price list	6% (50)		
Taylor Supply	Childforms	2010	2010	10% (55) (56)	40% (55)	Southeast Surfacing and Recreation
	Blue Valley	2010	2010			
	Fitness Equipment	2010	2010	10% (55) (56)		
Victor Stanley	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT				ITEM 2: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Advanced Recreational Concepts	Kay Park Recreation	2010 Master Catalogue	2010	3%	35%	Playspace Service
	Ultra Play/Ultra Coat	Park Furnishings & Site Amenities	2010	3%		
	Paris Equipment MFG.	2009-2010 Product Catalogue	2010	3%		
	Web Coat	Coated Outdoor Furniture	2010	3%		
	Park Pets & Boulders	Realistic Boulders, Benches and Themed Climbers for Parks and Playgrounds	2010	3%		
	Bison	Team Sports & Rec Equipment	2010	3%		
Apollo Sunguard Systems	Polis park Furniture	2009	2009	5%	35% (4)	Christensen Systems
Bliss Products & Services	Ultra Play	Park Furnishings & Site Amentias	2010	12%	35%	Interstate Inc, Fun Builders
	Jay Hawk	Plastics	2009	12%		
Christensen Systems	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25% (4)	Polis Henderson Recreation
Contrax Furnishings	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Creative Shade Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Engineering, Design, Fabrication	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Florida Playstructures & Water Features	Webcoat		2010	3%	40%	
	Jay Hawk		2009	2%		

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT				ITEM 2: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Hunter Knepschild	Kay Park American Pro LaGranger Foundry & Design Webcoat Qualite Sports Lighting Solar Outdoor Lighting Hunter Knepschild Modular Buildings	Leasure Craft		10% 5% 5% 5% 5% 5%	35% (32)	Streetworks Rooty Creek Iron Works
Miller Recreation Equipment & Design	Blson Douglas Foresite Designs Kay Park KenCoat Murdock Super Secur Building & Plumbing Fixtures Recycle Design Sportable Scoreboards Webcoat	Team Sports & Park & Rec Equip Sports Equipment	2010  2010	5% (25) 5% (25) 5% 5% 5% (26) 5% 5% (27) 5% (26)	27% 27% 27% 27% No Bid 27% No Bid 27%	Interstate Summings Patton
Miracle Recreation Equipment	Miracle Recreation Eq		2010	8% (30)	27%	(31)
PW Athletic Manufacturing	PW Athletic Manufacturing		2010	5%	25%	Johnny Pitts Construction
(a) Piazza	Madrox Thomas Steele		2009 2010	3% 3%	25%	Interstate
Playcore Wisconsin	Ultraplay	2010	1/1/2010	15%	20%	

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT				ITEM 2: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Playmore West	Paris		2010	10%	32%	
	Benito		2010	5%		
	Cascades		2010	5%		
	Madrax		2010	5%		
	Gared		2010	5%		
	Sports Play		2010	5%		
	Child Forms		2010	5%		
	Kay park		2010	5%		
	Webcoat		2010	5%		
	Thomas Steele		2010	5%		
Play Power Little Tikes Farmington	Little Tikes Commercial	33rd Edition Catalog		10%	28%	Johnny Pitts Construction
Recycled Plastic Factory	Recycled Plastic Factory	Retail	7/1/2010	32%	15%	
Rep Services	Dumer Site Furnishings (43) Landscape Brands		2010	3%	34% (44)	
			2010	8%		
Seating Constructors USA	Seating Constructors USA	SCUSA0520	5/20/2010	5%	45%	
Site Horizons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Southeastern Seating	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	



Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT				ITEM 2: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Swartz Associates	SiteScapes Kay Park Rec. Corp. Webcoat Blue Valley Ind. Firesite Designs Jaypro Sports		2010 Price list 2010 2010 2010 Price list 2009 Price list 2010	4% (50) 6% (50) 6% (50) 5% (50) 7% (50) 7% (50)	27% (51)	Kennico (52)
Taylor Supply	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Victor Stanley	Victor Stanley	Price Schedule V9.9	7/28/2008	5%	25%	Johnny Pitts Construction

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 3: SURFING MATERIALS				ITEM 3: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Advanced Recreational Concepts	Rainbow Turf Kangaroo EPDM	Rainbow Turf Products	2010	5% (1)	(2)	Playspace Service
	Rainbow Turf Loose Fill N Pnp Rubber Mulch	Rainbow Turf Products	2010	5% (1)		
	Rainbow Turf Interlocking Tiles	Rainbow Turf Products	2010	5% (1)		
	Rainbow Turf Synthetic Grass	Rainbow Turf Products	2010	5% (1)		
	Irvine Wood Mulch	Rainbow Turf Products	2010	5%		
Apollo Sunguard Systems	Sof Surface	Softile	1/1/2010	19%	35% (4) (5)	Christensen Systems
	Zeagar Hardwood		7/13/2010	5%		
	Chikidsafe Products		2010	10%		
	South Florida Putting Greens		7/19/2010	5%		
Bliss Products & Services	Terra Soft		2010	7%	40%	
	Dura Play		2010	7%		
	Child Safe		2010 Web	7%		
	X-Glass		2010	8%		
	Fibar	Fibar Systems	2010	12%		
	Rubber Recycle		2010 Web	10%		
Christensen Systems	Child Safe	2010	2010	10%	35% (4) (5)	Sof Surfaces, Softtile
	Zeagar	Hardwood	7/13/2010	5%		
	South Florida Putting Greens		7/19/2010			
Contrax Furnishings	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Creative Shade Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Engineering, Design, Fabrication	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 3: SURFING MATERIALS				ITEM 3: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Florida Playstructures & Water Features	Playsafe Surfing		2010	5% (19) (20)	No Bid	
	Zeager Surfing		2009	21%		
	Syn Lawn			32%		
Hunter Knepschild	Zeager	Wood Carpet		5%	(33)	Streetworks Rooty Creek Iron Works
Miller Recreation Equipment & Design	Duraplay			0% (1)	No Bid	Duraplay
	Fibar Systems			17%	(28)	Interstate Installers
	X Grass			5% (23)	No Bid	X Grass
Miracle Recreation Equipment	Miracle Recreation Eq		2010	8% (30)	No Bid	
PW Athletic Manufacturing	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
(a) Piazza	<del>Duraplay</del> <del>Childforms</del> <del>Zeager Recreational Surfacing</del>			<del>3%</del> <del>3%</del> <del>3%</del>	<del>25%</del> <del>66%</del> <del>25%</del>	<del>Duraplay</del> <del>Zeager</del> <del>Interstate</del>
Playcore Wisconsin	Game Time/ GT Impax	2010	1/1/2010	10%	(37)	John Fitzgerald
Playmore West	Childsafe		2010	5% (19)		
	Forever Lawn		2010	5% (19)		
	Sof Surfaces		2010	5%	40%	
	Zeager		2010	5%	80%	
	Irvine		2010	5%	80%	
	X Grass		2010	5% (19)		

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 3: SURFING MATERIALS				ITEM 3: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Play Power Little Tikes Farmington	<b>Vitaturf PIP</b>	<b>Attached price list 2010</b>		<b>5% (41)</b>	<b>(40)</b>	
Recycled Plastic Factory	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Rep Services	<b>Forever Lawn Irvine Wood Recovery Playground Turf Vitriturf Poured in Place Surfacing SofTile Kros Lock</b>		<b>2010 2/1/2005 2010 2010</b>	<b>3% 5% 3% 3%</b>	<b>(21)</b>	
Seating Constructors USA	<b>Seating Constructors USA</b>	<b>SCUSA0520</b>	<b>5/20/2010</b>	<b>5%</b>	<b>55%</b>	
Site Horizons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Southeastern Seating	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Swartz Associates	<b>Zeager Woodcarpet Rubbercycle Child Safe Products</b>		<b>2010 2010 Price list 2010 Price list</b>	<b>15% (50) 5% (50) 5% (50)</b>	<b>No bid (51)</b>	<b>Kennico (52)</b>
Taylor Supply	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Victor Stanley	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 4: SHADE STRUCTURE				ITEM 4: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Advanced Recreational Concepts	Shade Systems	Collest Solutions Under the Sun	2009	5% (1)	38%	Playspace Services
	Sunports	Shade Solutions for Everything Under the Sun	2010	5%		
	Coverworx	Recreational Architecture	2010	5%		
	Ball Fabrics	Shade Fabrics	2010	5%		
	Superior Shade	Solar Shade Structures for All Occasions	2010	5%		
Apollo Sunguard Systems	Apollo Sunguard	Price Guide 2009	3/1/2010	5%	65% (4)	Christensen Systems
Bliss Products & Services	Air Shade America			12%	35%	
Christensen Systems	Apollo Sunguard Systems	2008	3/1/2010	5%	45% (4)	
Contrax Furnishings	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Creative Shade Solutions	(17)			(17)	(17)	Lecakis Enterprises
Engineering, Design, Fabrication	(18)			(18)	25%	
Florida Playstructures & Water Features	Ball Fabrics		2010	5%	45% (22)	
	Superior Shade		2009	5%		

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 4: SHADE STRUCTURE				ITEM 4: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Hunter Knepschild	SII Structures			5.00%	35% (34)	Streetworks Rooty Creek Iron Works
Miller Recreation Equipment & Design	Ball Fabrics			5%	No Bid	Interstate Installers
	Coverworx			2% (29)	No Bid	Interstate Installers
	RCP Shelters			5% (26)	No Bid	
	Shade Systems		2010	5% (26)	No Bid	Interstate Installers
	Site & Park Amentias			2% (29)	No Bid	
Miracle Recreation Equipment	Miracle Recreation Eq.		2010	8% (26)	No Bid	
PW Athletic Manufacturing	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
(a) Piazza	Apollo Sanguard		2008	2%	40%	Christensen Systems
Playcore Wisconsin	Gametime/ GT Shade	2010	1/1/2010	10%	50% (38)	
Playmore West	Classic Recreation		2010	5%	60%	
	Shade Systems		2010	5%	75%	
	USA Shade	Sun Ports	2010	5%	100%	
	Americana		2010	5%	60%	
Play Power Little Tikes Farmington	LTCPS Little Tikes	Shade Builder Price list	2010	5%	28%	Johnny Pitts Construction
Recycled Plastic Factory	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 4: SHADE STRUCTURE				ITEM 4: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Rep Services	<del>Shade Systems Pologon Park Architecture</del>	<del>L924</del>	<del>2010 2010</del>	<del>3% 2% (45)</del>	<del>40% (46)</del>	
Seating Constructors USA	<del>Seating Constructors USA</del>	<del>SCUSA0520</del>	<del>5/20/2010</del>	<del>5%</del>	<del>65%</del>	
Site Horizons	<del>Superior Shade</del>	<del>Price List</del>	<del>1/1/2010</del>	<del>5% (47)</del>	<del>25%</del>	
Southeastern Seating	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Swartz Associates	<del>American Webcoat (pages 101-103)</del>		<del>2010 Price List 2010</del>	<del>7% (50) (53) 7% (50) (53)</del>	<del>75% (51)</del>	<del>Kennico (52)</del>
Taylor Supply	<del>Shade Systems</del>	<del>2010</del>	<del>2010</del>	<del>10% (58)</del>	<del>80% (55)</del>	<del>Southeast Surfacing and Recreation</del>
Victor Stanley	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 5: STADIUM BLEACHER				ITEM 5: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Advanced Recreational Concepts	GT Grandstand/Ultra Play Kay Park	We're in the Game 2010 Master Catalogue	2010 2010	3% 3%	35%	Playspace Services
Apollo Sunguard Systems	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Bliss Products & Services	GT Grandstands			12%	19%	
Christensen Systems	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Contrax Furnishings	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Creative Shade Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Engineering, Design, Fabrication	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Florida Playstructures & Water Features	Gared Sports		2010	8%	(21)	
Hunter Knepschild	Kay Park			10%	35% (35)	Streetworks Rooty Creek Iron Works



Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 5: STADIUM BLEACHER				ITEM 5: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Miller Recreation Equipment & Design	<b>Kay Park</b>		<b>2010</b>	<b>5%</b>	No Bid	<b>Interstate Installers</b>
Miracle Recreation Equipment	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
PW Athletic Manufacturing	<b>PW Athletic Manufacturing</b>		<b>2010</b>	<b>5%</b>	<b>25%</b>	<b>Johnny Pitts Construction</b>
(a) Piazza	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Playcore Wisconsin	<b>GT Grandstands</b>	<b>2010</b>	<b>1/1/2010</b>	<b>10%</b>	<b>35%</b>	
Playmore West	<b>All Star</b>		<b>2010</b>	<b>5%</b>	<b>32%</b>	
Play Power Little Tikes Farmington	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Recycled Plastic Factory	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Rep Services	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 5: STADIUM BLEACHER				ITEM 5: INSTALLATION	
	Catalog Name	Number	Date	Discount	Discount	Subcontractor
Seating Constructors USA	<del>Seating Constructors USA</del>	<del>SCUSA0520</del>	<del>5/20/2010</del>	<del>10%</del>	<del>35%</del>	
Site Horizons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Southeastern Seating	<del>Southeastern Seating</del>		<del>1/1/2010</del>	<del>(48)</del>	<del>0%</del>	
Swartz Associates	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Taylor Supply	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Victor Stanley	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 6: REPAIRS Hourly Rate
Advanced Recreational Concepts	\$125.00
Apollo Sunguard Systems	\$125.00
Bliss Products & Services	\$40.00
Christensen Systems	\$125.00
Contrax Furnishings	No Bid
Creative Shade Solutions	No Bid
Engineering, Design, Fabrication	No Bid
Florida Playstructures & Water Features	\$80.00
Hunter Knepschild	\$60.00 (36)

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 6: REPAIRS Hourly Rate
Miller Recreation Equipment & Desi	\$50.00
Miracle Recreation Equipment	No Bid
PW Athletic Manufacturing	No Bid
(a) Piazza	\$18.00
Playcore Wisconsin	\$75.00 (39)
Playmore West	\$100.00
Play Power Little Tikes Farmington	No Bid
Recycled Plastic Factory	\$30.00
Rep Services	(21)

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

BIDDERS:	ITEM 6: REPAIRS
	Hourly Rate
Seating Constructors USA	<del>\$45.00</del>
Site Horizons	No Bid
Southeastern Seating	<del>\$45.00 (49)</del>
Swartz Associates	<del>\$150.00 (54)</del>
Taylor Supply	<del>\$40.00 (57)</del>
Victor Stanley	No Bid

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

NOTES:

REVISION:

- (1) Already Deducted
- (2) See attachment A
- (3) Sol Surface and Zearer only
- (4) Installation does not include land development, or construction site prep work. We will quote additional charges for permitting, rental equipment, sod & sod repair, site repair, irrigation repair and concrete as required.
- (5) Childsafe products pricing includes installation. SouthFlorida Putting Greens pricing includes installation. Discount is for the products installed. There is no further discount for installation
- (6) Steel & Plastic Playsystems (catalog pages 4-39) consisting of 3-1/2" OD Post Playsystems with plastic decks
- (7) Steel & Plastic Playsystems (catalog pages 4-39) consisting of 5" & 3-1/2" OD Post Playsystems with plastic decks
- (8) Wood Healthtrek & Cottage Climbers (catalog pages 9-10 & NS)
- (9) Steel Health trek (catalog pages 9-10 & NS)
- (10) Sky Climbers (catalog page 40). Not included in bid price call for current pricing.
- (11) Freestanding Play Events (catalog pages 41-43)
- (12) Park Site Furnishings (catalog pages 44-45)
- (13) Free Standing Play Events (catalog pages 48-56)
- (14) Classic Wood Playsystems (catalog pages 57-59)
- (15) Steel & Plastic Playsystems (catalog page 60) same as pages 4-39 with engineered Wood Fiber and Lose Rubber. Not included in bid pricing call for current pricing
- (16) Replacement parts (catalog page 61)
- (17) Pricing per Manatee County price list Rectangles 4/6 post shade structure, Square 4 post shade structure or Oasis All Weather Umbrella
- (18) Pricing per Engineering, Design. Additional Services price list is also attached (for installation services) 0%
- (19) Includes Installation
- (20) Site prep, subbase install, fencing & security by others
- (21) By quote
- (22) Erection Only. Footers quoted per order.
- (23) \$0 to 4,999-5%, 5,000 to 9,999-5%, 10,000 to 17,999-8%, 18,000 to 24,999-10%, 25,000 and above 10%
- (24) \$0 to 4,999-0%, 5,000 to 9,999-0%, 10,000 to 14,999-5%, 15,000 to 17,999-5%, 18,000 to 24,999-5%, 25,000 and above 10%
- (25) \$0 to 4,999-5%, 5,000 to 9,999-8%, 10,000 to 14,999-10, 15,000 to 17,999-10%, 18,000 to 24,999-15%, 25,000 and above 15%
- (26) \$0 to 4,999-5%, 5,000 to 9,999-5%, 10,000 to 14,999-8%, 15,000 to 17,999-10%, 18,000 to 24,999-10%, 25,000 and above 10%
- (28) \$10.00 Cubic yard
- (29) \$0 to 4,999-2%, 5,000 to 9,999-4%, 10,000 to 14,999-6%, 15,000 to 17,999-8%, 18,000 to 24,999-10%, 25,000 and above 10%
- (30) \$0 to 4,999-8%, 5,000 to 9,999-12%, 10,000 to 14,999-15%, 15,000 to 17,999-15%, 18,000 to 24,999-18%, 25,000 and above 20%, Does not include specials
- (31) The following are certified/ authorized to install playground equipment as required by Miracle Recreation Equipment Company.

(a) Company no longer in business

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 20, 2010

NOTES: Continued

- (32) Qualite, SOL & Modular call for install- price varies
- (33) Firm fixed percentage varies
- (34) Plus add \$550.00 per footer on shelters
- (35) Plus price for concrete footers if required
- (36) plus \$25.00 per hour travel time
- (37) see installation price sheet
- (38) Installation for shade varies. Quote percentage is worst case scenario. Gametime to quote best price available on each
- (39) Repair cost includes basic parts/hardware that is carried on truck
- (40) Installation is included in the attached price list pricing. We do not offer this product without install. Vitnturf installs their product.
- (41) Discount already included in pricing on attached price list.
- (42) 6% up to \$20,000 and 8% over \$20,001
- (43) DuMor prices are in the catalog
- (44) \$5,000 equipment order minimum for installation
- (45) Poligon price list not available, pricing is job/ location specific
- (46) Does not include price of engineered foundation or land development
- (47) Additional services price list is also attached for installation type service with 0% discount
- (48) 0% see attached price list
- (49) Bleachers only
- (50) Prepay and add freight for all manufactures
- (51) \$800 minimum charge for installation
- (52) All jobsite insurance requirements supplied by Kennico
- (53) Prices do not include any permits or associated fees, if applicable
- (54) \$300 minimum charge
- (55) We will require a \$3500.00 minimum equipment cost for us to provide installation services. There is no minimum required for supply of equipment only to be installed by others or district personnel.
- (56) Freight will be prepaid and added to each invoice. We will quote freight at the time of ordering so it can be added to any purchase order
- (57) Per man hour
- (58) Pricing is for the shade structure and fabric and includes drawing but these will not be certified as all jurisdictions don't necessarily require certifications or calculations. If calculations are required: ADD \$350.00 per structure. Per certified drawing by a registered PE ADD \$650.00 per structure.

*Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.*