F L ORIEIDA H C U S E O F R EPRESENTATIVE S

CS/HB 883 201
1 A bill to ke entitled
2 An act relating to public lodging establishments; amending
3 s. 5092.032, F.S$.; conforming provisions to changes made by
4 the act; providing that vacation rentals are residential
5 property for purposes of provisions related to the
6 treatment of such properties; amending ss. 509.2Z1 and
7 509.241, F.5.; conforming provisions to changes made by
g the act; amending s. 509.242, F.S.; providing that public
9 lodging establishments formeriy classified as resort
10 condominiums and resort dwellings are classified as
11 vacation rentals; defining the term "vacation rental™;
12 amending s. 509.251, F.3.; conforming provisions to
13 changes made by the act; amending s. 509%.23%1, F.S.;
14 revising membership of the advisory council of the
15 Division of Hotels and Restaurants of the Department of
16 Business and Professional Regulation; regquiring the
17 Florida Vacation Rental Managers Assoclation to designate
18 a member to serve on the advisory council; amending ss.
19 381.008 and 386.203, F.S.; ceonforming provisions to
20 changes made by the act; providing an effective date.
21
22| Be It Enacted by the Legiélature of the State of Florida:
23
24 Section 1. Paragraph (a) of subsection (2) and subsection
25 (7) of section 509.032, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:
26 509.032 Duties.—
277 {2) INSPECTION OF PREMISES.—
28 {a) The division has responsibility and jurisdiction for
Page 10of 9

CODING: Words siricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0883-01-c1



F L ORIDA H O U § E O F R EPREJSENTATI V E 8§

CS/HB 883 2011

29| all inspections required by this chapter. The division has

30| responsibility for gquality assurance. Each licensed

31 establiishment shall be inspected at least biannually, except for
32 transient and nontransient apartments, which shall be inspected
33 at least annually, and shall be inspected at such other times as
34| the division determines is necessary to ensure the public's

35 health, safety, and welfare. The division shall establish a

36 system to determine inspecticn frequency. Public lodging units

37 classified as vacation rentals resort condeominiums or resers

38| dwellimgs are not subject to this requirements but shall be made
3%| available to the division upon request. If, during the

40 inspection of a public lodging estaklishment classified for

41 renting to transient or nontransient tTenants, an inspector

42 identifies vulnerable adults who appear to be victims of

43 neglect, as defined in s. 415.102, or, in the case of a building
44 that is ncot equipped with automatic sprinkier systems, tenants
45 or clients who may be unable tc self-preserve in an emergency,
467 the division shall convene meetings with the following agencies
47 as appropriate to the individual situation: the Department of

48 Health, the Department of klderly Affairs, the area agency on

49| aging, the lcocal fire marshal, the landlord and affected tenants
50| and clients, and other reilevant organizations, to develop a plan
51| which improves the prospects for safety of affected residents

52| and, if necessary, identifies alternative living arrangements

53 such as facilities licensed under part II of chapter 400 or

54 under chapter 429.

55 (7) PREEMPTION AUTHORITY.—
56 (a) The regulation of public lodging establishments and
Page 2 of 9

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0883-01-c1



FLORIDA H O U 8 E C F REPRESENTATIVES

CS/HB 883 2011

57 public food service establishments, including, but not limited
58| to,  the inspection of public ledging estaklishments and public
59 foed service establishments for compliance with the sanitation
60 standards adopted under this section, and the regulation of food
61| safety protection standards for required training and testing of
62 food service establishment personnel are preempted to the state.
63| This paragraph sutbseetisn does not preempt the authority cf a

64 local government or local enforcement district to conduct

65| inspections of public lodging and public food service

66} establishments for compliance with the Fleorida Building Code and
67| the Florida Fire Prevention Code, pursuant to ss. 553.80 and

68| 633.022.

69 {b) Notwithstanding any local law, ordinange, or

70 regulation, a vacation rental, as described in s. 509.242{(1; (c},

71 is deemed residential property and mav not be prohibited or

72 treated differently than cther residential property based solely

73 on its classification, use, or occupancy.

74 Section 2. Subsection (9) of section 509.221, Florida
75 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

76 509.221 Sanitary regulations.—

77 {9)  Bubsections (2), (5), and (6) do not apply to any

78 facility or unit classified as a vacation rental or resert

791 esrndeminivmr nontransient apartment+—er—reseort—dwelling as

80 described in s. 509.242{1) (¢) and+ (d)+—ard—Fat.
81 Section 3. Subsectiocon (2) of section 508.241, Florida

82 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

83 509.241 Licenses required; exceptions.—
84 {2) APPLICATICN FOR LICENSE.—Each person who plans to open
Page 3 of 9

CODING: Words strickes are deletions; words undetlined are additions.
hb0883-01-c1



F L ORIDA H O U S8 E O F REPRESENTATI V E S

85
86
87
88
89
90
91
92
93
24
95
96
87
98
93
100
101
102
103
104
105
106
107
108
109
110
111
112

CS/HB 883 2011

a public lodging establishment or & public food service
establishment shall apply for and receive a license from the
division prior to the commencement of coperation. A condominium

association, as defined in s. 718.103, which does not. own any

units classified as vacation rentals resert-condomimiums under

s. 509.242(1) {c} is shatt not be regquired tec apply for or
receive a public lodging establishment license.

Section 4. Subsection (1) of secticn 509.242, Florida
Statutes, is amended Lo read:

509.242 Public lodging establishments; classifications.—

{1) A public lodging establishment shall be classified as
a hotel, motel, =xesert—econdominivm, nontransient apartment,
transient apartment, roominghouse, bed and breakfast inn, or

vacation rental xresert—dweiting 1if the establishment satisfies

the following criteria:

(a) Hotel.—A hotel is any public lodging establishment
containing sleeping room accommedations for 25 or more guests
and providing the services generally provided by a hotel and
recognized as a hotel in the community in which it is situated
or by the industry.

(b) Motel.—A motel is any public ledging establishment
which offers rental units with an exit to the cutside of each
rental unit, daily or weekly rates, offstreet parking for each
unit, a central office on the property with specified hours of
operation, a bathroom or connecting bathroom for each rental
unit, and at least six rental units, and which is recognized as
a motel in the community in which it is situated or by the

industry.

Page 4 of 9

CODING: Words strickes are deletions; words undetlined are additions.
hb0883-01-¢1




FLORIDA H O U 8 E O F R EPRESENTATI

113
114
115
116
117
118
119
120
121
122
123
124
125
126
127
128
129
130
131
132
133
134
135
136
137
138
139
140

vV E S

CS/HB 883 2011

{c) Vacation rental Resert econdewminium.—A vacation rental

resort——econdominium is any unit or group of units in a

condominium, cooperative, or timeshare plan or any individually

or collectively owned single—-family, two-family, or four-family

house or dwelling unit that is also a transient public lodging

establishment whieh is5 rerpted wmore thapthree timesin o

apartment or roominghouse is a building or complex of buildings
in which 75 percent or more of the units are available for rent
to nontransient tenants.

(e) Transient apartment or roominghouse.—A transient
apartment or roominghouse is a building or complex of buildings
in which more than 25 percent of the units are advertised or
held cut to the public as available for transient occupancy.

{f) Reominghouse.—& roominghouse is any public ledging
establishment that may not be classified as a hotel, motel,

resert ceondeminitmy nontransient apartment, bed and breakfast

(d) Nontransient apartment or roominghouse.—A nontransient

inn, vacation rental, cor transient apartment under this section.

A roominghouse includes, but is not limited to, a boardinghouse.

Loed Reoc otz g1 1 9 o SN NG Y S RO P B B W S PN L - . I L ! EE T e I
‘\3] ES = [ L ) \AVV\,_L_LALll‘j, Fary =) = [ ATV _L,,.L_.Lll\j J AT .A_J.J.\A.LV.L\A\.I.(—I._I_.L_Y
f I !
£ PIECSNE S e S U NP e =N S B SN S e B PSRN B A SO T N R SR Y - WS N TS P-E U PN M 2o
e | - J N T S k,A\lVL...L,J..A_J.J.\j [N SN P A ey fr g \_A.VH\_—ALALALLJ.\j 1 3 e gy Wil 1l aT ] JF SN R PR NI R 1) § 4 g
I AN ) FE U (DU, ISP, [ IO - L R [P £ Temeoem o )
LAY LS Y = IS B —- J L= Ty e . R i i _y o - L L_) E=e== AT — == == CITETT =F
days—er—t——eatendar month—whichever istess,—or—which—+5

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.

hb0883-01-¢1



F L ORI DA H O U & E O F R EPRESENTATI VE S

CS/HB 883 201
141} advertised or held out—to—the publie as o place regutarty rented

142 for—pericds—of—Jess—than-30-days——e=—1ecalendarmenth,—whichever
143 ZEs—2tess~

144 {g)+#)> Bed and brezkfast inn.—A bed and breakfast inn is a
145 family home structure, with no more than 15 sleeping rcoms,

146| which has been modified to serve as a transient public lodging
147| establishment, which provides the accommodation and meal

148| services generally offered by a bed and breakfast inn, and which
149 is recognized as a bed and breakfast inn in the community in

150 which it is situated or by the hospitality industry.

151 Section 5. Subsection (1) of section 509.251, Florida

i5h2 Statutes, is amended to read:

153 509.251 Tlicense fees.—

154 (1) The division shall adopt, by rule, a schedule of fees
155| to be paid by each public lodging establishment as a

156| prerequisite to issuance or renewal of a license. Such fees

157| shall be based on the number of rental units in the

158| establishment. The aggregate fee per establishment charged any
159| public lodging establishment shall not exceed $1,000; however,
160 the fees described in paragraphs (a) and (b) may not be included
161| as part of the aggregate fee subject to this cap. Vacation

162| rental Resert-cendemimiuvm units within separate buildings or at

163 separate locations but managed by one licensed agent may be
164| combined in a single license application, and the division shall

165| charge a license fee as 1if all units in the application are in a

166| single licensed establishment. Resert—dwelling—uonits—may P

167

EEN T Y

I I o o a
A [ S [ Ay [y 4 5 Ry {0 0% 0 O

Ep—
i —y L

its— The fee

|.,_l

168 schedule shall reguire an establishment which applies for an
Page 6 of 9

CODING: Words stricker are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0883-01-¢1



FL ORI DA H O U S E C F REPREZSENTATI VE S

CS/HB 883 2011

169] 1dinitial license to pay the full license fee if application is
170! made during the annual renewal period or more than & months

171y prior to the next such renewal period and one-half of the fee if
172 application 1s made & months or less prior to such pericd. The
173 fee schedule shall include fees ccllected for the purpose of

174 funding the Hospitality Education Program, pursuant to s.

175 509.302, which are payable in full for each application

176| regardless of when the application is submitted.

177 {a) Upon making initial application or an application for
178 change of ownership, the applicant shall pay tc the division a
179 fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $50, in addition to any
180 other fees required by law, which shall cover all costs

181| associated with initiating regulation of the establishment.

182 (b)) A license renewal filed with the division within 30
183| days after the expiration date shall be accompanied by a

184 delinguent fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $50, in

185| addition to the renewal fee and any other fees required by law.
186 A license renewal filed with the division more.than 30 but not
187 more than 60 days after the expiration date shall be accompanied
188| by a delinguent fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $100,
189 in addition to the renewal fee and any other fees required by
190 law.

191 Section 6. Subsection (1} of section 509%.291, Florida

192 Statutes, 1is amended to read:

193 509.29%1 Advisory council.—
194 (1) There is created a 10-member advisory council.
195 (a) The Secretary of Business and Professional Regulation

196} shall appoint six severn voting members teo the advisory council.

Page 7 of 9

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0883-01-¢1



FLORIDA H O U § E O F R EPREGSENTATIHIV E S

CS/HB 883 2011

197| Each member appointed by the secretary must be an operator of an
198 establishment licensed under this chapter and shall represent
199| the industries regulated by the division, except that one member
200 appointed by the secretary must be a layperson representing the
201 general public and ons member must be a hospitality education
202| administrator from an institution of higher education of this
203 state. Such members of the council shall serve staggered terms
204 -of 4 years.

205 () The Flerida Restaurant and Ledging Association shall
206| designate one representative te serve as a voting member of Che

207 council. The Florida Vacation Rental Managers Association shall

208| designate one representative to serve as a voting member of the

209! council. The Flerida Apartment Association and the Florida

210| Association of Realtors shall each designate one representative
211| to serve as a voting member of the council.

212 (c) Any member who fails to attend three consecutive

213| council meetings without good cause may be removed from the

214 council by the secretary.

215 Section 7. Paragraph (c) of subsecticn (8) of section

216 381.008, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

217 381.008 Definitions of terms used in ss. 381.008-

218| 381.00897.—As used in ss. 381.008-381.00897, the following words
219t and phrases mean:

220 (8) "Residential migrant housing"—A building, structure,
221 mchile home, barracks, or dormitory, and any combination thereof
222| on adjacent property which is under the same ownership,

223} management, or contreol, and the land appertaining theretc, that

224 is rented or reserved for occupancy by five or more seasonal or

Page 8 of 9

CODING: Words siricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0883-01-c1



F L CRI DA H O U s E o F REPRESENTATIV E S

CS/HB 883 2011

225| migrant farmworkers, except:

226 (c) A hotely or motel, er—resert condemintumy as described
227| <defined in chapter 509, that is furnished for transient

228 OCCUPAancy.

229 Section 8. Subsection {4) of section 386.203, Florida

230 Statutes, is amended to read:

231 386.203 Definitions.—As used in this part:

2372 {4) T"Designated smoking guest rooms at public lodging

233 establishments"” means the sleeping rooms and directly associated
234 private areas, such as bathrooms, living rooms, and kitchen

235 areas, if any, rented to guests for their exclusive transient
23€| occupancy in public lodging establishments, including hotels,

237 motels, vacation rentals resort—eceondeminiums, transient

238| apartments, transient lodging establishments, rooming houses,

239| boarding houses, reseri—dwellingsy bed and breakfast inns, and
240| the like; and designated by the person or persons having

241} management authority over such public lodging establishment as
242 rooms in which smoking may be permitted.

243 Section 9. This act shall take effect July 1, 2011.

Page 9 of 9

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.
hb0883-01-c1



HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES STAFF ANALYSIS

BILL #: CS/HB 883  Public Lodging Establishments
SPONSOR({S): Business & Consumer Affairs Subcommittee, Horner
TIED BILLS: IDEN./SIM. BILLS: SB 476
REFERENCE ACTION ANALYST STAFF DIRECTOR or
BUDGET/POLICY CHIEF
1) Business & Consumer Affairs Subcommittee 14Y,0N, As CS Morton Creamer
2) Government Operations Appropriations Topp Topp

Subcommittee

3) Economic Affairs Committee

SUMMARY ANALYSIS

The bill combines the classifications in chapter 509, F.S., of resort condominiums and resort dwellings as
‘vacation rentals.’” ‘Vacation Rental' is defined as “any unit or group of units in a condominium, cooperative, or
timeshare plan or any individually or collectively owned single-famity, two-family, three-family, or four-family
dwelling house or dwelling unit that is also a fransient public lodging establishment.”

The bill provides that vacation rentals are deemed residential property and prohibits local governments from
prohibiting vacation rentals or treating them differently from other residential property based on their
classification, use, or occupancy. This would remove authority for local governments to ban or restrict vacation
rentals.

The bill also revises the membership of the advisory council for the Division of Hotels and Restaurant of the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation (DBPR).

The bill has no fiscal impact.

The bill provides an effective date of July 1, 2011.

This document does not reflect the intent or official position of the bill sponsor or House of Representatives.
STORAGE NAME: h0883a.GOAS
DATE: 3/21/2011



FULL ANALYSIS
I. SUBSTANTIVE ANALYSIS

A. EFFECT OF PROPOSED CHANGES:
Current Situation

Vacation rentals are propetrties generally designed for residential purposes, such as single- and multi-
family homes which are rented out to tourists on vacation. In Florida, they are divided into two main
categories: resort condominiums and resort dwellings and are regulated as transient public lodging
establishments.

Public lodging establishments are overseen by the Division of Hotels and Restaurants within the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation pursuant to chapter 509, F.S. Regulation of
public lodging establishments is pre-empied to the state.

The chapter divides public lodging establishments first by the length of time they are rented, and then
by their use.

Occupancy is ‘transient’ if the parties intend it to be temporary. If the unit is not the guest’s primary
residence, there is a rebuttable presumption that occupancy is fransient. Likewise, occupancy is
nontransient if the operator intends the unit to be the guest's primary residence.

Public lodging establishments that are rented more than three times a year for periods of less than a
month are deemed transient. Nontransient public lodging establishments are rented for periods of more
than a month. If an establishment is advertised for rent, it is also considered a public lodging
establishment and classified as transient or nontransient based on the advertised rental term.

Public lodging establishments are further classified based on use, as follows:

Hotel: Accommodations for 25 or more guests and provides services
generally provided by a hotel and recognized as such by the
community or industry {i.e. Hilton).

Motel: At least six rental units with an exit to outside, off-street parking, and a
bathroom, onsite cenfral office, which is recognized as a motel in the
community or the industry (i.e. Motel 6)

Bed and breakfast inn: Modified family home providing accommeodation and meal services
generally offered by a bed and breakfast inn, and recognized as such
in the community or the hospitality industry.

Nontransient apartment  Rental accommodations intended to be used as primary residences.

or roominghouse: (75 percent or more nontransient).

Transient apartment or  Rental accommodations with a substantial portion of units held for
roominghouse: transient guests {more than 25 percent transient}.

Roominghouse: Any public lodging establishment not otherwise classified.

Resort dwelling: Individually or collectively owned one-family, two-family, three-family, or

four-family dwelling house or dwelling unit which is rented more than
three times in a calendar year for periods of less than 1 month or which
is advertised as such.

Resort condominium:  Any unit or group of units in a condominium, cooperative, or timeshare
plan which is rented more than three times a year for periods of less
than 1 month or is advertised as such.

STORAGE NAME: h03883a.GOAS PAGE: 2
DATE: 3/21/2011



All public lodging establishments are licensed, but the degree of inspections and the relevant fees differ
based on the type of establishment.

The Division inspects resort condominiums and resort dwellings on receiving complaints only. The
Division receives about three complaints of unlicensed resort condominiums or resort dwellings each
year.

For resort dwellings and resort condominiums, licenses are issued under three categories:
1. Single — Individual owner, may include multiple units
2. Group — Licensed agent for all units rented
3. Collective — Licensed agent for up to 75 units separately located throughout a district

Operators of resort dwellings and resort condominiums pay a base fee of $150, a Hospitality Education
Program fee of $10 and a unit fee. Unit fees on single and group licensees are incremental based on
the total number of rental units. Collective licensees pay $10 per unit.

The total fees licensees pay range from $170-$350 for single and group licensees, and are capped for
coliective licensees at $910.

The regulation of pubiic lodging establishments is preempted to the state. Local governments can
conduct inspections of public lodging establishments for compliance with the Florida Building Code and
the Florida Fire Prevention Code. However, some local governments have been prohibiting or
restricting transient resort condominiums and dwellings by ordinance.

Section 509.291, F.S., establishes an advisory council currently consists of 10 members. The Secretary
of the DBPR appoints seven members, with the remaining three being statutory members representing
the Florida Restaurant and Lodging Association, the Florida Apartment Association, and the Florida
Association of Realtors.

The advisory council does not currently have a representative specifically from the resort condominium
or resort dwelling industry. However, the Division reports that the council does have appointed
members who work for licensees that own resort condominium properties, in addition to other types of
public lodging or public food service establishments.

Proposed Changes

The bill reclassifies resort condominiums and resort dwellings as ‘vacation rentals,” a new classification
combining the two previous classes. ‘Vacation Rental is defined as “any unit or group of units in a
condominium, cooperative, or timeshare plan or any individually or collectively owned single-family,
two-family, three-family, or four-family dwelling house or dwelling unit that is also a transient public
lodging establishment.”

The bill provides that vacation rentals are deemed residential property and prohibits local governments
from prohibiting vacation rentals or treating them differently from other residential property based on
their classification, use, or occupancy. This would remove authority for local governments to ban or
restrict vacation rentals. ‘

! See, e.g., Kim Hackett, “Property owners fight with Venice again on rental ban,” Sarasota Herald Tribune
(February 8, 2011), available at http;//www.heraldtribune.com/article/201 10208/ARTICTE/102081021; Scott
Wyman, “Possible Fort Lauderdale Restrictions On Short-Term Rentals Draw Opposition,” Sun-Sentinel
(February 24, 2011), available at http://weblogs.sun-

sentinel.com/news/politics/broward/blog/201 1/02/possible fort_landerdale restr.html.
STORAGE NAME: h0883a.GOAS PAGE: 3
DATE: 3/21/2011




The bill revises the membership of the advisory council for the Division of Hotels and Restaurant by
reducing the number of members appointed by the Secretary of DBPR from seven to six and adding
one representative from the Fiorida Vacation Rental Managers Association.

The bill provides an effective date of July 1, 2011.

B. SECTION DIRECTORY:

Section 1 amends s. 509.032, F.S., to provide that vacation rentals are residential property for
purposes of provisions related to the treatment of such properties.

Section 2 amends s. 509.221, F.S., to conform changes by the bill related to facilities or units classified
as vacation rentals.

Section 3 amends s. 509.241, F.S., to conform to changes by the bill.

Section 4 amends s. 509.242, F.S., to provide that public lodging establishments formerly classified as
resort condominiums and resort dwellings are classified as vacation rentals and defines that term.

Section 5 amends s. 509.251, F.S., to conform to changes by the bill.

Section 6 amends s. 509.291, F.S., to increase the membership of an advisory council and provide for
the Florida Vacation Rental Managers Association to appoint a member.

Section 7 amends ss. 381.008, F.S., to conform to changes by the bill.
Section 8 amends s. 386.203, F.S., to conform to changes to definitions by the bill.
Section 9 provides an effective date.

Il. FISCAL ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT
A. FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE GOVERNMENT:

1. Revenues:

None.

2. Expenditures:

None.
B. FISCAL IMPACT ON LOCAL GOVERNMENTS:

1. Revenues:

None.

2. Expenditures:

None.

C. DIRECT ECONOMIC IMPACT ON PRIVATE SECTOR:
None.

D. FISCAL COMMENTS:
None.

STORAGE NAME: h0883a.GOAS PAGE: 4
DATE: 3/21/2011



. COMMENTS
A. CONSTITUTIONAL ISSUES:

1. Applicability of Municipality/County Mandates Provision:

Mot applicable. The bill does not appear 1o require counties or municipalities to spend funds or fake
an action requiring the expenditure of funds; reduce the authority that the counties or municipalities
have to raise revenue in the aggregate; or reduce the percentage of a state tax shared with
counties or municipalities.

2. Other:

None.

B. RULE-MAKING AUTHORITY:

None.

C. DRAFTING ISSUES OR OTHER COMMENTS:

None.

IV. AMENDMENTS/ COMMITTEE SUBSTITUTE CHANGES

STORAGE NAME: h0883a.GOAS PAGE: 5
DATE: 3/21/2011



HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES STAFF ANALYSIS

BILL #: CS/HB 883 Public Lodging Establishments
SPONSOR(S): Business & Consumer Affairs Subcommittee, Horner
TIED BILLS: IDEN./SIM. BILLS: SB 476
REFERENCE ACTION ANALYST STAFF DIRECTOR or
BUDGET/POLICY CHIEF
1)} Business & Consumer Affairs Subcommitiee 14Y,0N,As CS Morton Creamer

2) Government Operations Appropriations
Subcommittee

3) Economic Affairs Committee

SUMMARY ANALYSIS

The bill combines resort condominiums and resort dwellings into a new classification of public lodging
establishment, ‘vacation rentals” and prohibits local governments from treating vacation rentals differently than
residential property. The bill also revises the membership of the advisory council for the Division of Hotels and
Restaurant of the Department of Business and Professional Regulation.

The bill has no fiscal impact.

The bill provides an effective date of July 1, 2011.

This document does not reflect the intent or official position of the bill sponsor or House of Representatives.
STORAGE NAME: h0883.BCAS
DATE: 3/16/2011



FULL ANALYSIS
I. SUBSTANTIVE ANALYSIS

A. EFFECT OF PROPOSED CHANGES:

Current Situation

Vacation rentals are properties generally designed for residential purposes, such as single- and multi-
family homes which are rented out to tourists on vacation. In Florida, they are divided into two main
categories: resort condominiums and resort dwellings and are regulated as transient public lodging
establishments.

Public lodging establishments are overseen by the Division of Hotels and Restaurants within the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation pursuant to chapter 509, F.S. Regulation of
public lodging establishments is pre-empted to the state.

The chapter divides public lodging establishments first by the length of time they are rented, and then
by their use.

Occupancy is ‘transient’ if the parties intend it to be temporary. If the unit is not the guest’s primary
residence, there is a rebuttable presumption that occupancy is transient. Likewise, occupancy is
nontransient if the operator intends the unit to be the guest’s primary residence.

Public lodging establishments that are rented more than three times a year for periods of less than a
month are deemed transient. Nontransient public lodging establishments are rented for periods of more
than a month. If an establishment is advertised for rent, it is also considered a public lodging
establishment and classified as transient or nontransient based on the advertised rental term.

Public lodging establishments are further classified based on use, as follows:

Hotel: Accommodations for 25 or more guests and provides services
generally provided by a hotel and recognized as such by the
community or industry (i.e. Hilton).

Motel: At least six rental units with an exit to outside, offstreet parking, and a
bathroom, onsite central office, which is recognized as a motel in the
community or the industry (i.e. Motel 6)

Bed and breakfast inn: Maodified family home providing accommodation and meal services
generally offered by a bed and breakfast inn, and recognized as such
in the community or the hospitality industry.

Nontransient apartment  Rental accommodations intended to be used as primary residences.

or roominghouse: (75 percent or more nontransient).

Transient apartment or ~ Rental accommodations with a substantial portion of units heid for
roominghouse: transient guests (more than 25 percent transient).

Roominghouse: Any public lodging establishment not otherwise classified.

Resort dwelling: individually or collectively owned one-family, two-family, three-family, or

four-family dwelling house or dwelling unit which is rented more than
three times in a calendar year for pericds of less than 1 month or which
is advertised as such.

Resort condominium:  Any unit or group of units in a condominium, cooperative, or timeshare
plan which is rented more than three times a year for periods of less
than 1 month or is advertised as such.

STORAGE NAME: h0883.BCAS PAGE: 2
DATE: 3/16/2011



All public lodging establishments are licensed, but the degree of inspections and the relevant fees differ
based on the type of establishment.

The Division inspects resort condominiums and resort dwellings on receiving compiaints only. The
Division receives about three complaints of unlicensed resort condominiums or resort dwellings each
year.

For resort dwellings and resort condominiums, licenses are issued under three categories:
1. Single - Individual owner, may include multiple units
2. Group — Licensed agent for all units rented
3. Collective — Licensed agent for up to 75 units separately located throughout a district

QOperators of resort dwellings and resort condominiums pay a base fee of $150, a Hospitality Education
Program fee of $10 and a unit fee. Unit fees on singie and group licensees are incremental based on
the total number of rental units. Collective licensees pay $10 per unit.

The total fees licensees pay range from $170-$350 for single and group licensees, and are capped for
collective licensees at $910.

Section 509.291, F.S., establishes an advisory council currently consists of 10 members. The Secretary
of the DBPR appoints seven members, with the remaining three being statutory members representing
the Florida Restaurant and Lodging Association, the Florida Apartment Association, and the Florida
Association of Realtors.

The advisory council does not currently have a representative specifically from the resort condominium
or resort dwelling industry. However, the Division reports that the council does have appointed
members who work for licensees that own resort condominium properties, in addition to other types of
public lodging or public food service establishments.

Proposed Changes

The bill reclassifies resort condominiums and resort dwellings as ‘vacation rentals,’” a new classification
combining the two previous classes. ‘Vacation Rental’ is defined as “any unit or group of units in a
condominium, cooperative, or timeshare plan or any individually or collectively owned single-family,
two-family, three-family, or four-family dwelling house or dwelling unit that is also a transient public
lodging establishment.”

The bill provides that vacation rentals are deemed residential property and prohibits local governments
from prohibiting vacation rentals or treating them differently from other residential property based on
their classification, use, or occupancy.

The bill revises the membership of the advisory council for the Division of Hotels and Restaurant of the
Department of Business and Professional Regulation by reducing the number of members appointed
by the Secretary of DBPR from seven to six and add cne representative from the Florida Vacation
Rental Managers Association to the division’s advisory council.

The bill provides an effective date of July 1, 2011.

B. SECTION DIRECTORY:

Section 1 amends s. 509.032, F.S., to provide that vacation rentals are residential property for
purposes of provisions related to the treatment of such properties.

Section 2 amends s. 509.241, F.S., to conform to changes by the bill.

Section 3 amends s. 509.242, F.S., to provide that pubiic lodging establishments formerly classified as
resort condominiums and resort dwellings are classified as vacation rentals and defines that term.

Section 4 amends s. 509.251, F.S., to conform to changes by the bill.

STORAGE NAME: h0883.BCAS PAGE: 3
DATE: 3/16/2011



Section 5 amends s. 509.291, F.S., to increase the membership of an advisory council and provide for
the Florida Vacation Rental Managers Association to appoint a member.

Section 6 amends ss. 381.008, F.S., to conform to changes by the bill.
Section 7 amends s. 386.203, F.S., to conform to changes by the bill.

Section 8 provides an effective date.

II. FISCAL ANALYSIS & ECONOMIC IMPACT STATEMENT
A. FISCAL IMPACT ON STATE GOVERNMENT:

1. Revenues:
None.

2. Expenditures:

None.
B. FISCAL IMPACT ON LOCAL GOVERNMENTS:

1. Revenues:

None.

2. Expenditures:

None.

C. DIRECT ECONOMIC IMPACT ON PRIVATE SECTOR:
None.

D. FISCAL COMMENTS:
None,

. COMMENTS
A. CONSTITUTIONAL ISSUES:

1. Applicability of Municipality/County Mandates Provision:

Not applicable. The bill does not appear to require counties or municipalities to spend funds or take
an action requiring the expenditure of funds; reduce the authority that the counties or municipalities
have to raise revenue in the aggregate; or reduce the percentage of a state tax shared with
counties or municipalities.

2. Other:

None.

B. RULE-MAKING AUTHORITY:

None.

C. DRAFTING ISSUES OR OTHER COMMENTS:

STORAGE NAME: h0883.BCAS PAGE: 4
DATE: 3/16/2011



None.

IV. AMENDMENTS/ COMMITTEE SUBSTITUTE CHANGES

None.

STORAGE NAME: h0883.BCAS PAGE: 5
DATE: 3/16/2011



CS/HB 883 - Public Lodging Establishments Page 1 of 1

CS/HB 883 - Public Lodging Establishments

GENERAL BIEL by Business & Consumer Affairs Subcommittee and Horner

Public Lodging Establishiments: Provides that vacation rentals are residential property for purposes of provision related to treatment of such properties; provides
that public lodging establishments formeriy classified as resort condominiums & resort dwellings are classified as vacation rentals; defines term "vacation rental”;

revises membership of advisory council of Division of Hotels & Restaurants of DBPR; requires Florida Vacation Rental Managers Association to designate member to
setve on advisory council.

Effective Date: July 1, 2011

Last Event: 1st Reading on Friday, March 18, 2011 6:11 PM

Referred Commitiees and {ommittee Actinns:
- Business & Consumer Affairs Subcommittee
On agenda for: 03/15/11 8:00 AM Hotice
Favorable With Committee Substitute (firal action) See Yotes
- Government Operations Apprapriations Subcommittee
On agenda for: 03722711 12:00 PM Notice

- Economic Affairs Committee

Related Bills:

Bill # Subject | Retationship
SB 476 Public Lodging Establishments !Similar
Bil Text:

Committee Substitute 1
Original Fiied Version

Staff Analysis:

Chamber Committee

House Govemment Operations Appropriations Subcommittee 3/24/2011 B:21:42 PM
Hause Businass & Consumer Affairs Subcommitiee 3/16/2011 7:47:38 PM

House Business & Consumer Affairs Subcommittes 3/11/2011 5:17:06 PM

Vote History:

{na votes recarded)

il History:

Event Time Member Committee .

1st Reading Friday, March 18, 2011 6:11 PM

Added to Gavernment Operations Appropriations Subcommittee Friday, March 18, 2011 4:20 PM Government Operations Appropriations

agenda Subcommittee

Now in Govemnment Operatichs Appropriations Subcommitiee Friday, March 48, 2011 2:58 PM. Government Operations Appropriations
Subcommittee

Referred to Economic Affairs Cammittee Friday, March 18, 2011 2:58 PM Economic Affairs Commitiee

Referred to Government Operations Appropriations Subcommittee Friday, March 18, 2011 2:58 PM Government Operations Appropriations
Subgommitiee %%

C5 Filed Thursday, March 17, 261 8:06 AM Ei

Laid on Table under Rule 7.1%(a) Thursday, March 17, 2011 8:06 AM ?E

Reported out of Business & Consumer Affairs Subcommittee Wednesday, March 16, 2011 7:45 PM Business & Consumer Affairs Wé

Subcommittee

Favorable with C5 by Business & Consumer Affairs Subcommittee Tuesday, March 15, 2011 11:00 AM Business & Consumer Affairs &
Subcommittee %

PCS added to Business & Censumer Affairs Subcommittee agenda Friday, March 11, 2011 4:16 PM Business & Cohsumer Affairs ﬁ»
Subcommittee %

1st Reading Tuesday, March 08, 2011 10:24 PM ?

Mow in Business & Consumer Affairs Subcommittee Thursday, March 03, 2011 9:4% AM Business & Consurmner Affairs %
Subcommittee [

Referted to Economic Affairs Committee Thursday, March 03, 2011 9:49 AM Economic Affairs Comrrittee

Referred to Government Operations Appropriations Subcommitiee Thursday, March 03, 2011 9:49 AM Government Operations Approprations
Subcommittee

Referred to Business & Consumer Affairs Subcommittee Thursday, March 03, 2011 9:49 AM Business & Consumer Affairs

Subcommittee

http://www.myfloridahouse.gov/sections/bills/billsdetail .aspx?Billld=45914 3/22/2011



Florida Senate - 2011 _ SB 476

By Senator Evers

2-00687-11 2011476

W =] oYy s W N

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
13
1e
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

CODING: Words steicken are deletions;

A bill to ke entitled
An act relating to public lodging establishments;
amending s. 509.013, F.S.; revising definitions;
amending s. 509.032, F.S.; conforming provisions to
changes made by the act; providing that vacation
rentals are residential property for purposes of
provisions related to the treatment of such
properties; amending s. 509.101, F.S.; requiring that
the cperator of a vacation rental retain any advance
payment or deposit made for the vacation rental until
the occupancy begins or is cancelled; amending s.
509.221, F.5.; clarifyving that wvacation rentals are
exempt from certain sanitary rules; amending s.
509.241, F.S.; clarifying an exemption from licensure
for condeminium associations that do not own vacation
rentals; amending s. 509.242, F.S.; providing that
public lodging establishments formerly classified as
resort condominiums and resort dwellings are
classified as wvacation rentals and defining the term
“vacation rental”; amending s. 509.251, ¥.S., relating
to license fees; conforming provislons to changes made
by the act; deleting an obsclete provision; amending
s. 509.291, F.S8.; increasing the membership of an
adviscory council to the Division of Hotels and
Reskaurants of the Department of Business and
Professional Regulation; providing for the lorida
Vacation Rental Managers Associlation te appoint a
member to the advisory council; providing an effective

date.

Page 1 of 10

words underlined are additions.




30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58

Floxrida Senate - 2011 SB 476

2-00687-11 2011476

Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:

Section 1. Paragraph (a) of subsection (4) of section
508.013, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

509.013 Definitions.—As used in this chapter, the term:

{(4) (a) “Pubklic lodging establishment” includes a transient
public lodging establishment as defined in subparagraph 1. and a
nontransient public lodging establishment as defined in
subparagraph 2.

1. “Transient public lodging establishment” means any unit,
group of units, dwelling, building, or group of buildings within
a single complex of buildings which is rented to guests more

than three times in a calendar yvear for a period of less than

181 PN R = £ Jeame +Hnae 20 da g PP I PN [N LU N N S [9e SN SN Eo
P Trot OS5t —= y (5 S e ) o B I 25 S SR O A e o e

+s5—dess+ or which is advertised or held ocut tc the public as a

place regularly rented to guests.
2. “Nontransient public leodging establishment” means any
unit, group of units, dwelling, building, or group of buildings

within a single complex of buildings which is rented to guests

for periods of at least 181 38 days ezl —<calendar menth;
whiehever—ds—Jtess+ or which is advertised cor held out to the

public as a place regularly rented to guests for periods of at

least 181 36 days erl-—ecalendarmonth.

License classifications of public lodging establishments, and
the definitions therefor, are set out in s. 509.242. For the
purpcse of licensure, the term does not include condominium

commen elements as defined in s. 718.103.

Page 2 of 10

CODING: Words sErieken are deletiocons; words underlined are additions.




59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
9
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
82
86
87

Florida Senate - 2011 SB 476

2-00687-11 2011476

Section 2. Paragraph (a) of subsection (Z) and subsection
(7} of section 509.032, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

509.032 Duties.—

{2) INSPECTION OF PREMISES.-—

(a) The division has responsibility and jurisdiction for
all inspections required by this chapter. The division has
responsibility for quality assurance. Bach licensed
establishment shall be inspected at least biannually, except for
transient and nontransient apartments, which shall be inspected
at least annually, and shall be inspected at such other times as
the division determines is necessary to ensure the public's
_health, safety, and welfare. The division shall establish a
system to determine inspection frequency. Public lodging units
classified as vacation rentals resert—econdominiums—or—¥Fesers
dwellings are not subject to this requirement, but shall be made

available to the division upon request. IL, during the
inspection of a public lodging establishment classified for
renting to tramsient or nontransient tenants, an inspector
identifies vulnerable adults who appear to be victims of
neglect, as defined in s. 415.102, or, in the case of a building
that is not eguipped with automatic sprinkler systems, tenants
or clients who may be unable to self-preserve in an emergency,
the division shall convene meetings with the following agencies
as appropriate to the individual situation: the Department of
Health, the Department of Elderly Affairs, the area agency on
aging, the lccal fire marshal, the landlord and affected tenants
and clients, and other relevant crganizations, to develop a plan
which improves the prospects for safety of affected residents

and, if necessary, identifies alternative living arrangements

Page 3 of 10
CODING: Words striecken are deletions; words underlined are additicns.




Florida Senate - 2011 SB 476

2-00687-11 2011476
88 such as facilities licensed under part II of chapter 400 or
89| under chapter 429.
29 {7) PREEMPTION AUTHORITY.—
91 {a) The regulation of public lodging establishments and
G2 public food service establishments, including, but not limited
93| to, the inspection of public lodging establishments and public
94| food service establishments for compliance with the sanitation
95| standards adopted under this section, and the regulation of food
96| safety protection standards for reguired training and testing of
57 food service establishment personnel are preempted to the state.
98| This subsection does not preempt the authority of a local
99| government or local enforcement district to conduct inspections
100| of public leodging and public food service establishments for
11| compliance with the Florida Building Code and the Florida Fire
102 Prevention Code, pursuant to ss. 553.80 and ©33.022.
1063 (b) Notwithstanding any other provision of law to the

104| coentrary, vacation rentals, as defined in s. 509.242(1) (¢), are

105 deemed residential property and may not be prohibited or treated

106| differently than other residential properties based solely on

107 their classification, use, or occupancy.

108 Section 3. Present subsection (3} of section 509.101,

109 Florida Statutes, 1s renumbered as subsection (4), and a new

110 subsection (3) is added to that section, to read:

111 509.101 Establishment rules; posting cf notice; food

112 gservice inspection report; maintenance of guest register; mobile
113| food dispensing vehicle registry.—

114 {(3) It is the duty of each operator of a vacation rental,

115 as defined in s. 509.242(1) (¢), to retain any advance payment or

116| deposit paid by a guest until the occupancy begins or is

Page 4 of 10
CODING: Words striekern are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2011 SB 476

2-00687-11 2011476

117 cancelled pursuant to any rental agreement or the operator’s

118 cancelilation rules.

119 Section 4. Subsection {9) of section 509.221, Florida

120 Statutes, is amended to read:

121 509.221 Sanitary regulations.—

122 (9} Subsections {2), (5}, and (&) do not apply to any
123| facility or unit classified as a vacation rental or resert
124| eendeminiumy; nontransient apartment, er—resort—dwelrling as
125| described in s. 509.242 (1)4el+—d+and—ter.

126 Section 5. Subsection (2) of section 509.241, Florida

127 Statutes, is amended to read:

128 509.241 Licenses required; exceptions.—

129 (2) APPLICATICN FOR LICENSE.—Each person who plans to open
130 a public lodging establishment or a pubklic food service

131| establishment shall apply for and receive a license from the
132| division prior tc the commencement of operation. A condominium
133 association, as defined in s. 718.103, which dces not own any
134| units classified as vacation rentals resert—condomiriums under
135 s. 509.242(1) (¢) is shatt not ke required to apply for or

136| receive a public lodging establishment license.

137 Section 6. Subsection (1) of section 509.242, Florida

138 Statutes, is amended to read:

138 509.242 Public lodging establishments; classifications.—
140 {1} A public lodging establishment shall be classified as &

141 hotel, motel, resert—econdeominiuwy; nontransient apartment,
142 transient apartment, roominghouse, bed and breakfast inn, or

143| wvacation rental resert—dwelling if the establishment satisfies

144| the following criteria:
145 (a) Hotel.—A hotel is any public lodging establishment

Page 5 of 10
CODING: Words strieken are deletions; words underlined are .additions.




l4e
147
148
149
150
151
152
153
154
155
156
157
158
158
160
lel
162
163
le4d
165
166
167
1e3
169
170
171
172
173
174

Florida Senate - 2011 SB 476

2-00687-11 2011476
containing sleeping room accommodations for 25 or more guests
and providing the services generally provided by a hotel and
recognized as a hotel in the community in which it is situated
or by the industry.

(b) Motel.—A motel is any public lodging establishment
which offers rental units with an exit to the outside of each
rental unit, daily or weekly rates, offstreet parking for each
unit, a central office on the property with specified hours of
operation, a bathroom or connecting bathroom for each rental

unit, and at least six rental units, and which is recognized as
a motel in the community in which it is situated or by the
industry.

(c) Vacation rental Resert—condeminiwm.—A vacation rental

is any unit or group of units in a condominium, coeperative, or

timeshare plan or any individually or collectively owned single-

family, two-family, three—family, or feour-family dwelling house

or dwelling unit that is also a transient public lodging

sz =
f * Y P
co thoan A0 o e 1 moleandoe mentl  whiebogeg e lece o
= == IITAOT vy \J.LA.—YLJ E= L g = e TICATT L T T iy L T i Vo D i —— - w3 T IS
whiah -deo aderaetdond oo lhald IS SN PO SR PE N I =S NP T E e
ver T T T i L% R - g werpn mpy up M JLNSRL W § - T wl A RS (S ) g t)l-LA-J-I-.I_ R = =1 tJ_LL:l\./k,

CODING: Words strieken are deletions;

wmenth—whichever is—Jdess<

(d) Nontransient apartment or roominghouse.—A nontransient
apartment cr roominghouse is a building or complex of buildings
in which 75 percent or more of the units are available for rent
to nontransient tenants.

(e} Transient apartment or roominghouse.—A transient

Page 6 of 10

words underlined are additions.



175
176
177
178
179
180
181
182
183
1384
185
186
187
188
189
190
191
192
193
194
195
19¢
197
198
19%
200
201
202
203

CODING: Words siricken are deletions;

Florida Senate - 2011 SB 476

2011476

2—00687-11
apartment or roominghouse is a building or complex of buildings
in which meore than 25 percent of the units are advertised or
held out to the public as available for transient occupancy.

(f) Roominghouse.—A roominghouse is any puklic lodging
establishment that may not be classified as a hotel, motel,

resort condominium, nontransient apartment, bed and breakfast

inn, or transient apartment under this section. A rocminghouse
includes, but is not limited to, a pkoardinghouse.

L B P R T M TSN X L | P2 o3 7 o E-L RPN St ot i I ¥ 1 Fornt ] oy an

- =2 [ g L _L_‘Y vy Ll A “TIE J_LA.,LLIAL,_LFY I Y J_(_I.J.I.I.A_.I._y ri S N g S — — J_(_LJ.L!._L_I._Y T =
EPEN T e I, IETI LI 70 i B IS, gy P Py M I ISP SRUp S SRty SN P LIPSO s BT e
[ N W R [ P 7 ) N \AVVL_._I_.I_.I.J.J.\j [ o v ) pwas Y KJ.VV\'J__L_LJ.J.EJ 2 I B A i, AL A b T i i - T - A EN N o -
f R NP SN ) SN NP I SN N B [N S ] CYS = B L ) £ _1 o s 2
CITOITT | S A I Sy LTI L IT [ [ TIONATT T )IL.LA.I_ = = t.l J S R e ) 1= it M vy Jn LS N i 2 e ~F

.

Ao re 3= | P L SR N o = N ) N T N L P S | o LY I o el o

\.A.G_L_Yb._) =g =y == LS 4% s LT Il LJ.L,l.L’ wWiT I TV - i i\ak)k), A |7AC I A S [

S PENECY SR | r e ey 12 + 1 PG o I | Ew] ] o e o] m o T g ae e e o T
GGV L N " A JLJ B LAy vy Or [ l_/ut)u_l__L [ =) (=N j&_J.LM R .L\,\ju.LuJ_.L [ L NSP A  wy =N
o g ey o~ T o g DY el mapm e T e ] e Al o g e B PR S Pl S TN
- - i./ o —r AT - [y LITITATT A AT = == LS A E . R w2y R J.I.L\JJ.J.\_J.J.’ vu LD £y —

(g)-H Bed and breakfast inn.—A bed and breakfast inn is a

family home structure, with no mere than 15 sleeping rooms,
which has been modified to serve as a transient public lodging
establishment, which provides the accommodation and meal
services generally offered by a bed and breakfast inn, and which
is recognized as a bed and breakfast inn in the community in
which it is situated or by the hospitality industry.

Section 7. Subsection (1) of section 509.251, Florida
Statutes,

509.251 License fees.—

(1) The division shall adopt,

1s amended to read:
by rule, a schedule of fees
to be paid by each public lodging establishment as a

prereguisite to issuance or renewal of a license. Such fees

Page 7 of 10

words underlined are additions.



Florida Senate - 2011 SB 476

2-00687-11 2011476
204 shall be based on the number of rental units in the
205| establishment. The aggregate fee per establishment charged any
206| public lodging estabklishment shall not exceed 351,000; however,
207 the fees described in paragraphs (a) and (b) may not be included
208| as part of the aggregate fee subject to this cap. Vacation
209 rental Resert ecendemimium units within separate buildings or at
210 separate locations but managed by one licensed agent may be
211] combined in a single license application, and the division shall
212 charge a license fee as if all units in the application are in a

213| single licensed establishment. Resert—dwelling—unitswmaybe

L I [ i RPN U SR IPSEPE IO I P T £ O P he
214 [ S Iy TIHhad g [ A [ [ ) & i § B Ly Y A S R ! i Y A T N Y i AN Y L N N A Sy i T e ee

215| schedule shall require an establishment which applies for an

216 initial license to pay the full license fee if application is
217| made during the annual renewal period or more than 6 months

218 prior to the next such renewal period and one-half of the fee if
219 application is made 6 months or less pricr to such period. The
220 fee schedule shall include fees collected for the purpose of

221 funding the Hospitality Education Program, pursuant To s.

222 509.302, which are pavable in full for each application

223 regardless of when the applicaticn is submitted.

224 (a) Upon making initial application or an application for
225| change of ownership, the applicant shall pay to the division a
226 fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $50, in addition to any
227| other fees required by law, which shall cover all costs

228 associated with initiating regulation of the establishment.

229 () A license renewal filed with the division within 30

230 days after the expiration date shall be accompanied by a

231 delinquent fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $50, in

232 addition to the renewal fee and any other fees reguired by law.

Page 8 of 10
CODING: Words stsrieken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




233
234
235
236
237
238
239
240
241
242
243
244
245
249
247
248
249
250
251
252
253
254
2b5
256
257
258
259
260
261

Florida Senate - 2011 SB 476

2-00687-11 2011476
A license renewal filed with the division more than 30 but not
more than 60 days after the expiration date shall be accompanied
by a delinguent fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $100,
in addition to the renewal fee and any other fees required by
law.

Section 8. Subsection (1) of secticn 509.291, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

509.291 Advisory council.—

(1) There is created an ll-member a—td-member advisory

council.

(a) The Secretary of Business and Professional Regulation
shall appoint seven voting members to the advisory council. Each
member appointed by the secretary must be an operator of an
establishment licensed under this chapter and shall represent
the industries regulated by the division, except that one member
appointed by the secretary must be a layperson representing the
general public and one member must be a hospitality education
administrator from an institution of higher education of this
state. Such members of the council shall serve staggered terms
cof 4 years.

{b) The Florida Restaurant and Lodging Association shall
designate one representative to serve as a voting member of the

council. The Florida Vacation Rental Managers Association shall

designate one representative to serve as a voting member of the

council. The Florida Apartment Association and the Florida
Association of Realtors shall each designate cone representative
to serve as a voting member of the council.

(c} Any member who fails to attend three consecutive

council meetings without good cause may be removed from the

Page 9 of 10

CODING: Words striecken are deietions; words underlined are additions.




Florida Senate - 2011 SB 476

2-00687-11 2011476
262 council by the secretary.

263 Section 9. This act shall take effect July 1, 2011.

Page 10 of 10
CODING: Words stxricker are deletions; words underlined are additions.




oo B B T S S A

11
12

Fiorida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. 3B 476

[NHACAER ===

LEGISLATIVE ACTION
Senate . House
Comm: RCS
03/22/2011

The Committee on Regulated Industries (Norman) recommended the

following:

Senate Amendment to Amendment (501282) (with title

amendment)

Delete lines 36 — 54
and insert:
{(7) PREEMPTION AUTHORITY.—
(a) The regulation of public lodging establishments and

public food service establishments, including, but not limited

standards, inspections, adepted—under—this seekieny,—and—the
B T NN S AP By PN P R T SN S S BPENEC — —NE W AT I B U NE SR YN I B |
J_\,\:dl.LJ.(JLL,.L\JJ.J. = [ .y = [y tpu k.! rl‘l. py LSEE e WO N AT [ S J_\.a\.it_L.l_J_ L

Page 1 of 3
3/21/2011 5:01:14 PM 580-02752-11




13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41

Florida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 476

LA ===

training and testing of feedservie stablishment personnel
L

and matters related to the nutritional content and marketing of

foods offered in such estaklishments, are preempted to the

state. This paragraph subseetien does not preempt the authority
of a local government or local enforcement district to conduct
inspections of public lodging and public food service
establishments for compliance with the Florida Building Code and
the Florida Fire Preventicn Code, pursuant to ss. 553.80 and 21
633.022.

(b} Notwithstanding any local law, ordinance, or

regulation, a vacation rental, as described in s. 509.242 (1) (<),

is deemed residential property and may not be prohibited or

treated differently than other residential property based solely

on its classification, use, oOr ocCCcUpancy.

Between lines 171 and 172
insert:

Section 6. Subsection (1) of section 509.261, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:

509.261 Revocation or suspension of licenses; fines;
procedure.—

(1) Any public lodging establishment or public food service
establishment that has operated or is operating in violation of
this chapter or the rules of the division, operating without a
license, or operating with a suspended or revoked license may be
subject by the division to:

(a) Fines not to exceed $1,000 per offense;

(b) Mandatory completion stkendanee, at personal expense,

Page 2 of 3
3/21/2011 5:01:14 BPM 580~02752-11




42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
5b
56

Florida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 476

RN -+

of a remedial at—aw educational program administered spensered

by a food safety training program provider whose program has

been approved by the division, as provided in s. 509.049 +ke
Hespitality FEduecationPregram; and

(c) The suspension, revocation, or refusal of a license

issued pursuant to this chapter.

= == T T TLE AMEDNIDMENT =———==s======== ==
And the title is amended as follows:
Delete line 243
and insert:
changes made by the act; amending s. 509.261, F.S.;
revising mandatory education reguirements for certain

violations; amending s. 509.2%1, F.S.;

Page 3 of 3
3/21/2011 5:01:14 PM 580-02752-11




o~ oy kW N

11
12

Florida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 476

|WRIIHAN ==

LEGISLATIVE ACTION
Senate . House
Comm: RCS
03/22/2011

The Committee on Regulated Industries (Norman) recommended the

following:

Senate Amendment (with title amendment)

Delete everything after the enacting clause
and insert:

Section 1. Paragzraph (a) of subsection (2) and subsection
(7) of secticn 509.032, Florida Statutes, are amended To read:

509.032 Duties.—

(2) INSPECTION OF PREMISES.-—

{a) The division has responsibility and jurisdiction for
all inspections required by this chapter. The division has
responsibility for quality assurance. Each licensed

establishment shall be inspected at least biannually, except for

Page 1 of 10
3/21/2011 9:23:10 AM 580-0221%8-11




13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
277
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41

Florida Senate - 2011 CCMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 476

[ WRAIVARY ===

transient and nontransient apartments, which shall be inspected
at least annually, and shall be inspected at such other times as
the division determines is necessary to ensure the public’s
health, safety, and welfare. The division shall estakblish a

system to determine inspection frequency. Public lodging units

classified as vacation rentals xresort-condeminivms—er—resort

dwelltings are nobt subject to this reguirements but shall be made

available to the division upon request. If, during the
inspection of a public lodging establishment classified for
renting to transient or nontransient tenants, an inspector
identifies wvulnerable adults who appear to be victims of
neglect, as defined in s. 415.102, or, in the case of a building
that is not equipped with automatic sprinkler systems, tenants
or clients who may be unable to self-preserve in an emergency,
the division shall convene meetings with the following agencies
as appropriate to the individual situation: Lhe Department of
Health, the Department of Elderly Affairs, the area agency on
aging, the local fire marshal, the landlord and affected tenants
and clients, and other relevant organizations, to develop a plan
which improves the prospects for safety of affected residents
and, if necessary, identifies alternative living arrangements
such as facilities licensed under part IT of chapter 400 or
under chapter 429.

{7} PREEMPTION AUTHORITY.—

{a) The regulation of public lodging establishments and
public food service establishments, including, but net limited
to, the inspection of public lodging establishments and public
food service establishments for compliance with the sanitation

standards adopted under this section, and the regulation of food

Page 2 of 10
3/21/2011 9:23:10 AM 580-02219-11




42
43
44
45
46
47
43
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70

Florida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 476

RN =o-=

safety protection standards for reguired training and testing of
food service establishment personnel are preemphted to the state.
This paragraph subsectier does not preempt the authority of a
local government or local enforcement district to conduct
inspections of public lodging and public focd service
establishments for compliance with the Florida Building Code and
the Florida Fire Preventicn Code, pursuant to ss. 553.80 and
633.022.

(b) MNotwithstanding any local law, ordinance, or

regulation, a vacation rental, as described in s. 509.242(1) {c},

is deemed residential property and may not be prohibited or

treated differently than other residential property based solely

on its classification, use, or occupancy.

Section 2. Subsection (9) of section 509%.221, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

509.221 Sanitary regulations.—

{2) Subsections {2), (5), and (6) do not apply Lo any

facility or unit classified as a vacation rental or resert

eondemintur nontransient apartment—er—resert—dwelding as
described in s. 509.242{1) {¢) and+ {(d)+—and—tst.
Section 3. Subsection (2) of section 509.241, Florida

Statutes, 1s amended to read:

509.241 Licenses required; exceptions.—

(2) APPLICATION FOR LICENSE.—Each person who plans TCo open
a public lodging establishment cor a public food service
establishment shall apply for and receive a license from the
division prior to the commencement of operation. A condominium
association, as defined in s. 718.103, which does not own any

units classified as vacation rentals reserteondemimiuoms under

Page 3 cof 10
3/21/2011 9:23:10 AM 580-02215%-11




71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80
gl
82
83
84
g5
86
87
88
89
20
91
92
93
94
95
26
97
98
99

Florida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 476

[HEHIHIALY ==

s. 509.242(1) (c) is shadld not be required to apply for or
receive a public lodging establishment license.

Section 4. Subsection (1) of secticn 509.242, Florida
Statutes, 1is amended to read:

509.242 Public lodging establishments; classifications.—

(1) A public lodging establishment shall be classified as a

hotel, motel, resert—condominitumy: nontransient apartment,

transient apartment, roominghouse, bed and breakfast inn, cor
vacation rental resert—dwellizg if the establishment satisfies

the following criteria:

(a) Hotel.—A hotel is any public lodging establishment
containing sleeping room accommodaticns for 25 or more guests
and providing the services generally provided by a hotel and
recognized as a hotel in the community in which it is situated
or by the industry.

(b) Motel.—A motel is any public lodging establishment
which offers rental units with an exit to the outside of each
rental unit, daily or weekly rates, offstreet parking for each
unit, a central office on the property with specified hours of
operation, a bathroom or connecting bathroom for each rental
unit, and at least six rental units, and which is recognized as
a motel in the community in which it is situated or by the
industry.

(c) Vacation rental Resert—condeminium.—A vacation rental
resert—econdemintam 15 any unit or group of units in a

condominium, cocperative, or timeshare plan or any individually

or collectively owned single-family, two-family, or four-family

house or dwelling unit that is also a transient public lodging

establishment which is—repted -mere—thanthree—times Ih—o

H
H

Page 4 of 10
3/21/2011 9:23:10 AM 580-02219-11




100
101
102
103
104
105
106
107
108
109
110
111
112
113
114
115
116
117
118
115
120
121
122
123
124
125
126
127
128

Florida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 476

PR ISR ST (R SRR =S S NE S, o = £ 1 PRSI S SN SN A S 3 =] E— P I R

A TIATIT _‘{‘ | = - - k}\_L.A_ == L = - T e [ e e i R Py AT = A - 5 I e A

mem i B = LT o O AP N R -") PR PN SN P R = ) PP T AP | e 14 11+

I T T Dy L T e i 4 - L - C= pu e Wil 1T - Loy LT R M e T = o LI L W LY ny wy T
+1 PN SN RSN N =N I s NNy I AT SN oN = B = A S NE A Mo ) ey
T t)uL.L).L.L\/ Lo ) [ t).l.l..l.\’ J_MBM.LMLAL)I = T [ tJ [ np— i AT T L A e R
20 A o N, [IPENPENDE: ENE R CEENR e ) =Y P ey P T P S P M == P

pe A . ANPE ¢ g =y TIATA I 2T J.J.I_-JJ,, L J g S v e W [ S -

d) Nontransient apartment or roominghouse.—A nontransient
apartment or roominghouse is a building or complex of buildings
in which 75 percent or more of the units are available for rent
to nontransient tenants.

(e) Transient apartment or roominghouse.—A transient
apartment or roominghouse is a building or complex of buildings
in which more than 25 percent of the units are advertised or
held out to the public as available for transient occupancy.

(f) Roominghouse.—A roominghouse is any public lodging
establishment that may not be classified as a hotel, motel,
rosert eondemirdnm nontransient apartment, bked and breakfast
or transient apartment under tThis section.

inn, wvacation rental,

A roominghouse includes, but is not limited to, a boardinghouse.

{ e R v gmde  odrzm ] o e S S« 3% ot B B I S S S WIS NS S NP S AR I LT I ) T
\\j,l AV A "= \d.l‘\lb_l._:__l.,ii}j- Y e NI My W \..lv\fk-.l..l..l.l.l.\__j il (.,Lj.l._y I A I I W 7 0 P B S A
PO Na i PSP S RN T PRI | = L ] oy + 1.z EagN e i I ) =l o Fomen 3 T s
R LS WP PR R W), Wty w g T FV LD A T [ S P U I N f Lt i RN R S 1 B i s Fi L N e J_(.ALLI._I__L):‘ [ L
Lo o 8T 0y AAegn ] T 4 e~y 19 o e P iy T R A T 1 =S P S PSR F N P o JE SN
S N U R J_(A.A.I.I..l..l.)‘ \.AVV\_—JM_L.LJ.J.\:’ T L uvv\_‘_l._L_J_ll\j LU A gy LA Yy e s } I ITT T Al Y N
Flhig o i HPENE . [N S NN PRI =N S NN P A £l oo o A
LR Ay 4 i e L R g g =) i S (=3 L9 g T T A e [ g tJ\.zJ_J. AT L [ N S e IITOIT T
Ao S PNy PP DNV v PEE P S whachesrzoe 3o ] oo PP 0 AN I Jc3
\.Au_yu f - LN g wy T TT Ty LARY S T ¥ p - o S . Ty - LA N i wy TT Ju e
S lrroad 3 ool B 1A 124+ E el S~ EN PO BT I D SR PPN N S|
o R ™ g g el E A NS A L 1T iy § L L [ ST A ) t.lk,lk/.l..l. [ L=y -tJ,Lu ) .L.k-\ju.i.uJ._t._y = J A R L
SN S Y £ T mee ol DN A syen P B P N I CEPE N T Y PO NP PPN
= L= t,l [ B Ny WL N . - . [N g} AT — \_l.u_y-._) p . .y O T Py AR iy ) L..i..l." ¥y L LD T ' -

(g)4r)» Bed and breakfast inn.—A bed and breakfast inn is a
family home structure, with no more than 15 sleeping rooms,
which has been modified to serve as a transient public lodging

establishment, which provides the accommodation and meal

Page 5 of 10

3/21/2011 9:23:10 AM 580-0221%~-11




Florida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 476

|NRHIAAN o>

129 services generally offered by a bed and breakfast inn, and which
130 is recognized as a bed and breakfast inn in the community in

131| which it is situated or by the hospitality industry.

132 Section 5. Subsection (1) of section 509.251, Flerida

133 Statutes, 1s amended to read:

134 509.251 Ticense fees.—

135 {1) The division shall adopt, by rule, a schedule of fees
136| to be paid by each public lodging establishment as a

137 prerequisite tc issuance or renewal of a license. Such fees

138 shall be based on the number of rental units in the

139| establishment. The aggregate fee per establishment charged any
140| public lodging establishment shall not exceed $1,000; however,
141 the fees described in paragraphs (a) and (b) may not be included
142 as part of the aggregate fee subject to this cap. Vacation

143 rental Resert ceondemirium units within separate buildings or at
144 separate locations but managed by one licensed agent may be

145| combined in a single license application, and the division shall

146| charge a license fee as if all units in the application are in a

147| single licensed establishment. Resert—dwetiIngunttsiay >

148 NN B IR N~ = o3 qam o am g o, o o =
e Sl I M e e 3 R S 2 e 3 1 O ¥ o 1 e el B HErOTT

|___4

149 schedule shall reguire an establishment which applies for an

150 initial license to pay the full license fee if application is
1511 made during the annual renewal period or more than 6 months

152| prior to the next such renewal period and cne-half of the fee if
153| application is made & months or less prior to such period. The
154 fee schedule shall include fees collected for the purpose of

155 funding the Hospitality Education Program, pursuant to s.

156 509.302, which are pavyable in full for each application

157 regardless of when the application is submitted.

Page & of 10
3/21/2011 9:23:10 AM 580-0221%-11




158
159
160
161
162
163
164
165
166
167
168
169
170
171
172
173
174
175
176
177
178
179
180
181
182
183
184
185
186

Florida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SEB 476

AU -2

{a) Upon making initial application or an application for
change of ownership, the applicant shall pay to the division a
fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $50, in addition to any
other fees regquired by law, which shall cover all costs
associated with initiating regulation of the establishment.

(b) A license renewal filed with the division within 30
days after the expiration date shall be accompanied by a
delinguent fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed $50, in
addition to the renewal fee and any other fees required by law.
A license renewal filed with the division more than 30 but not
more than 60 days after the expiration date shall be accompanied
by a delinquent fee as prescribed by rule, not to exceed 5100,
in addition to the renewal fee and any other fees required by
law,

Section 6. Subsecticn (1) of section 509.291, Florida
Statutes, 1s amended to read:

509.291 Adviscry council.—

(1) There is created a l0-member advisory council.

{a) The Secretary of Business and Professional Regulation
shall appoint six sewen voting members to the advisory council.
Fach member appointed by the secretary must be an operator of an
establishment licensed under this chapter and shall represent
the industries regulated by the division, except that one member
appointed by the secretary must be a layperson representing the
general public and one member must be a hospitality educatiocon
administrator from an institution of higher education of this
state. Such members of the council shall serve staggered terms
of 4 years.

(b) The Florida Restaurant and Lodging Association shall

Page 7 of 10
3/21/2011 9:23:10 AM 580-02219-11




187
188
189
190
191
192
183
124
195
19%e¢
197
198
1929
200
201
202
203
204
205
206
207
208
209
210
211
212
213
214
215

Florida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 476

RN ===

designate one representative to serve as a voting member of the

council. The Florida Vacation Rental Managers Asscciation shall

designate one representative to serve as a voting member of the

council. The Florida Apartment Association and the Florida
Association of Realtors shall each designate one representative
to serve as a voting member of the council.

(c) Any member who fails to attend three consecutive
council meetings without good cause may be removed from the
council by the secretary.

Section 7. Paragraph (c) of subsection (8) of section
381.008, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

381.008 Definitions of terms used in ss. 381.008-
381,00897.—As used in ss. 381.008-381.00897, the fcllowing words
and phrases mean:

(8) “Residential migrant housing”—A building, structure,
molbile home, barracks, or dormitory, and any combination thereof
on adjacent property which is under the same ownership,
management, or control, and the land appertaining thereto, that
is rented or reserved for occupancy by five or more seasonal or

migrant farmworkers, except:

(c} A hotel ory+ motel, er—resert condominiumy as described
defined in chapter 509, that is furnished for transient
occupancy.

Section 8. Subsection (4) of section 286.203, Flerida
Statutes, is amended to read:

386.203 Definitions.—As used in this part:

(4) “Designated smoking guest rooms at public lodging
establishments” means the sleeping rooms and directly assoclated

private areas, such as bathrecoms, living rooms, and kitchen

Page 8 of 10
3/21/2011 9:23:10 AM 580-02219-11




Florida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 476

AR o>

216| areas, if any, rented to guests for their exclusive transient
217| occupancy in public lodging establishments, including hotels,
218| motels, vacation rentals resert—eendeminiuwms, Lransient

219| apartments, transient lodging establishments, rooming houses,
220| boarding houses, resert—dweliringsy bed and breakfast inns, and

221| the like; and designated by the person or persons having

222| management authority over such public lodging establishment as

223! rooms in which smoking may be permitted.

224 Section 9. This act shall take effect July 1, 2011.
225
226 ' === T I TLE AMENDMENT =

227! And the titie i1s amended as follows:
228 Delete everything before the enacting clause

229 and insert:

230 A bill to be entitled

231 An act relating to public lodging establishments;
232 amending s. 502.032, F.S.; conforming provisions to
233 changes made by the act; providing that vacation

234 rentals are residential property for purposes of

235 provisions related to the treatment of such

236 properties; amending ss. 509.221 and 509.241, F.S5.;
237 conforming provisions to changes made by the act;
238 amending s. 509.242, F.S.; providing that public

239 lodging establishments formerly classified as resort
240 condominiums and resort dwellings are classified as
241 vacation rentals; defining the term “vacation rental”;
242 amending s. 509.251, F.S.; conforming provisions to
243 changes made by the act; amending s. 509.291, F.S5.;
244 revising membership of the advisory council of the

Page 9 of 10
3/21/2011 9:23:10 AM 580-02219-11




Florida Senate - 2011 COMMITTEERE AMENDMENT
Bill No. SB 476

LEIHRNNY o=

245 Division of Hotels and Restaurants of the Department
246 of Business and Professional Regulation; reguiring the
247 Florida Vacation Rental Managers Association to

248 designate a member to serve on the advisory council;
249 amending ss. 381.008 and 386.203, F.5.; conforming

250 provisions to changes made by the act; providing an
251 effective date.

Page 10 of 10
3/21/2011 9:23:10 AM 580-02219%-11




The Florida Senate

BILL ANALYSIS AND FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT

(This document is based on the provisions contained in the legislation as of the latest date listed below.)

Prepared By: The Professional Staff of the Regulated Industries Commitiee

BILL:

SB 476

INTRODUCER:  Senator Evers

SUBJECT: Public Lodging Establishments
DATE: March 19, 2011 REVISED:
ANALYST STAFF DIRECTOR REFERENCE ACTION
1. Oxamendi Imhof RI Pre-meeting
2. Ju
3. BC
4,
5.
6.
l. Summary:

The bill amends the definitions of transient and nontransient public lodging establishments to
increase the maximum period that a transient public lodging establishment is regularly rented
from less than 30 days to less than 181 days. The bill also increases the minimum length of each
rental period required to classify as a nontransient establishment from at least 30 days to at least
181 days. Rentals that that cxceed the maximum on a regular basis would be classified as
nontransient public lodging establishments.

The bill replaces the classifications “resort condominium” and “resort dwelling” with the single
term “vacation rental.” It provides that vacation rentals are residential property and may not be
prohibited or treated differently than other residential properties based solely on their
classification, use, or occupancy. The bill requires that vacation rental operators must keep
advance payment or deposit until occupancy starts or upon proper cancellation.

The bill increases the membership of the advisory council from 10 members to 11 members. The
new voting member must represent the Florida Vacation Rental Managers Association.

This bill substantially amends the following sections of the Florida Statutes: 509.013, 509.032,
509.101, 509.221, 509.241, 509.242, 509.251, and 509.291.

Present Situation:

The Division of Hotels and Restaurants (division) within the Department of Business and
Professional Regulation (department) is the state agency charged with enforcing the provisions
of ch. 509, F.S., and all other applicable laws relating to the inspection and regulation of public



BILL: SB 476 Page 2

lodging establishments and public food service establishments for the purpose of protecting the
public health, safety, and welfare. According to the department, there are over 37,273 licensed
public lodging establishments, including hotels, motels, nontransient and transient rooming
houses, and resort condominiums and dwellings."

The term “public lodging establishments™ includes transient and nontransient public lodging
establishments.” The principal differences between transient and nontransient public lodging
establishments are the number of times that the establishments are rented in a calendar year and
the length of the rentals.

Section 509.013(4)(a)1., F.S., defines a "transient public lodging establishment™ to mean:

any unit, group of units, dwelling, building, or group of buildings within a single
complex of buildings which is rented to guests more than three times in a calendar
year for periods of less than 30 days or 1 calendar month, whichever 1s less, or
which is advertised or held out to the public as a place regularly rented to guests.

Section 509.013(4)(a)2., F.S., defines a "nontransient public lodging establishment” to mean:

any unit, group of units, dwelling, building, or group of buildings within a single
complex of buildings which is rented to guests for periods of at least 30 days or 1
calendar month, whichever is Iess, or which is advertised or held out to the public
as a place regularly rented to guests for periods of at least 30 days or 1 calendar
month.

Section. 509.013(4)(b), F.S., exempts the following types of establishments from the definition of
“public lodging establishment™

1. Any dormitory or other living or sleeping facility maintained by a public or
private school, college, or university for the use of students, faculty, or visitors;

2. Any hospital, nursing home, sanitarium, assisted living facility, or other
similar place;

3. Any place renting four rental units or less, unless the rental units are advertised
or held out to the public to be places that are regularly rented to transients;

4, Any unit or group of units in a condominium, cooperative, or trmeshare plan
and any individually or collectively owned one-family, two-family, three-family,
or four-family dwelling house or dwelling unit that is rented for periods of at least
30 days or 1 calendar month, whichever is less, and that is not advertised or held
out to the public as a place regularly rented for periods of less than 1 calendar
month, provided that no more than four rental units within a single complex of
buildings are available for rent;

5. Any migrant labor camp or residential migrant housing permitted by the
Department of Health; under ss. 381.008-381.00895; and

Y See Annual Report, Fiscal Year 2009-2010, Division of Hotels and Restaurants, Department of Business and Professional
Regulation. A copy is available at: http:/www.myfloridalicense.com/dbpr/hr/reports/annualreports/documents/ar2009_10.pdf
(Last visited March 1, 2011).

2 Section 509.013¢4)(a), F.S.



BILL: SB 476 Page 3

6. Any establishment inspected by the Department of Health and regulated by
chapter 513.

Public lodging establishment are classified as a hotel, motel, resort condominium, nontran51ent
apartment, transient apartment, roominghouse, bed and breakfast inn, or resort dwelling

Section 509.242(1)(c), F.S., defines the term “resort condominium” as:

any unit or group of units in a condominium, cooperative, or timeshare plan
which is rented more than three times in a calendar year for periods of less than
30 days or 1 calendar month, whichever is less, or which is advertised or held out
to the public as a place regularly rented for periods of less than 30 days or 1
calendar month, whichever is less.

Section 509.242(1)(g), F.S., defines the term “resort dwelling” as

any individually or collectively owned one-family, two-family, three-family, or
four-family dwelling house or dwelling unit which is rented more than three times
in a calendar year for periods of less than 30 days or 1 calendar month, whichever
is less, or which is advertised or held out to the public as a place regularly rented
for periods of less than 30 days or 1 calendar month, whichever is less.

According to the vacation rental industry, the terms resort condominium and resort dwellings are
not commonly used in the industry. Instead these classes of public lodging establishments are
termed “vacation rentals.”

The 37,273 public lodging establishments licensed by the division are distributed as follows:*

Nontransient apartments — 17,413 licenses covering 980,556 units;
Transient apartments — 993 licenses covering 13,752 units;
Nontransient roominghouses — 153 licenses covering 2,100 units;
Transient roominghouses — 211 licenses covering 3,091 units;
Resort condominiums — 3,174 licenses covering 91,453 units; and
Resort dwellings — 10,602 licenses covering 25,112 units

Advisory Council

Section 509.291, F.S., creates a 10-member advisory council to assist the division by advising it
on matters affecting the private-sector entities regulated by the division. The stated purpose is to
“promote better relations, understanding, and cooperation between such industries and the
division; to suggest means of better protecting the bealth, welfare, and safety of persons using
the services offered by such industries; to give the division the benefit of its knowledge and
experience concerning the industries and individual businesses aflected by the laws and rules

3 Section 509.242(1), F.S.
4 2011 Legislative Analysis for SB 476, Office of Legislative Affairs, Department of Business and Professional Regulation
{January 31, 2011).



BILL: SB 476 Page 4

administered by the division; to promote and coordinate the development of programs to educate
and train personnel for such industries; and perform other duties that may be prescribed by law.”

Real Estate Professionals

Part I of ch. 475, E.S., provides for the licensing and regulation of the practice real estate
brokers, sales associates, and real estate schools. Section 475.011(11), F.S_, provides an
exception to the licensing and regulation. It exempts persons, partnerships, corporations, or other
legal entities which, for another and for compensation or other valuable consideration, rent or
advertise for rent, for transient occupancy, any public lodging establishment licensed under

ch. 509, F.S,,

Effect of Proposed Changes:

Transient and Nontransient Lodging Establishments

The bill amends s. 509.013(4)(a), F.S., to revise the definitions for the terms transient public
lodging establishment and nontransient public lodging establishment. The amended definition
increases the maximum rental period required to classify as a transient public lodging
establishment from less than 30 days to less than 181 days. The bill also increases the minimum
length of each rental period required to classify as a nontransient establishment from at least 30
days to at least 181 days.

The definition of nontransient public lodging establishment provided in the bill may conflict with
exemption in s. 509.013(4)(b)4., F.S. , which exempts from the licensure requirement single-
family, two-family, three-family, and four-family houses or dwellings and condominiums,
timeshares, and cooperatives, provided that no more than four rental units within a single
complex of buildings are available for rent and they are rented for more than 30 days or one-
month periods. In effect, the bill may limit the number of long-term vacation rentals requiring
licensure to only those with more than four rental units in a complex.

Vacation Rentals

The bill also amends s. 509.242(1)(c), F.S., to replace the term “resort condominium” with the
term “vacation rental.” It deletes the definition for the term “resort dwelling” in s. 509.242(1)(g),
F.S. It defines a “vacation rental” to mean any unit or group of units in a condominium,
cooperative, or timeshare plan or any individually or collectively owned single-family, two-
family, three-family, or four-family dwelling house or dwelling unit that is also a transient public
lodging establishment.

The bill also amends ss. 509.032(2), 509.221(9), 509.241, and 509.251, F.S., to replace the term
“resort condominium or resort dwellings” with the term “vacation rentals.”

The bill creates s. 509.032(7)(b), F.S., to provide that vacation rentals are residential property
and may not be prohibited or treated differently than other residential properties based solely on
their classification, use, or occupancy.



BILL: SB 476 Page 5

The bill creates s. 509.101(3), F.S., to require each operator of a vacation rental to retain advance
payment or deposit paid by a guest until the occupancy begins or is cancelled according to the
rental agreement or the operator’s cancellation rules.

Advisory Council

The bill amends s. 509.291(1)(a), F.S., to increase the membership of the advisory council from
10 members to 11 members. The new voting member must represent the Florida Vacation Rental
Managers Association.’

Effective Date

The bill would take effect on July 1, 2011.

V. Constitutional Issues:

A. Municipality/County Mandates Restrictions:

None.

B. Public Records/Open Meetings Issues:
None.

C. Trust Funds Restrictions:
None.

V. Fiscal Impact Statement:

A. Tax/Fee Issues:
None.
B. Private Sector Impact:

The bill increases from less than 30 days to less than 181 days the maximum rental period
required to be classified as a transient public lodging establishment. It also increases from
at least 30 days to at least 181 days the minimum length of each rental period required to
be classified as a nontransient establishment. This may require some dwellings, including
condominiums, timeshares, and multi-family residences, that rented four or more times
per year for periods of several months, which are not currently required to be licensed, to
obtain a license as a vacation rental. This change may increase license fees collected by
the division.

® The Florida Vacation Rental Managers Association is a statewide association the represents the companies and
professionals who rent and manage resort, vacation and other short-term rentals. Information about the association can be
found at: http://www_fvrma.org/ (Last visited March 2, 2011).



BILL: SB 476 Page 6

VL.

VIL.

VIIl.

C. Government Sector Impact:

As noted in the Private Sector Impact section of this analysis, if the bill increases the
number of dwellings that may require a public lodging establishment license, there would
be an increase in license fees collected by the division.

Technical Deficiencies:
None.
Related Issues:

Although the bill does not directly relate to the practice of real estate professions under part I of
ch. 475, F.S., by increasing the maximum rental period required to classify an establishment as a
transient public lodging establishment, the bill would affect the persons who are exempt {rom
regulation as real estate professionals, as provided s. 475.011(11), F.S. According to a
representative for the Florida Association of Realtors, such unlicensed persons would likely be
responsible for retaining the advance payment deposit required in s. 509.101(3), F.S.

Additional Information:

A. Committee Substitute — Statement of Substantial Changes:
{Sumimarizing differences between the Committee Substitute and the prior version of the bill.)
None.

B. Amendments:
None.

This Senate Bill Analysis does not reflect the intent or official position of the bill’s introducer or the Florida Senate.




2011 Regular Session The Florida Senate
COMMITTEE VOTE RECORD

COMMITTEE: Regulated Industries
ITEM: SB 476
FINAL ACTION: Favorable with Commitiee Substitute
MEETING DATE: Tuesday, March 22, 2011
TIME: 1:15—3:15p.m.
PLACE: 110 Senate Office Building

312212011 1:15PM 133/22{2011 1:15PM 213/22/12011 1:15PM 3
Amendment 501282 |Amendment to Amendment
FINAL VOTE Amendment 212134 [501282(as amended)
Norman Norman |Norman
Yea Nay SENATORS Yea Nay Yea Nay Yea Nay
Altman
|Braynon
X Dean
Diaz de la Portilla
X Hill
X Norman
X Rich
X Siplin
X Thrasher
Wise
X Sachs, VICE CHAIR
X Jones, CHAIR
Yia Ngy TOTALS PIYEi\laD Nay T’Z: Nay ice‘f Nay
CODES: FAV=Favorable RCS=Replaced by Committee Substitute TP=Temporarily Postponed WD=Withdrawn
UNF=Unfavorable RE=Replaced by Engrossed Amendment VA=Vote After Roll Call
-R=Reconsidered RS=Replaced by Substitute Amendment VC=Vote Change After Roll Call
REPORTING INSTRUCTION: Publish 5-010 {10/10/08}

03222011.1505 Page 1 of 2



2011 Regular Session

The Florida Senate
COMMITTEE VOTE RECORD

COMMITTEE: Regulated Industries
ITEM: 3B 476
FINAL ACTION: Favorable with Committee Substitute
MEETING DATE: Tuesday, March 22, 2011
TIME: 1:15—3:15 p.m.
PLACE: 110 Senate Office Building
32212011 T:15PM 4
Motion to report as
Committee Substitute
Hill
SENATORS Yea Nay Yea Nay Yea Nay Yea Nay

Altman

{Braynon

Dean

Diaz de la Portilla

Hill

Norman

Rich

Sipfin

Thrasher

\Wise

Sachs, VICE CHAIR

Jones, CHAIR

FAV -
TOTALS Yea Nay Yea Nay Yea Nay Yea Nay
CODES: FAV=Favorable RCS=Replaced by Committee Substitute TP=Temporarily Postponed WD=Withdrawn

UNF=Unfavorable
-R=Reconsidered

REPORTING INSTRUCTION: Publish

03222011.1505

RE=Replaced by Engrossed Amendment
RS=Replaced by Substitute Amendment

VA=Vote After Roli Call
VC=Vote Change After Roll Call

S-010 (10/10/09)
Page 2 of 2



