

2510000-16-1 MOTOR VEHICLES

Attachment D.1: Price Sheet - Police Vehicles
 Commodity Code No. 25101702: POLICE VEHICLES
 Please see the Info Sheet for Instructions, General Information, and reference key.
 NOTE: THE PRICE SHEET IS NOT COMPLETE UNLESS IT IS USED IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE COMPLETE REQUIREMENTS, SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS, AND CONDITIONS.

Sub-group 1	Manufacturer/Brand 3	Line Number	Representative Model 4	Alternative Fuel Credits 5	Organization Name 6	Base Vehicle Price (\$/hr 8/10) 7	CEM Options (1/3%) 8	Retailer/Option Special Price (\$/hr 12)	Estimated Lead-time in Days (1/11) 10	Identified Aftermarket Options 11										
										Adaptive Rear-View Mirror (1/12)	Year/Lease Bidder/Trade In (1/13)	Year/Lease Bidder/Trade In (1/13)	Push Button Start (1/14)	Anti-Lock Brakes (1/15)	Alarm (1/16)	Alarm (1/16)	Alarm (1/16)	Alarm (1/16)	Alarm (1/16)	Alarm (1/16)
Sub-Group A: POLICE/PURSUIT AUTOMOBILE, MARKED	Chevrolet	1	2016 Chevrolet Impala Limited Police ddr Sen Police (1W919, SC1)	S	Garbar Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck	\$ 18,895.00	10%	(\$1,500.00)	90-120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 526.00	\$ 216.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 56.00			
		2	2016 Chevrolet Caprice Police Patrol Vehicle ddr Sen Police (1W919, SC1)	S	Garbar Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck	\$ 24,746.00	20%	(\$500.00)	180-270	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 526.00	\$ 216.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 56.00			
		3	2016 Dodge Charger ddr Sen Police RWD (LDDE48)	O	AutoMation CDR Parabolic Pinna	\$ 20,597.00	0%	\$145.00	90-120	No Bid	\$ 119.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 466.00	\$ 159.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 89.00	\$ 65.00			
		4	2016 Dodge Charger ddr Sen Police RWD (LDDE48)	O	AutoMation CDR Parabolic Pinna	\$ 22,417.00	0%	\$145.00	90-120	No Bid	\$ 119.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 466.00	\$ 159.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 89.00	\$ 65.00			
		5	2016 Ford Sedan Police Interceptor ddr Sen RWD (P2M, 500A)	S	Garbar Ford Inc.	\$ 22,442.00	0%	(\$1,700.00)	90-120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 596.00	\$ 216.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 56.00			
		6	2016 Ford Sedan Police Interceptor ddr Sen AWD (P2M, 500A)	S	Don Rold Ford	\$ 22,500.00	5%	(\$300.00)	120	No Bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 89.50	No Bid	\$ 125.00			
		7	2016 Chevrolet Impala Limited Police ddr Sen Police (1W919, SC3)	S	Garbar Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck	\$ 18,895.00	10%	N/A	90-120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 526.00	\$ 216.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 56.00			
		8	2016 Dodge Charger ddr Sen Police RWD (LDDE48, AEB)	O	Garbar Chevrolet Dodge Truck, Inc.	\$ 21,898.00	0%	N/A	90-120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 596.00	\$ 216.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 56.00			
		9	2016 Dodge Charger ddr Sen Police AWD (LDDE48, AEB)	O	Garbar Chevrolet Dodge Truck, Inc.	\$ 24,278.00	0%	N/A	90-120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 596.00	\$ 216.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 56.00			
		Sub-Group B: POLICE/PURSUIT AUTOMOBILE, UNMARKED	Chevrolet	10	2016 Chevrolet Tahoe Police 2WD ddr (CC15708, PC1)	S	Garbar Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck	\$ 33,428.00	70%	\$800.00	90-120	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 526.00	\$ 216.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 56.00		
11	2016 Dodge Durango 2WD ddr Special Service (MNDCE75)			Dodge	Garbar Chevrolet Dodge Truck, Inc.	\$ 24,850.00	60%	(\$500.00)	90-120	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 596.00	\$ 216.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 56.00				
12	2016 Ford Expedition 2WD ddr XL SVT (U1F, 102A)			Ford	Don Rold Ford	\$ 20,333.00	15%	(\$400.00)	120	No Bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 595.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 125.00			
13	2016 Ford Expedition EL 2WD ddr XL SVT (K1F, 102A)			Ford	Don Rold Ford	\$ 31,689.00	14%	(\$400.00)	120	No Bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 595.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 125.00			
Sub-Group C: POLICE/SPECIAL SERVICE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 2WD	Chevrolet	14	2016 Chevrolet Tahoe Special Service Van AWD (CK15708, 5M4)	S	Garbar Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck	\$ 35,587.00	70%	(\$500.00)	90-120	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 526.00	\$ 216.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 56.00				
		15	2016 Dodge Durango AWD ddr Special Service (MNDCE75)	Dodge	Garbar Chevrolet Dodge Truck, Inc.	\$ 25,576.00	60%	(\$500.00)	90-120	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 526.00	\$ 216.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 56.00				
		16	2016 Ford Expedition 4WD ddr XL SVT (U1G, 102A)	Ford	Don Rold Ford	\$ 30,892.00	15%	(\$400.00)	120	No Bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 595.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 125.00			
		17	2016 Ford Expedition EL 4WD ddr XL (K1G, 102A)	Ford	Don Rold Ford	\$ 31,987.00	15%	(\$400.00)	120	No Bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 595.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 125.00			
Sub-Group D: POLICE/SPECIAL SERVICE SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 4WD (INCLUDING ALL WHEEL DRIVE (AWD))	Ford	18	2016 Ford Utility Police Interceptor AWD ddr (K6A, 500A)	S	Garbar Ford Inc.	\$ 25,596.00	5%	\$400.00	90-120	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 596.00	\$ 216.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 106.00	\$ 56.00				
					Don Rold Ford	\$ 25,944.00	3%	(\$300.00)	120	No Bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 695.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 195.00	No Bid	\$ 1,250.00			

KEY:
 N/A - Not Available
 (Alternative) = Previous Representative Model, Validated Current Representative Model specified.