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Effective Period 11/17/2015 through 11/16/2017
Contract Type  State Term Contract

Contract v Clntacius
Information Erequently Asked Questions - Users

Forms an her
Documents PDF (& 1.83 MB)

« Jennifer Hyatt
Contract + (8S0) 414-6741

Administration . jennifer nvatt@dms myfiorida com

" UNSPSC-25101500, UNSPSC-25101503, UNSPSC-25101505, UNSPSC-
Commodity Codes ;5,57 UNSPSC-25101600, UNSPSC-25101702

Description

This is a statewide contract for Motor Vehicles. This contract provides State Agencies and eligible users
with the ability to purchase new 2016 models at a discount off of MSRP on: automobiles, passenger vans,
cargo vans, sport utility vehicles, light pickup trucks, chassis-cab trucks, low-speed vehicles, truck bodies,
and installed options. Styles Include: Law Enforcement Automobiles, Law Enforcement SUVs, Law
Enforcement Motorcycles, Automobiles, Low-Speed Vehicles, Passenger Vans, Cargo Vans, SUVs, and
Pickup and Chassis-Cab Trucks (Class 1 through Class 5).

The Department strongly encourages ALL potential users of this contract to plan ahead to prevent any
potential delays. Please review the Contract Documents, "How to Use this Contract™ Instructions, and
"Frequently Asked Questions” for this State Term Contract.

Benefits

State of Flonda Base Vehicle Prices and Options Discounts equate to average approximate discount 70%
percent off of list price (MSRP).

« Additional discounts possible for large quantity, identical motor vehicle, orders.

Brands Inciude: Chevrolet, Club Car, Cruise Car, Dodge, Ford, Freightliner, GEM, GMC, Jeep, Motor
Electric, Nissan, Toyota, Harley Davidson, International and RAM.
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Attachment D.1: Price Sheet - Police Vehicles
Commodity Code No. 25101702; POLICE VEHICLES
R Identified Aft Options™'
OEM | Aftermarkel
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Chevrolst 2 2017 Chevrolet Caprice Police Patrol Vehicle 4dr Sdn Police (1EW18, 8C1) 8 Sarber Chevrolst Pontiac GMC Truck $24,783.00 20% ($500.00) 180-270 HNo Bid NoBid [§ 12600($ 525008 21600 S  10600| S 10600 | & 56.00
E@E 3 2017 Dodge Charger ddr Sdn Police RWD (LDDE48) (+] DJR Pembroks Pines $20,618.00 % $145.00 90.120 NoBid | § 119.00 | $ 108.00 | § 496.00 | § 159.00 | § 8500 | $ 89.00 | § 65.00
AUTOMOBILE, MARKED Dot 4 2017 Dodge Charger 4dr Sdn Police AWD (LDEE48) DJR Pines $22,509.00 % $145.00 90120 NoBid|[$ 11900 |$ 10900 $ 4das00 (S 159.00 | $  es00| 5  eso0| s 65.00
Ford 5 2017 Ford Sedan Pollce Interceptor 4dr Sdn FWD (P2L, 500A) 8 Garber Ford Inc, $22,476.00 % §1,700.00) 90-120 No Bid NoBid | § 126.00 | $ 59600 | § 21600 | § 10600 | § 106.00 [ § 56.00
8 2017 Dodge Charger Police RWD (LDDE48, AEB) o Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Ing. $21,896.00 % A 80-120 No Bid NoBid | $ 12600 | § 596.00 | § 216.00 No Bid NoBid | § 56.00
G 9 2017 Dodge Charger Pollca RWD (LDEE4S, AEB) Garber Chrysler Dodge Truck, Inc, $24,276.00 0% NA 90120 Mo Bid NoBid|$ 12600 |5 53600(§ 216.00 No Bid NoBid | § 56.00
Sub-Group C: P PECIAL SERVICE|  Chevrotet 10 [2017 Chewrolet Tahoe Police 2wd 4dr (CC15T06, BC1) s Garber Cheviolat Pontiac GMC Truck $32,072.00 0% $800.00 90120 3 NoBid[S 126008 526005  21600|$ 10600 (S 10600 § 56.00
SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, ZWD Dodge 11 2017 Dodge Durango Special Service RWD (WDDETS) Garber Chrysler Dodus Truck, Inc, $24,656.00 0% (5500,00) 90-120 NoBid |5 12600 %  596.00 | § 216.00 No Bid NoBid | § 56.00
Chevrolet 14 |2017 Chevrolet Tahos Spacial Servica Vah 4wd (CK15706, 5W4) s Garbar Chevrolet Pontiac GMC Truck $34,243.00 0% (5500.00) 90120 NoBid|§ 12600 % 52600 |8 21600 | $ 10600 |5 10600 | § 56.00
SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE, 4WD Dodge 15 2017 Dodge Durango Spacial Servica AWD (WDEETS) Garber Chryslet Dodge Teuck, Inc. $25,976.00 0% (5500.00) 90120 RA NoBid|S 12600 | S 596.00 ($ 216.00 No Bid NoBid | § 56.00
EPE_ n« meaud 18 |2017 Ford Utility Police Intercaptor AWD 4dr (K8A, 500A) s @ $25,642.00 5% $400.00 80-120 NoBid|$§ 1260085 59600 % 21600 % 10600 S 10600 (S 56.00
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