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Name of Dealership

000 1.B

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner
ALT - Orlando Freightliner

Maudlin International Trucks

Maudlin International Trucks

Sun State International Trucks, LLC

ALT - Maudlin International Trucks

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc.

Maudlin International Trucks

Maudlin International Trucks

Sun State International Trucks, LLC

ALT - Maudlin International Trucks

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc.

Kenworth of Jacksonville

Kenworth of Jacksonville

Type of Vehicle

2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112
2019 Freightliner M2-112

2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX
2019 International HX

2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV
2019 International HV

2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880

Zone

* Western
Western

* Northern
Northern
* Central
Central

+* Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern

Base Unit
Price

$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00
$57,750.00
$65,113.00

$103,500.00
--NB --
$102,500.00
-- NB --
$102,250.00
$102,500.00
$100,600.00
--NB --

$92,650.00
--NB --
$91,650.00
--NB --
$91,620.00
$91,650.00
$89,363.00
-- NB --

$102,997.00
--NB --
$102,725.00



Kenworth of Central Florida

Kenworth of South Florida

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Nextran

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Rush Truck Center - Tampa

Palm Truck Center

Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran
Truckmax, Inc
ALT - Nextran

2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880
2019 Kenworth T880

2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series
2019 Mack AN or G Series

2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD
2019 Mack MHD

2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567
2019 Peterbilt 567

2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series
2019 Volvo V Series

Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southemn

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

Western
Western
Northern
Northern
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

--NB --
$104,900.00
--NB --
$102,200.00
--NB --

$108,182.00
--NB --
$108,182.00
-—-NB --
$108,182.00
- NB --
$108,182.00
- NB --

$96,955.00
--NB --
$96,955.00
-—-NB --
$96,955.00
--NB --
$96,955.00
-~ NB --

$105,204.00
--NB --
$105,204.00
--NB --
$105,204.00
--NB --
$104,651.00
--NB --

$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00
$94,592.00
$98,552.00



Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group
ALT - Four Star Freightliner
Southport Truck Group

2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Westemn Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700
2019 Western Star 4700

Western
Western
Northern
Northemn
Central
Central
Southern

Southern

$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00
$88,585.00
$82,825.00

--NB --
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52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2019 Kenworth T880

The Kenworth T880 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: $102,997.00 $102,725.00 $104,900.00 $102,200.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

Order Code
012569 !
0129570 2
0129582 3

700194 2

00800 2

Order Code

0700197 |
0700686 >
0700195 °

0125790 !
0700701 >
0700056 >

0123709 !
0123645/1105220 2
0123645 >

0700607 !
0123690/1105220 2
0123709 3

Western
$102,997.00

T880
Kenworth of Jacksonville

Kenworth of Central
Florida

Central
$104.900.00

Kenworth of Jacksonville

Northern
$102,725.00

Western

Delete Options & Northern

Engine/transmission - specify
PACCAR PX-9 370 2017 370@2000 1250@1400 1

Engine PX9-370hp 1250 fi/lb 2
PACCAR PX-9 ENGINE 380 HP 3

Engine/transmission - specify NA
Engine MX1] 400HP 1450 ft/LB 2

Engine/transmission - specify NA
Engine/transmission - specify | NA

Delete Option - Specify NA
T800 CAB/Model 2

' Delete Option - Specify NA
Delete Option - Specify NA
Delete Option - Specify NA

Delete Option - Specify NA

Western
& Northern

$425.00!

Add Options

Engine upgrade - specify

PACCAR MX-11 2017 430MT 430@1600 1450/1650@900 Multi
Torque w/engine brake I

Pacearr MX13 485HP 1650 Ib/ft (Must Upgrade Trans) 2

PACCAR MX-11 2017 415T 415@1600 with Engine brake FOR

OTHER ENGINES HP AND TORQUE PRICES CALL THE DEALER
3

Engine upgrade - specify $3,560.00"
ISX12 385V 385@1800 370@2100 1450(@1100, w/engine retarder.
Diagnostic plug for data link, oil cooler, aluminum flywheel housing 1
Paccar MX-510hp 1850 ft/lb (must upgrade trans) 2

PACCAR MX-13 2017 4555T 455(@1600 with Engine brake FOR
OTHER ENGINES HP AND TORQUE PRICES CALL THE DEALER
3

{ Engine upgrade - specify $4,120.00"

LV X15 500 2017 500(@ 1800 1650@1000 w/ Interbrake, diagnostic plug

gfor data link, oil cooler, aluminum flywheel housing 1

| X15L-450hp 1650 f/lb {must upgrade trans} 2

! CUMMINS X15 450 HP 1650 @1000RPM FOR OTHER ENGINES
i HP AND TORQUE PRICES CALL THE DEALER 3

Engine upgrade - specify $995.00"
PACCAR MX-13 405 2017 4051600 1450@900 w/ engine brake !

X15L-485hp 1650 fi/Ib{must upgrade trans} 2

CUMMINS X15 500 HP 1650 @ !000RPM FOR OTHER ENGINES

HP AND TORQUE PRICES CALL THE DEALER 3

Kenworth of South Florida

Southern
$102,200.00

Central

($275.00)
NA
NA

Incl.2

NA
NA
NA
NA

Central
$808.00°

$1,472.00°

$3,781.00%

$4,646.00%

Southern

($4,722.00)'  ($1,995.00)%  ($5,243.00)

NA

NA
NA
NA

NA
NA
NA
NA

Southern
$401.00°

$401.00°

$3,996.00°

$5,542.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

0700656 |
0123715/1105220 2
0123754 3

2058362 |
2058372 2

2057371
2058444 2

2058444 |
2058409/3495232
2058437 >

2057384 !
2058756/2450114
2058461 3

2058755
Telma 2

GVW5SK !
3142161/3749209 >

GVW64K !
64KGVW 2
64K >

GVW66KCH !
0129569/2011205 2
T800 3

GVW66KHN !
70006/0129552 >
90K

T830
Kenworth of Jacksonville  Kenworth of Jacksonville =~ Kenworth of Central
Florida
Western Northern Central
$102,997.00 $102,725.00 $104.900.00
Engine upgrade - specify $1,242.00"

PACCAR MX-13 455 2017 455@1600 1650@900 w/ engine brake 1
X15L-505hp 1650 fi/lb{must upgrade trans} 2

CUMMINS X15 565 HP 1850 @1000RPM FOR OTHER ENGINES
HP AND TORQUE PRICES CALL THE DEALER 3
Transmission upgrade - specify $352.00"
Fuller FRO16210C 10-speed w/pump & external oil cooler. Standard

with synthetic lubricant. Includes severe-duty pilot baring on all class 8

niodels

Trans: RT0-16908LL 10 speed 2
Transmission upgrade - specify $1,1 70.00"
Fuller RTO14908LL 10-speed. Standard with synthetic lubricant.

Includes severe-du?/ pilot bearing on all class 8 models. *Torque limit:

14500 pound-feet

Trans: RTL0-169134 2

Transmission upgrade - specify $ 1,410.001
Fuller RTLO16913A4 13-speed w/oil cooler & pump. Standard with

synthetic lubricant. Includes severe-duty pilot bearing on all class 8

models/ *Torque Limit: 1650 pound-feer

Ultrashift FOI6E308LL VCS 10spd w/trac cont 2

FULLER ADVANTAGE AUTOMATED FAQ-16810C 3

Transmission upgrade - specify $9,21 1.00

Eaton FO17E308LL-VCS Ultrashift Transmission )
Ultrashift FOI8E318B MXP 18 spd w/trac cont 2
EATON FO18E18E3134 MHP ULTRA 3

Transmission upgrade - specify $9,301 00!

Eaton FOI6E318B-MXP Ultrashift Plus Transmission 1
Telma Driveline Retarder 2

58,000 Ib. GVWR package $7,100.00"

14600 Steer, 44,0001b rears |
64,000 Ib. GVWR package $12,100.00"
Dana Spicer D2000 Steer 46k Rears 1

Includes 20K Front Axle, Springs, Brakes, Steering, & 425/65R22.5
Front Tires/ Wheels 46K rear Axle. 46K Chalmers or Air Ride Rear
Suspension & Double Frame

64,000# GVWR PACKAGE: MERITOR 20.000%# FRONT & 44,0004
TANDEM: KENWORTH 46,0004 AIR BAG SUSPENSION 3
GVWR upgrade - specify $12,105.001
66k GVW Package 20k steer, 46k rears with 46k Chalmers

Suspension

52,000 GVW T880 PX9-370hkp 3000RDS 2

7800 MODEL CAB 1.9 AVAILABLE FOR FASTER DELIVERY; T880
DELIVERY IS ONE YEAR OUT! 3 |
GVWR upgrade - specify $13,202.001
66k GVW Package 20k steer,46k rears with 46k Hendrickson

suspension

52,000 GVW T370 PX9-350hp 3000RDS Upgrade to 4500RDS -

$1708.00 2

900004 GVWR PACKAGE: DANA D2000 20000%# FRONT AXLE &

DANA D70-590 DUAL REDUCTION 70000%# TANDEM REAR AXLE

Kenworth of South Florida

Southern

$102,200.00

$6,068.00°  $6,836.00°

$1,719.00° NA

$2,105.00° NA

$9.698.00°  $4,985.00°

$9,896.00°  $9,256.00°!
$14,680.00% NA

$8,912.00° NA
$15,024.00°  $9.235.00°

$7,456.00%  ($3,000.00)>

($8,295.00)>  $48,500.00°



VEHICLE: T880

DEALER: Kenworth of Jacksonville ~ Kenworth of Jacksonville ~ Kenworth of Central
Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central

BASE PRICE: $102,997.00 $102,725.00 $104,900.00

000410/2016158 2
6X6 >

000410/2011205 2

000410/0128920 2

0125805 !
125810/7861010/8229005 2
0125810 °

CNGT !
CNGTNKS 2

LNGT !

DUALFUEL !
7216090/722019
7122100 7214100 3

2016154 !
2016154 >
2016154 °

2016158 |
2016158 2
2016158 3

W/HENDRICKSON HAULMAXX 70000# SUSPENSION TO HANDLE
KLEIN K700 WATER TANKER. 3

GVWR upgrade - specify NA
52,000 GCW: T440 PX9 370hp w/4500RDS 2

6X6 ALL WHEEL DRIVE OPTION, INCLUDES MT-22 MARMON
DRIVING FRONT AXLE, FABCO TC-142 TRANSFER CASE &
ALLISON 4500RDS TRANSMISSION. ALL FACTORY INSTALLED.
REQUIRES 46000% REAR TANDEM AXLE, FOR TOTAL GVWR OF
680004 VALID FOR T880 MODEL ONLY.3

GVWR upgrade - specify NA
52,000 GCW: T440 PX9 370hp w/3000RDS 2

GVWR upgrade - specify NA
Bi-fuel model - specify NA

Bi-Fuel N/A Change to CNG T440 Models ILO 52,000 G} W: T440 L9N
320hp w/ 4500RDS 52,000 GVW: T440 LIN 320hp w/3000RDS =
$24684 2

CNG prep - specify $29,522.00"
Cummins ISX12G 400HP- Must Add CNG Tank System 1

Engine: ISX12N 400hp 1450ft/lb Inc CNG Prep & Methane Detection

Or Change to LIN 320hp With Allison 3000RDS 325,292

0128922/2011205/8229005 {must add CNG tanks} 2

ISX12-G 400hp-1450 fi/lb: change to 0128921 ISL-G 320kp {must add
NOT INCLUDED CNG tanks for both} 3

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA

Call dealer to discuss

CNG Tanks 80DGE inc: FMM-defuel valve-transit fill Or - Upgrade to
90DGE $39.968 2

1

LPG conversion (discuss with dealer) NA
Call dealer to discuss

Dual fuel tanks, or e?uivalent $1,675.00l
Add 100 gallon fuel tank

Dual 90 gal alum fuel tanks w/20 gal DEF 2
DUAL 100 GALLONS 24.5" 3

| Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire NA
Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include $15,352.00l
synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent
6 Speed 1

Change to: 2011205 3000RDS $7975.00 2

ALLISON 4000RDS AUTO TRANSMISSION INCLUDING
SYNTHETIC OIL, TES 295 OR APPROVED EQUIVALENT. 3

Allison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include $16,222.001

! synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent
6 Speed 1

 Change to: 2011232 3500RDS $8752.00 2

ALLISON 4500RDS AUTO TRANSMISSION INCLUDING
SYNTHETIC OIL, TES 295 OR APPROVED EQUIVALENT. 3

Kenworth of South Florida

Southern
$102,200.00

$10,665.00°

$4,105.00%

NA
$32,139.00°

$21,260.00°

$37.973.00°

NA!

$1,848.00°

NA
$18,079.00°

$18,986.00°

$64,831.00°

NA

NA
NA

$22,311.00°

NA

NA

$1,726.00°

NA
$21,027.00°

$22.105.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

6141200 '
6141600/6056600 >
61412003

2503467 1
T880 6x6
2513010 °

2503467 !
2513014/2864019 2
2513010 °

205618116 |
2864016/2517020 2
2516181 °

205618118 !
2865018/2536001 2
2506181 °

2506181 !
2517020/2866020 2
2516006 >

3144170 !
3142170 2
3142160 °

T880
Kenworth of Jacksonville  Kenworth of Jacksonville  Kenworth of Central
Florida
Western Northern Central
$102,997.00 $102,725.00 $104.900.00
Double Frame: full steel insert $1,522.00l

Full steel insert: for 10-5/8 in. or 10-3/4 in. Steel to 284 in. or 2nd
insert for 11-5/8 in. steel frame 1

Upgrade Frame to 10 3/4 x 3/8" and include Full steel insert 2
FOR 10-5/8" FRAME RAIL UP TO 284" 3

Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity $2,565.001

steering gear and springs
i Dana Spicer E-1462W front axle rated 14.6K 3-1/2 in. drop, wide track
for better turning radius

14K FA N/A Change to: T880 6X6 Option Includes Transfer Case &
Sub Frame and required 66K 6x6 Suspension Package Inc Wheels &
Tires (This Option is Application Specific Engineered Must Consult
Dealer to Order)

Front Axle: 14.000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs 14.600%# FRONT AXLE & SPRINGS, 16,000% POWER
STEERING GEAR3

Front Axle: 14,600 1b rating to include equal capacity ‘352,560.001

steering gear and springs
Dana Spicer E-1462W front axle rated 14.6K 3-1/2 in. drop, wide track
for better turning radius 1

Front Axle: 14,600 lb rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs 14,600%# FRONT AXLE & SPRINGS, 16,000# POWER
STEERING GEAR 3

Front Axle: 16,000 1b rating to include equal capacity $4,620.OO1

 steering gear and springs

Dana Spicer D2000 Front axle with 16k springs 1

Fronr Axle: 20K, 16K Springs, Brakes, Steering, & 315/80R22.5 Tires/
| Wheels 2

: Front Axle: 20,000 Ib. rating to 16K cc:z"paciry steering gear and springs
1 16,000%# FRONT AXLE & SPRINGS,

Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity $5,230.001

steering gear and springs
Dana Spicer D2000 front axle with 16k springs 1

Front Axle: 20K, 18K Springs, Brakes, Steering, & 425/65R22.5 Tires/
Wheels 2

Front Axle: 20.000 [b. rating to include equal capacity steering gear

and springs 20.000% FRONT AXLE & SPRINGS, 20,000# DUAL
POWER STEERING GEAR3

Front Axle: 20,000 Ib. rating to include equal capacity $5,320.001

steering gear and springs

Dana Spicer D2000 Front axle 1

Front Axle: 20K, 20K Springs, Brakes, Steering, & 425/65R22.5 Tires/
Wheels 2

Front Axle: 20,000 1b. rating to include equal capacity steering gear
and springs 20,000%# FRONT AXLE & SPRINGS, 20,000# DUAL
POWER STEERING GEAR 3

Rear Axle: 46,000 1b Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or $6,680.001

equivalent
Dual Dana Spicer D46-170 rear axle rated at 46k. Tanden: rear axles.
w/ 12.5mm housing and 2.06in. shaft diameter. Tandem rear axles 1

Meritor RT46-160 46K Rear Axle 2
MERITOR RT-46-160 3

Kenworth of South Florida

Southern

$102,200.00
$2.517.00  $1,140.00°
$69,083.00°  $1,388.00°"
$936.00°  $1,388.00°
$4,210.00%  $3,289.00°
$5,710.00  $4,571.00°
$5,828.00°  $5,342.00%]
|
i
$2,798.00°  $2,140.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

3818119 !
3808119 2
3818119 °

3818025 |
3808025 2
3818025 °

3818802 !
3808802 2
3808802 °

3730032 !
3730032 2
3730026 >

3742020 !
3749209/383226
3747461 3

3740130 !
3744150/383510 %
3740130 3

T880
Kenworth of Jacksonville  Kenworth of Jacksonville  Kenworth of Central
Florida
Western Northern Central
$102,997.00 $102,725.00 $104.900.00
Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to NA

include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels
CALL DEALER 3

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift $9,775.001

to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels
Factory Installed Watson Chalin Steerable 13,2001b lift axle. Requires
Sull frame insert and suspension upgrade

Factory Installed Watson Chalin Steerable 13,2001b lift axle. Requires
double frame and rear suspensiow/GVW upgrade

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include
11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels Requires double frame and rear
suspension upgrade 3

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to $1 1,250.001
include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Factory Installed Waison Chalin Non-Steerable 20,0001b lift axle.

Requires full frame insert and suspension upgrade

Factory Installed Watson Chalin Non-Steerable 20,0001b lift axle.

Requires Full Frame Insert and suspension/GVW upgrade 2

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20.000 b rating air lift to include

11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels Requires double frame and rear

suspension upgrade 3

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 1b rating air lift $ 12,950.()0l

to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels
Factory Installed Watson Chalin Steerable 20,0001b lift axle. Requires
full frame insert and suspension upgrade

Factorv Installed Watson Chalin Steerable 20,0001b lift axle. Requires
Full Frame Insert and suspension/GVW upgrade 2

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include
11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels Requires double frame and rear
suspension upgrade

Rear Suspension: 40,000 Ib air ride $2,670.00"
Tandem Kenworth Airglide 400 40K 54 in. axle spacing. 10.5 in. ride
height. Includes air suspension dump valve

Rear suspension: Tandem Kemvorth Airglide 400 40K 2

MERITOR RT-46-160 FOR NOT LISTED SUSPENSIONS CALL
DEALER 3

Rear Suspension: 46,000 b Chalmers, Hendrickson, $3,966.001

Mack, Volvo "T" ride or equivalent

Tandem Hendrickson Primaax EX462 46K. Steel crossmember &
gussets. 54 in. axle spacing. 10 in. ride heighr1

Chalmers 46k w/shocks 2

HENDRICKSON RT463 46K FOR NOT LISTED SUSPENSIONS CALL
DEALER 3

Rear Suspension: 46,000 b air ride $2,780.001
Tandem Kenworth Airglide 460 46K 54 in. axle spacing. 10.5 in. ride
height. Includes air suspension dump valve 1

Neway 46k w/dual leveling valves Change to 3740130 Kenworth
AGH460 for §3783 2

TANDEM AIRGLIDE 46K FOR NOT LISTED SUSPENSIONS CALL
i DEALER3

Kenworth of South Florida
Southern
$102,200.00
NA $0.00°
$10,014.00°  $9,995.00°

$11,201.00°

$13,130.00°

$2,695.00%

$4,816.00%

$4.989.00°

$10,588.00°

$12,939.00°

$986.00°

$2,430.00°

$2,577.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

EC-GT15DP !
12CYDump >
GPDI14 "

EC-GT16DP !
18CYDump 2
GPD16°>

EC-OXFA00082254 |
GALBREATH 2
U5-OR-174°

3532130 !
3511420 2
3511420 °

EC-OXFA00081872 !
HookLift 2
US-EX-174 3

EC-OXFA00082243 !

AMER ROLL 2
FA96637 >

EC-OXFA00082255 !
AMREP ROLL 2
FA96643 3

Western
$102,997.00

T880
Kenworth of Jacksonville

Kenworth of Central
Florida

Central
$104.900.00

Kenworth of Jacksonville

Northern
$102,725.00

12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. $19,400.00l

State model bid.
15" 12 yd dump body electric tarp. Godwin 400 1

OX 12vd Dump bodv w/ Tarp & hotshift PTO 2

GAR-P 14' STEEL DUMP BODY. 12/14 YARDS. 1/4" FLOOR. 3'16"
SIDES, AIR TAILGATE, ELECTRIC TARP SYSTEM W/8" H.D
SPREADER 3

18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. $19,400.001

State model bid.
16" 18 yd dump body electric tarp. 1

OX 18vd Dump body w/ Tarp & hotshift PTO Add Option: Hi-Lift Gate
$1,738.002

GAR-P 16’ STEEL DUMP BODY, 18 YARDS. 3/16" FLOOR & GATE,
AIR TAILGATE, ELECTRIC TARP SYSTEM W/8" H.D. SPREADER. 3
Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid. 3539,900.001
Galbreath U5-OR-174 cable hoist w/tarp (including hot shift PTO for

auto transmission, 48" toolbox, steel fenders, Pioneer RP4500ARG tarp

system) 180-188" CT required 1

Roll Off: Galbreath AF-0R-174 60k w/Pioneer tarp Change to
US-0R-174 60k w/Pioneer $51,100 2

GALBREATH CABLE HOIST WITH PIONEER RP4500ARG TARP
SYSTEM, 48" TOOLBOX, STEEL FENDERS, W/HOT SHIFT P.T.0.;
REQUIRES CT OF 180"-188" 3

Cab suspension - air ride Std
S3TANDARD ON T880: EXTRA CHARGE ON T800 MODEL - 8550.00

Driver controlled differential lock $1,820.00]

Forward and rear drive differential locks 1
Driver Controlled Wheel Locks: (2) axles 2

WHEEL DIFFERENTIAL LOCKS, BOTH AXLES 3
Optional mounted body - specify $9,938.001
24’ Stake body (includes 40" high steel racks on both sides) 1

Palfinger T-50 Hook Lift System (Includes Tarp) 2

GALBREATH CABLEHOIST WITH PIONEER RP4500ARG TARP
SYSTEM, 48" TOOLBOX, STEEL FENDERS, W/HOT SHIFT P.T.O.;
REQUIRES CT OF 180"-188". 3

Optional mounted body - specify $19,447.70"!
24" trash dump for 216-222" CA (including 48" sides. double barn door

tailgate, 24" cab protector, Hot shift PTO for automatic transmission,

ground level control tarp system)

Roll Off: American ART-60-22k AF w/tarp system 2

TBEI ALUMINUM WAVE 16' LONG DUMP BODY, 20 YARDS
CAPACITY, AIR TAILGATE, ELECTRIC TARP SYSTEM, W/HOT
SHIFTP.T.0. 3

Optional mounted body - specify $41,200.001
Galberath US-EX-174 extendable tail hoist w/tarp (including hot shift

PTO for auto transmission, 48" toolbox, steel fenders, Pioneer tarp

system) 174"182" CT. |

Amrep AMRO-H-22 w/Pioneer tarp 2

|\ TBEI ALUMINUM VERTEX 16' LONG DUMP BODY. 20 YARDS
CAPACITY, AIR TAILGATE, ELECTRIC TARP SYSTEM, W/HOT
SHIFTP.T.O. 3

Kenworth of South Florida

Southern
$102,200.00

$17,794.00°

$18,663.00°

$54,033.00°

Std

$1,950.00°

$65,702.00°

$64,277.00°

$46,070.00°

$18,312.00°'

$18,312.00°

$48.912.00°

$0.00°

$1,880.00°

$50,472.00°

$36,651.00°

$35,688.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

EC-OXFA00082256 |

Atlas Grapple 2
GPF20°

EC-RING-A-LINE !
Palfinger Grapple 2

GPF24 >

EC-RING-ROLLOFF !

Pal GR-RO 2
GPTD20 >

Palﬁnger Crane 2
K500

HEIL REL 2
K700 >

EZ REL 2
AMTHOR4 >

MCN REL 2
VT40008 3

EC-GTDB15 !
NEWAY REL 2
HLIFT 3

EC-GTDBI16 |
LOAD REL 2
EV?

T880

Kenworth of Jacksonville  Kenworth of Jacksonville  Kenworth of Central
Florida

Western Northern Central

$102,997.00 $102,725.00

Optional mounted body - specify

14’ Chipper Body (60" with 12" removable top, Open (@ center tailgate,

auto trans)
Grapple: Petersen AL-1 Atlas w/ 40yd dump: 2

GAR-P H.D. 20' FLATBED BODY, W/ALL STEEL REMOVABLE
STAKE SIDES. 3

Optional mounted body - specify
Palfinger A-line loader M13A Right side operators station w/ 2
Joysticks, oil cooler, 22'x84"x84"” MPHD beau roc body. 1

Grapple Palfinger A Line M134 w/44yd body 2

GAR-P H.D. 24' FLATBED BODY, W/ALL STEEL REMOVABLE
STAKE SIDES. 3

Optional mounted body - specify

ARO ART60-22 Cable Roll Off 176" CA (186" CA for tarp) 22 ft. hoist,

outside rail capability, dual automatic front and leff container stops
and locks, Manual nylon strap winch rear container hol downs, body
props, Inside Air controls, LED light kit, 18"x18"x36" tool box I

Palfinger Grapple Q150784 And ART60-22 Rolloff Combination 2

GAR-P H.D. 20’ STEEL TRASH DUMP, 32 YARDS. ALL 3/16"
STEEL, ELECTRIC TARP SYSTEM, TWIN BARN DOORS & HOT
SHIFTP.T.0. 3

Optional mounted body - specify
S260L 130 Canal Maintenance Crane Package 2

KLEIN 5200 GALLONS CAPACITY STEEL WATER TANK W/HOT
SHIFT P.T.0. REQUIRES 720004 GI'WR3

Optional mounted body - specify
Heil. DP5000 25vd REL Add: Bayne Tipper $5280 2

KLEIN 6500 GALLONS CAPACITY STEEL WATER TANK W/HOT
SHIFT P.T.0. REQUIRES 90000# GVWR3

Optional mounted body - specify
E-Z Pack Goliath G400 25yd REL Change to G300 25yd REL
377,990 2

EAM CARBON STEEL 4000 GALLONS CAPACITY WATER TANK,
INC. LUlgING PUMP & P.T.O., INSTALLED. REQUIRES 620004
GVWR

Optional mounted body - specify
McNeilus 2516 RL HD 25vd REL 2

EAM CARBON STEEL VACUUM TANK, 4000 GALLONS CAPACITY,

FULLY 3E QUIPPED W/P.T.O., INSTALLED, REQUIRES 62000#%
GVWR

Optional equipment - specify
1512 yd dump body electric tarp. Godwin 400 1

Neway King Cobra 25vd REL 2
GAR-P HI-LIFT REAR DUMP TRUCK LIFTGATE, STEEL 3

Optional equipment - specify
16" 18 yd dump body electric tarp. |

Loadmaster Excel S 25vd REL 2
GAR-P DUMP BODY ELECTRICAL VIBRATOR, INSTALLED 3

$104.900.00

$17,700.00"

NA $177,673.00° $44,966.00°

NA

NA

NA

$19,400.00"

$19,400.00'

Kenworth of South Florida

Southern
$102,200.00

$99.314.00° $118,602.00°

$113,659.00' $116,023.00°  $13,840.00°

$62,799.00' $168,953.00>  $22,482.00°

3

$74,798.00°  $83,034.00°
$85,042.002’ $52,400.00°
$80,956.00°  $56,741.00°

$70,099.00°  $1,920.00°

$62,843.00°  $1,020.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

EC-GTLBT '
TCM600 2
20T 3

EC-GTGTWEF !
VAC TNK 2
25T 3

EC-GTDT !
Watertnk 2
1093108 3

AAWH !
Alum20Dump )
1600116 °

poJp !
LUBESVCBODY 2
ADDITIONAL >

8879917 !
AUTLUBE 2
TWO-TONE 3

3392604 |
5042315/524215 %
THREE-TONE *

ssv !
5242367/4238678 2
UNDERCOATING 3

DOFF !
5242367/4238810 2
8412500 °

Western
$102,997.00

T880
Kenworth of Jacksonville

Kenworth of Central
Florida

Central
$104,900.00

Kenworth of Jacksonville

Northem
$102,725.00

Optional equipment - specify $5,650.001

Wetline low boy trailer
Pro Patch TCM 600-120-DHE 6vd Asphalt Patch body 2

GAR-P 20 TON PINTLE HITCH, D-RINGS & 7-WAY ELECTRICAL
PLUG, INSTALLED 3

Optional equipment - specify $7,350,001
Wetline walking floor 1

4000 gal steel septic tank w/hoist/hydraulic gate Change to Aluminum

$108.986 2

GAR-P 25 TON PINTLE HITCH, D-RINGS & 7-WAY ELECTRICAL

PLUG, INSTALLED. 3

'Optional equipment - specify $5,950.001
Wetline dump trailer 1

Water Tank 4,000 Gallon With Spray Heads Change to: 3,000 Gallon

Stainless §77,578 2

INSIDE/QUTSIDE AIR INTAKE FOR POWERCORE ENGINE 3 |

Optional equipmel}t - specify $2,370.00"

All Aluminum wheels
16" 20CY Aluminum Dump Body 2
CUMMINS AIR INTAKE THROTTLE OVERSPEED SHUTDOWN 3

Optional equipment - specif?' $825.00"
Jack plate for detachable lowboy

| Lube Specialists: 18" 1550 gal Fuel/Lube Body 2

; PLEASE CONTACT DEALER FOR ANY ADDITIONAL OPTIONS

i NOT LISTED.3

Optional equipment - specify $425.00"

Two additional outboard windows 19inx 12in 1
AutoLube System - Lube Core 2
TWO TONE FACTORY PAINT. PLEASE CONTACT DEALER 3

Optional equipment - specify $2,750.00"

Splined rotor for dual rear disc brake for use with aluminum hubs 1
11R-24.5 Tires / Wheels - steel {10} 2
THREE TONE FACTORY PAINT, PLEASE CONTACT DEALER 3

Optional equipment - specify $625.00"
Stainless Steel Visor !
Rr Tires: 315R /22,5 Tires & wheels Oty 8 2
COMPLETE POWERTRAIN UNDERCOATING, INVOLVES
REMOVAL AND REINSTALLATION OF ALL COMPONENTS.
PLEASE CONTACT DEALER 3

{ Optional equipment - specify $2,200.00"
Full fenders Tandem 1

) Rr Tires: 12R-22.5 Oty 8 2

ISRINGHAUSEN AIR DRIVER'S SEAT, HB VINYL (ECE
APPROVED) 3

Kenworth of South Florida

Southern
$102,200.00

$86,529.00°

$96,393.00°

$42,315.00°

$31,215.007

$121,887.00%

$8,236.00%

$1,717.00°

$4,452.00°

$3,950.00%

$1,158.00°

$1,278.00°

$406.00°

$3,969.00°

$0.00°

$0.00°

$0.00°

$0.00°

$712.00°



VEHICLE:
DEALER:

ZONE:
BASE PRICE:

DISUNL !
5045265/5245265 >
8462500 °

UNPUBBOD '
BUC 2
8841628 >

20KFDA !
8480066
2607011 °

MCTS !
Pintle 2
3392604 °

T466GVW |
LEDSTROBE >
8890105 °

T366GVW !
FuelTrk 2
5045152/5245152 3

2020MY 2
8480065 °

Discountl15 2
634009 >

UNPUBOS 2
8700096 >

T830
Kenworth of Jacksonville  Kenworth of Jacksonville  Kenworth of Central
Florida
Western Northern Central
$102,997.00 $102,725.00 $104.900.00
Optional equipment - specify Incl.!

15% Discount off current MSRP for any non-specified options on the
current model listed. This discount does not apply to any other make or
model.

Front / Rear Aluminum Wheels Qtv 10 2

IRRINGHAUSEN AIR PASSENGER'S SEAT, HB VINYL (ECE
APPROVED) 3

Optional equipment - specify Incl.!
Unpublished bodies are available at cost plus 5% including fees 1
Back Up Camera System - Dealer Installed 2

QUAD RECTANGULAR AIR HORNS. 23/26 INCHES, MOUNTED ON
TOP OF CAB. 3

Optional equipment - specify $66, 124.00"
20,000l Marmon Front Drive Axle. Includes transfer case and

subframe. Includes 46,000 Ib. rear axle and suspension upgrade. Front

drive axle configuration will vary by application. Contact dealer to

order.

2 passenger vinvl bench seat 2
FRONT DISC BRAKES 3

Optional equipment - specify ($1,824.00)1

T800 Model Cab 1
25 Ton Pintle Hitch with Air & Electric 2

SPLINED ROTORS FOR DUAL REAR AIR DISC BRAKES FOR USE
WITH ALUMINUM HUBS. 3

Optional equipment - speci $ 14,1()2.001
T440 Model, 66,000 GI'W Package: Includes PX-9 350HP, Allison

3000RDS. Chalmers 46.0001b Suspension 1

2 Roof Mtd. Amber - 4 Corner Amber/White - 2 Side of Body - LED
Strobe Light pkg - 2

Stainless Steel Visor 3

Optional equipment - specify $4,452.00l

T370 Model, 66,000 1b GVW Package: Includes PX-9 330HP, Allison
3000RDS, Chalmers 46,0001b Suspension 1

3500 Gallon Fuel Delivery Truck Body - See Dealer 2
FRONT & REAR ALUMINM WHEELS (10) FOR 11R22.5 TIRES 3

Optional equipment - specify NA

2020 Model Year Upcharge - See dealer for Model Year and production
Schedule prior to ordering

TWO PASSENGER VINYL BENCH SEAT 3

| Optional equipment - specify NA

15% Discount off current MSRP for non-specified options and any
optional models bid. This discount ONLY applies to a downgrade or an
upgrade to the model listed in this specification. It does not apply to a |
completely different make or model Includes Fees 2

REAR ENGINE POWER TAKE-OFF (REPTO), MX 11 ONLY 3

Optional equipment - specify NA

Unpublished Bodies Available at Cost + 5% including fees 2

KENWORTH NAVPLUS H.D. NAVIGATION SYSTEM FOR REAR
CAMERA INSTALLATION. 3

Temporary tag Incl.

Kenworth of South Florida

Southern
$102,200.00
$2,735.00° $903.00°
$1,385.00° $288.00°
$403.00> $345.00°
$2,125.00°  $2,780.00°
$3,126.00° $669.00°
$96,060.00°  $1,864.00°
$6,500.00% $309.00°

Incl?  $2,440.00°]

Incl?  $1,797.00°

Incl. l NC



VEHICLE: T880

DEALER: Kenworth of Jacksonville  Kenworth of Jacksonville ~ Kenworth of Central Kenworth of South Florida
Florida

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern

BASE PRICE: $102,997.00 $102,725.00 $104.900.00 $102,200.00

DOTT ! Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) $79.75" Incl. $200.00

iNew state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) NA Incl. $525.00

9209689/9209116 2 Maintenance Plan - specify NA  $2,81 1.00° NA
Ext Warranty: L9 PP1 5yr/100k With aftertreatment 2

9206535 2 Maintenance Plan - specify NA  $2,519.00 NA
Ext Warranty: LIN PPI 5pr/150k 2 |

9206558 Maintenance Plan - specify NA  $2,1 16.00° NA
Ext Warranty: ISX12N 5yr/150k PP1 2

9202622 ! Warranty - specify

9209409/9209533 2 EW US Basic Vehicle 2 yr/200,000 miles. United States only 1

9202622 3 ISX PP1 Efficiency 5yr/300k mile 2

EXTENDED BASIC VEHICLE WARRANTY - 2 YEARS 200,000 MILES  §950. 00"

$3,380.00° $950.00° 9202633 ¢
9209415/9209533°

9202633 ° Warranty - specify
EW US busic vehicle 3 vr: 300,000 miles, United States only !

L ISX PP1 Performance Syr 300k mite 483--605hp Add PP2 Towing Coverage SYr 300K 3
{ 2876.00

{ EXTENDED BASIC VEHICLE WARRANTY - 3 YEARS 300,000 MILES 3 32, 725.001

! $4,690.00° $2,725.00° 9202133
} 9207106/9207181°

19202634 ° Warranty - specify
i EW US heater & Air Conditioner 3 yr 300,000 miles, United States only 1

Yice ‘omprehensive Plan A Svr 100K mile below 360hp Includes afiertreatment Warranty 2
t EXTENDED BASIC VEHICLE WARRANTY - 3 YEARS 400,000 MILES. . For additional
1 Available Extended Components warranty contact Dealer 3 $500. 001 $2.667. 00
$3,425.00° PP1AT-5/300 '
9202808

3N, .
9207101 ° Diesel Warranty - specify
PACCAR Protection Plan 1 with Afier Treatstent- 5 yr 300,000 miles 1

Kemworth Base V'ehicle SYr 100K ADD: 9202810 Kemvorth Base Vehicle 5¥r 300K 83980 2
PACCAR MX 11 PLAN A 460HP OR LESS 3Y'300K AFTERTREATMENT 3Y 300K FOR
ADDITIONAL PACCAR ENGINE E.-W.CONTACT DEALER 3 $2.560. ()(]1 $]: 788, 002
$1,805.00° PP1AT-5/400

9202878

9209400/9209080 % Diesel Warranty - specify
PACCAR Protection Plan 1 with After Treatment- 5 yr /400,000 miles 1

Kenworth Towing for Warrantable Failures 5YR Unlimited Miles 2

CUMMINS EW:PP1 2017 XI5 EFFICIENCY 3¥:300K AFTERTREATMENT 3Y:300 3
$3,485.00' $1,451.00° $1,610.00° PPIAT-5/500"
ALLISONSYR®

9209409/9209533 % Diesel Warranty - specifv
PACCAR Protection Plun 1 with Afier Treatment- 5 vr 500.000 miles 1

Allison Syr. undimited-Refuse {Utility  P&D $786.00} 2
CUMMINS EW:PPI 2017 X15 EFFICIENCY SY/300K AFTERTREATMENT 5Y/300K FOR
ADDITIONALS CUMMINS ENGINE E.W.CONTACT DEALE 3 g4 685 00" $1.009.00°

$3,555.00°
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52,000 LB GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4X6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK
SPECIFICATION #15

2019 Kenworth T880

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Kenworth T880 purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this
model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as
awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -~ -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.



VEHICLE:

DEALER:
ZONE:

T880 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

Western

BASE PRICE: -- No bid --

Order Code

Order Code

Delete Options

Engine/transmission - specify
EEngine/transmission - specify
Engine/transmission - specify

ﬁEngine/transmission - specify

Delete Option - Specify
ﬁ,Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify
Delete Option - Specify

Add Options

|Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify
Engine upgrade - specify

Transmission upgrade - specify
Transmission upgrade - specify
Transmission upgrade - specify
Transmission upgrade - specify

Transmission upgrade - specify

58,000 Ib. GVWR package
64,000 Ib. GVWR package

l GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify

} GVWR upgrade - specify
GVWR upgrade - specify

I GVWR upgrade - specify
Bi-fuel model - specify

| CNG prep - specify

Northern
-- No bid --

CNG conversion (discuss with dealer)

LPG conversion (discuss with dealer)

Dual fuel tanks, or equivalent

Nitrogen filled tires including spare tire

Central Southern
-- No bid -- -- No bid --

All Zones

All Zones

Allison 4000RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent



VEHICLE: T880 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -~ No bid - - No bid -- - No bid -- - No bid -

EAllison 4500RDS Auto Transmission to include synthetic oil, TES 295 or approved equivalent
Double Frame: full steel insert

| Front Axle: 14,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 14,600 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 16,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 18,000 Ib rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Front Axle: 20,000 Ib. rating to include equal capacity steering gear and springs

Rear Axle: 46,000 Ib Arvin Meritor, Eaton, Mack, or equivalent

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 13,200 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels

Rigid Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 1b rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel wheels

Steerable Lift Axle: Pusher / Tag 20,000 Ib rating air lift to include 11R-22.5 tires with steel
wheels

I Rear Suspension: 40,000 Ib air ride

Rear Suspension: 46,000 b Chalmers, Hendrickson, Mack, Volvo "T" ride or equivalent
'Rear Suspension: 46,000 1b air ride

12 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.
18 yd. dump body with hoist and electric tarp system. State model bid.
Rolloff hoist system and tarp system. State model bid.

Cab suspension - air ride

Driver controlled differential lock

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify
| Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional mounted body - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify

Optional equipment - specify



VEHICLE: T880 (ALTERNATE DEALERS)
DEALER:

ZONE: Western Northern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Optional equipment - specify
t Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
i Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
E Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
I Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
I Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
I Optional equipment - specify
Optional equipment - specify
| Temporary tag

Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)

iNew state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)

Maintenance Plan - specify

| Maintenance Plan - specify
Maintenance Plan - specify
Warranty - specify
Warranty - specify

| Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify

| Diesel Warranty - specify
Diesel Warranty - specify

Central
-- No bid --

Southern
-- No bid --



